SERA INVESTMENTS & FINANCE INDIA LIMITED

Date: September 06, 2024

To,

BSE LIMITED
P.]. Towers,
Dalal Street,
Mumbai-400001

Sub.: Extract of Newspaper Publication-Compliance under Regulation 47 of the
SEBI (Listing Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015
BSE Scrip Code: 512399

Dear Sir/Madam,

In compliance with Regulation 47 and other applicable provisions of the SEBI (Listing
Obligations & Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015, please find enclosed Extract of
Newspaper publication published on Friday, September 06, 2024 in the Newspapers viz.-
Financial Express (English and Gujarati Edition) inter-alia, informing about the following as
required under the provisions of Companies Act, 2013 and relevant circulars issued by
Ministry of Corporate Affairs:

1. 39t Annual General Meeting ("AGM”) of the Company to be held on Monday, September
30, 2024 through Video Conferencing/Other Audio-Visual Means at 02.30 p.m. (IST);

2. Completion of dispatch of the Notice of 39" AGM and the Integrated Annual Report for
F.Y. 2023-24 through Email on September 05, 2024, and

3. Details of details of closure of Share Transfer Book and Register of Members and
Remote e-voting and e-voting facility at the 39" AGM provided to the Members;

We request you to take this on record and treat the same as compliance with the applicable
provisions of the Listing Regulations.

Thanking you,

Yours faithfully,
For, SERA INVESTMENTS & FINANCE INDIA LIMITED

'

SAGAR SAMIR SHAH
WHOLE-TIME DIRECTOR
DIN: 03082957

Registered Office: 306, 3" Floor, Ashirwad Paras-1, Near Kanti Bharwad PMT, Opposite Andaz Party Plot, Makarba, Ahmedabad-380051
Phone No.:+919998860215 | CIN:L51900GJ1985PLC110976
Email ID: kapashicommercial1985@gmail.com| Website: www.serafinances.com



Ilr. Loan | Name of Borrower(s) / Amount as per Resorve Eamest | Possession
No| Ale. No | Co-borrower{s) Lagal Helr(s) / Demand Notice Price Money | Types
and | Legal Representative/
Branch | Guarantoris)

26| 10637957 | MR MAHESHPAR Rs, 8,65 856~ (Rupees Nine Lakh | Rs. 5,00,000~ | Rs. 50,000/ Physical
CHHAGANPAR] GOSAI Sodty Five Thousand Nine Hundred | (Rupees Five | (Rupeas Fifty
MRS, MINABEN Fifty Six Only) Lakh Only) | Thousand
MAHESHPARI GOSAI ey Oniy)

B5-07-2023

WWW.FINANCIALEXPRESS.COM

FINANCIAL EXPRESS

Description of the immovable Property: All that rights, Piece and Parcel of Immovable Property bearing Flal no. 402 on Forth Floor
having bullt up ares approx. 30.62 Sg, Mtrs, is a bulider flat along with undivided and proporionate share in the undermeath land of the
promisas‘muliplax bullding known as “Vasundhara Avenus’ situsled on plol no. 42 1o 52 meant for reeidential purpose sdmaeasuring
mpprox, 1118.07 Bq. Mirs, Tha Plot nos. 42 to 52 (11 plols} wane merged a8 a single unit among mary plots on land knowr as ‘Balef Grean
City” sttuated cn ron agricubural land having parmission to bulld busldings for residential purposs bearng Revenue Survey ro 140 Palkl 2
of moupe: Viavdi, Taluka: Ragkot City, Registration District and Sub District: Rajkot, Guarsl. Bounded :- East - By Common Passage and
Flalno. 401, Wead - By Flalno. 405, North - By Flatno, 403, South : By Open io Sky Space and Margin Space

MUTHOOT HOUSING FINANCE COMPANY LIMITED

Registered Office: TC NO.14/2074-7, Muthoot Centre, Punnen Road, Thiruvananthapuram - 695 034,
muth‘n“t CIN NO - U65922KL2010PLC025624, Corporate Office: 12/A 01, 13th floor, Parinee Crescenzo, Plot No.
HOUSING FINANCE C38 & C39, Bandra Kurla Complex-G block (East), Mumbai-400051 TEL. NO: 022-62728517

Email Id: authorised.officer@muthoot.com

Il

APPENDIX -IV[Rule 8(1)] Possession Notice (For Inmovable Property)

77.| 10058870 | MR. DAYABHAI SHAM JIBHAI HIRANI (Bormower) Ra, 1008737 | Rs. 6,890,000/ | Re. 89,000 | Physical
Mre. MUKTABEN DAYABMA| HIRANI {Rupeas Ninotoon Lakh| (Rupess Sx | (Rupoes
(Co-barrower), Eight Thousand Seven | Lakh Ninaty | Shdy Nire
Mra. BHAWNA TILSIBHAI HIRANI (Co-bommower), | Hundred Thirty Seven |  Thousand Thousand
Mr. TULSIBHA! SHAMJIEHAL HIRAN| Cinly) Oriy) Onily)
[Combormowar), P
26:04-2021

Whereas The undersigned being the Authorized Officer of the Muthoot Housing Finance Company Ltd., under the Securitisation And Reconstruction of

Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security InterestAct, 2002 (ACTNO.54 OF 2002) and in exercise of powers conferred under section 13(12) read

with Rule 3 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002 issued a demand notice to below mentioned Borrower/s / Guarantor/s. After completion

of 60 days from date of receipt of the said notice, The Borrower/s / Guarantor/s having failed to repay the amount, notice is hereby given to the

Borrower/s / Guarantor/s and the public in general that the undersigned has taken Symbolic Possession of the property described herein below in
| exercise of powers conferred on them under section 13(4) of the said Act read with Rule 8 of the said Rules onthis.

Description of the Immovable Property: Scheduls - A

All tha rights, plece & parcal of Immovabla propordy baaring SHOPno 3,4 & 5, on Ground Fleor Shop no 3 campat area asdmsasuring 10.12
5q. Mirs., Shop no 4 carpet area admeasuring 10.00 Sq. Mira., Bhop no 5 carpet srea admeasuring 08,003 Sq. Mirs,, Total Carpel area
29.25 Sq. Min., undivided share proportionate shane in the undermaath land of the building and ol intemal and external Aghts thenedo of
the pramiges known as "AKAR COMPLEX, corstricted on non-agriculture land for Commercial & residential use bearing Revenus
Survey No. 488, Plal No, 105, admeasuring 1036-3-0 Sq. Mirs., Ward 182, C.5 no 232/84 Situate afTaluka: City, Sub Destrict: Rajkot,
Diigirict: Rajkol of Gujaral.

Shap no 3 Carpet ares 10-22 sg. mi. bounded an follows:-

Morth by : Parking, South by : 25 Fool Road, Eastby : ShopMNo. 2, West by - Shop Mo, 4

Shap no 4 Carpot area 10-00 sg. mi bounded as follows: -

Morth by : Bhap No. 5, South by : 26 Foot Road, Eastby | Shap No. 3, West by : 40 Foat Road

Shop no 5 Carpel area §-00 sg. mi. bounded as follows:-

North by : Shop No, 6, South by | Shop No. 4, East by : Shop No, 3 and Parking, West by : 40 Fool Road

Sr. LAN / Name of Borrower / Date of Total O/s Amount (Rs.) Date of
| No. Co-Borrower/ Guarantor Demand notice | Future Interest Applicable Possession
1| LAN No. 11165085655 30-January-2023 | Rs.19,87,412.00/- as on 03-September-2024
1. Sanjaysinh Ishwarsinh Desai, 2. Sangita Sanjaysinh Desal 23-January-2023

Description of Secured Asset(s) Immovable Property (ies): ALL THE PIECE & PARCEL OF IMMOVABLE PROPERTY BEARING PLOT
NOS.7 &8 PLOTTED LANDADMEASURING 128.10 SQ.MTR.+ UNDIVIDED PORTION OF COMMON PLOT AND ROAD ADMEASURING
119.74 SQ.MTR.+ UNDIVIDED PORTION OF MARGIN LAND ADMEASURING 34.2 SQ. MTR.= TOTAL ADMEASUREMENT 282.04
SQ.MTR.I.E.3034.75 SQ.FT.ALONGWITH THE SURROUNDING RIGHTS OVER THE ORIGINAL LAND SITUATED AT
"MOTINAGAR",NEAR DEVINA PARK, NAVSARI,TAL.& DIST.NAVSARI BEARING REVENUE SURVEY NO.170, 170/1 PAIKEE,CITY
SURVEY TIKANQ.124 CITY SURVEY NOS,4686 & 4687 , NAVSARI-396445. BOUNDED BY: EAST: SOCIETY ROAD, WEST: REMAINING
PORTION OF THESAID SURVEYNUMBER, NORTH: AFTER LEAVING MARGIN LAND PLOTNO.6, SOUTH: PLOTNO.9

28.| TEHHLAZ | VAJASHIBHAI Ra. 503660 (Rupeas Five Lakh Three Thousand Six As, Ra. Pysical

SB000100 | GOVABHAI | Hundred Eighty Nine Only) Is dus and payabils by you under | 505,000 | 59,5000
086562 & | GONYA lo@n @ccount No. 10661196 and an amount of Re, 4116318 | (Rupses | (Rupees
10661186 | FURIBEN (Rupeea Four Lakh Stdeen Thousand Threa Hundred Five Lakh | Filty Nino
VAJASHIBHAI | Shceen Ornly) s dus and payable by you under loan sccourd | Ninsly Five |  Thousand

GONYA No. TCHHLOZSS000100086582 |, totalng to Re. B20005- | Thousand Five
(Rupoes Nine Lakh Twenty Thousand Five Only) Oriy) Hg.r:u

(—— ¥

16-06-202 3

2 | LAN No. 11165098862, 1. Rehana Mohsinkhan Khalifa 30-May-2023 Rs.7,09,205.00/-as on 03-September-2024
2. Sarfaraj Abdulajiz Shaikh (Guarantor) 20-May-2023
3. Javid Mahamad Khalifa (Guarantor)

Description of Secured Asset(s) Immovable Property (ies): ALL THAT PART AND PARCEL OF THE PROPERTY BEARING FLAT NO .303,
BUILT UP AREAADMEASURING 57 SQ. MTR. ALONGWITH THE UNDIVIDED SHARE OVER THE ORIGINAL LAND SITUATED AT 3RD
FLOOR OF "KASHMIRARESIDENCY TOWER - 1", ASPAR MOHOLLO, TAL.DIST.NAVSARIBEARING CITY SURVEY TIKANO .14/3, CITY
SURVEY NOS. 112-A & 112-B. BOUNDED BY: ON THE NORTH BY: STAIR CASE, ON THE SOUTHBY: FLAT NO.302, ON THE EAST BY:
ENTRY AND PASSAGE, ON THE WEST BY: MARGIN PLOTAND O.T.S

The Borrower/s / Guarantor/s in particular and the public in general is hereby cautioned not to deal with the property and any dealings with the property wil
be subjecttothe charge ofthe Muthoot Housing Finance Company Limited, foran above mentioned demanded amountand further interest thereon.

| Place: Gujarat, Date: 06 September, 2024 Sd/- Authorised Officer, For Muthoot Housing Finance Company Limited

Description of the Immovable Property: All the rights, plece & parcel of immovable Open Piol Na. &, Sub-Plol Mo, 518 on NA. Land,
admensuring 48.00 Sq. Mis. L.e., approx., 51888 Sq. Fi, sltuated ol Revenus Survey no. 50 Palkl 1, admeasuring 27800 Sq. Mirs. This
Revenue survey no. 58 has bean converiad Inla Non Agricultural land for residential purposa complying o the orders of Collector,
Jumnagar vide Ordar no. JMN2B.2/RE G AN 314 dated 30%1/2014 afier Chief Executive officer, Jamnagar Area Development Authority
vide onder no. JaWVETEK/142/06/13/7654 dated 22/11/2013 had approved the layoul plan, folfwing thess orders total 1 10 183 differsrt
plots wers plotted; out of thess plots, open land, open plots of plot no. 5 t0 18 were amaigamated to Single Plot numbered 5' vide
Jamnagar Area Developmant Authority Order no. JaVVETEKN 5.8 P28S P-47/1988 dated 1/10d2015. Further complying o (he same
order fhis new Plol no, 5 vwas again Sub Plotied into & lotal of 30 Sub plots and have bean numbersd as 51 io 5030 admeasuring 884 5g.
Mirs. and Encroachment ares admesasuring 41,70 Sg. Mirs. adding 1o o folal of 1440 Sq. Mim.  SEuabed &t Mojec Diared, TA: Jarmnagar,

Public Notice For E-Auction Cum Sale (Appendix - IV A) (Rule 8(6))

Sale of Inmovable property mortgaged to IIFL Home Finance Limited (Formerly known as India Infoline Housing Finance Ltd.) (IIFL-HFL) Corporate Office at
Plot No.98,Udyog Vihar, Phase-1V,Gurgaon-122015.(Haryana) and Branch Office at:- "Office No.701, Tth Floor, 21st Centuary Business Center, Near
Udhna Darwaja, Ring Road, Surat - 395002" / Ahmedabad Commerce House, 4th Floor, Commerce House 4, Nr Shell Petrol Pump, Anandnagar
Road, Prahladnagar, Ahmedabad - 380051/ "Office No.301, 3rd Floor, The Imperia, Opp. Shashtri Maidan, Above Federal Bank, Nr.Axis Bank, Rajkot,
Gujarat-360001 under the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (hereinafter "Act"). Whereas
the Auhorized Officer ("AQ") of IFL-HFL had taken the possession of the following property/ies pursuant fo the notice issued U/S 13(2) of the Act in the fol-
lowing loan accounts/prospect nos. with a right to sell the same on "AS IS WHERE IS BASIS, AS IS WHAT IS BASIS AND WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS"

FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 6, 2024

R REGIONAL OFFICE, Gandhinagar,
RAL BANK OF I LAL DARWAJA, AHMEDABAD-380 001

APPENDIX-IV [Rule- 8(1)]
FOSSESSION NOTICE (For iImmovable Property)

Whareas: The undersigned being the Authorsed Officer of the Cendral Bank of India,
Kalol Branch, Dist. Gandhinagar urder Securitisation And Recanstruction of Financal
Aszals and Enforcement of Sacurity Interest Bct, 2002 and in exercse of powors
conferred under Section 13 {12) read with Rule 3 of the Secunty Inferest (Enforcement)
Fules 2002, issued 5 Demand Molice dated TB/06I2024 caling upon the borrower, 1.
Yashwant Kantibhai Makwana (Borrower) Residential Plot Bo-1256/2, Seclor-
28, Gandhinagar, Gujaral-362421. 2. Kantibhai Bijaibhai Makwana (Co-
borrower & Mortgagor) Residanbial Plob Ma-125612 Seclor-28, Gandhinagar,
Guparat-3624241, 3. Babuben Kantibhal Makwana {Co-borrower & Morlgagor)
Residential Plot Mo-1256/2, Secior-28, Gandhinagar, Gujarai-332421. o repay the
arnourd mentioned in the nofice, beng Rs, 19,39, 754,54 [In Wards Rs. Nineteen Lakh
thirty nine Thousand seven Hundred fifty four and Paise Fifty four anly) with
interest as mantioned in notice, within 60 days from the date of receipt of the
sald Notica.

The borrower having failed to repsy the amount, notice i hereby gren to the borrower
and the publicin general thal the undersigned has taken Symbolic Possession of the
proparty bakng deccribad hesein below in exercise of powers confarred on Rim
ender Sub Section (2] of zection 13 of the Acl, read with Rule 8 of the Security
Interest Enforcement rules 2002 on this 03-08-2024,

The Boerowar in paricular and Ba publc n general is hereby cautioned not to deal wilth ha
property and any dealings with the property will e subjact to'the change of Central Bank of
India for an amourt of Rs.19,35.754.54 (In Words Rs. Nineteen Lakh thirty mine
Thousand seven Hundred fifty four and Paise Fifty four only) and imterest thereon
w.e.f. 18/06/2024 plus other chargas. (Amount deposited after issuing of Demand Notics
w5 13(2) has been gvaneflect)

The: bormower's attention i inviled o provisons of sub-sechion (6) of secion 13 of the
EARFAESI Acl inrespectof ime avaliable, o redesm the secured assels,

DESCRIPTION OF THE IMMOVABLE PROPERTY

&l The Piece and Parcel of Immovable Properly SHuated Al Pial/Bunglow Ma
125802 Sector-28. and Gandhinanar- Bounded By: East: 8 Mir, West: Plof Mo
125971 North: Plot Mo 12561, South: Plot No 12571
Date ; 03-08-2024

Place : Gan:lhirmgmr

Authonzed Officer,
Central Bank of India

Borrower(s) /
Co- Borrower(s)/
Guarantor(s)

for realization of IFL-HFL's dues, The Sale will be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website: www.iiflonehome.com

1. Mr. Kundan Kumar
2.Mr. Ritik Kumar
3. Mrs. Nigu Devi

Demand Notice Description of the Immovable Date of Physical Reserve Price
Date and Amount property/ Secured Asset Possession Rs.14,00,000/-
07-Nov-2023 & Rs.21,70,593/- [ All that part and parcel of the property Plot 23-Mar-2024 (Rupees Fourteen Lakh
(Rupees Twenty One Lakh |No.D-106, Block/ Survey No.183, Old| Total Outstanding as on Only)
Seventy Thousand Five |Survey No.631, Aalishan City, Moje Jitali,|  Date 07-Aug-2024 Earnest Money Deposit
Hundred Ninety Three Only) | Ankleshwar, Gujarat ~ 393001 Area| Rs.25,77,835/- (Rupees (EMD)

diffareni plols ware plotiad on the land which ks know as *Shrl Har Park-3"; out of these plots, open land, open plots of plol no. 22 fo 24
WS fo Single Plot numbered ‘22" vide Jamnagar Area Development Authorty Order no, JaWWSITERN 5./A.P.168/5.P-
2531 06 dated 27/04/201 B. Further complying to the same order this new Plol no. 22 was again Sub Plotied into a tobal of 8 Sub plobs and
have bean numbenad as 221 o 228, Siualed at Moje: Dared, TA: Jarmnagar, Dést Jamnagar of Gujaral. Bounded ;- East - 7.50 M,
Foad, West:- Pletno. 33and 34, North - Sub Plef no. 227, South : SubPlatno, 245

(Prospect No.
IL10188285)

Six Only)

Bid Increase Amount
Rs.20,000/- (Rupees

Residency , Near Sunrise Homes and Aimes
School, Lambha Cenal Road, Ashlali- Narol
Highway, Vatva, 382440 -Ahmedabad.

; . : ; ; - : (Prospect No Bid Increase Amount  |Admeasuring (In Sq. Ft.):Land_Area,| Twenty Five Lakh Seventy| Rs. 1,40,000/- (Rupees
Dist: Jamnagar of Gujaral. Bounded - East - Spacs of RS no, 60, West - 7,50 Mirs Road. North ;- Sub Plot No. 515, South : Sub Plat IL10318869) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | Super_Built_Up_Area, Area_Admeasuring| Seven Thousand Eight |One Lakh Forty Thousand|
Me. &M 7 . Five Thousand Only) | Property Area: 932.00, 908.00, 936.00. Hundred Thirty Five Only) Only)
26.| 10404626 | MR. LAKHAN Re. B.44.904/- (Rupsas Nime Lakh Forty Ra. 730,000/ Re. 73,000~ | Physical 1. Mr. Ghanchi Badram 08-Nov-2023 Allthat part and parcel of the property bear 17-Jun-2024 Rs.20,00,

2. Mrs. Arvina Rs.28,01,879/- (Rupees |ing Flat No G/301, 3rd Floor , Block G , Total Uutstandingas Un| (Rupees Twenty Lakh
SURYAVANSHI Four Thousand Nine Hundred Four Only)l (Rupees Seven (Rupees Himmatlal Modi Twenty Eight La{kh poene Devsamruddhi_Residency , Survey No|  pate 07-Aug-2024 Only)
MRS, RADHA DEVI Lakh Thirty Seventy Three 3. Keeon Thousand Eight Hundred ”)3}9; Lﬁ ,S[;raﬂ '(I'j.(l;’hSé;heme SN?D 1&.3 , FRPaNdO Rs. 32,78,668/- Earnest Money Deposit
18-0B-2023 Thousand Onky) | Thousand Only) and Seventy Nine Only) N Samiu reen, 5 ¥ RINGR0AA, |- o\ nees Thirty Two Lakh (EMD)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount gggtgrgls \ftva‘ szedabad‘ ijarat‘ Ing{a: Seventy Eight Thousand | RS- 2,00,000/- (Rupees
Description of the immavable Property: All the rights, piece & parcel of Immavabls Opsen Plot No. 22, Sub-Plet No. 22/6 on N.A. Land, IL10Z87013) | R 25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Property Tupe: Buit Up. A&Qa‘s%arpgi Six Hundred Sixty Eight Two Lakh Only)
admaasuring 52.50 Sq. Mis. [.a., approx, 565.10 Sq. FL., sRuated at Rawvanue Survey no. 20 Paili 3, sdmeasuring 11331 Sq. Mirs. This Five Thousand Only) | Area Property Area: 999.00, 503.00 Only)
Revinus survy no. 20 has bean converied into Non Agricultural land far residantial purpose complying io the arders of Collecior, 1 Mr Shelendra | 31-Jul-2022 & Rs.A5 .24 506 | All hat part and parcel of the property bear-| — 23-Jun-2024 | Rs.40,00,000-
Jamnagar vide Ordar no, JMMEBNREG no, 10414011 dated 01035011 after Chisf Exscutive officer, Jamnagar Ama Developmant Singh Tomar (Rupees Fifteen Lakh Twenty |ing Block No -'B" Third Floor, Flat No 307, | Total Outstanding as (Rupees Ten
Autharity vide order no. JaVWSITEK/142/1 20107311 daled 27/01/2011 had approved the layoul plan, follwing these orders bolal 110 52 2. Mrs.Princy Singh | Four Thousand Five Hundred|S.R No- 643/1/1 (5362. Sq. Mtr) Vinayak| On Date 07-Aug-2024 Lakh Only)

Rs. 18,78,845/- (Rupees
Eighteen Lakh Seventy
Eight Thousand Eight

Earnest Money Deposit

Rs. 1,00,000/- (Rupees

il The Auction, the public generally is invited fo submit thair bid{s) personaly. The Bomower(s)Co-Borrower (8) ans hereby given last
chance io pay the iotal dues with further interest within 15 days from the dads of publication of this notica, tading which the Immovabie
Property will be sold as per schedula. The E aucion will be stopped If, amount dus as aforesaid, with inbarest and costs {Including the cost
of the sahs) are tanderad io the Authorised Officar or proof is given 1o his satisfaction that the amount of such secured debt, interest and
costs has bean paid befors he dete of the suction

No officer or other parson, having any duty fo parorm in connection with this sale shall, however, direclly or Indirecy bid for, soguire or
ettempt io eoquire any |nterestin the Immovabla Proparty soid.

The sale shall be subject 1o the conditions prescribed in the Securily Inferast (Enforcamant) Rules, 2002 and (o the following furihar
conmditions:

NOTE: Thia E-auction of tha propertias will take place through portal hitpcibanikaucions. inf on 26-09-2024 batwean 2.00 PM i 3.00 P
with limnited estarsionof 5 minutes sach.

Tormsa and Conditlon: 1. The particulars spacifiad in the Schedule harein bakow have bean stalad to fra best of tha informalion of e
undarsigned, but the undersgned shall not be answarable kor any ermor, misstalernent or amission in his proclamation. bn the event ol arry
dispute arising as ko the amount bid, or &8 o the bidder, the Immovable Property shall at once again be put up o suction subjact to e
discredion of the Authorised Oficer. 2. The Immovable Property shall not ba sold below the Reserve Price. 3. Bxd Increment Amcunt will
ba: Rz 10 000/ {Rupeas Tan Thousand Only). 4. All the Bids subsmithed for the purchasa of the proparty shall ba accompanded by Earmest
Monay as mentioned above by way of a Demand Draft favoring the “TATA CAPITAL HOUSING FINANCE LTD." Payable al Branch
address. The Demand Drafts will be raturned to the unsuccassful biddens afer auction, For paymant of EMD through NEFTRTGSIMPS,
kindly contact Authorised Officer, 5. The highest bidder shall be declzned as successful bidder provided alwarys that hevshe is legally
iqualified to bad and provided further that the bid amaunt is not less than the reserve prica. 1t shall be in the discretion of the Authorised
Oficar to decling acceptancs of the highest bid whan ths price ofiered appears 3o cleany inadaquate as io make i inadvisabie to do so. &,
For reasons recorded, it shal ibe in the discration of the Authorised Officer o adjourn/disconfinue the sale. 7. Inspection of the Immovable
Property can be done on 13-08-2024 between 11 AM to 5,00 PM with prior sppoiniment. B. The person deciared 8s a successhd bidder
shall, immexdiately after such declaraion, deposit twenty-five per cent of the amount of purchase moneyfbid which would include EMD
amount to the Authorised Crfficer within 24Hrs: and in dedault of swch deposit, the property shall Sorthwith be put 1o fresh aucion/Sale by
[priwakes ireaty. 8. In case the Inilal daposdl ks made as above, the balance amount of The purchass money payable shall ba pald by the
purchasar io the Authorised Officer on or before the 15th day from the date of confirmation of the sale of the property, axclusive of such
day, orif the 15th day be & Sunday or other holiday, then on the first office day after the 15th day. 10, In the event of default of ary payment
within the period mentioned above, the property shall be put io fresh  aucion/Sale by private treaty. The depesil incheding EMD shall
stand forfaitad by TATA CAPITAL HOUSING FINANCE LTD and the defaulting purchasar shall kcse all claims to the property. 11. Details
of armyencumbrances, known lo the TATA CAPITAL HOUSING FINANCE LTD, to which the property (s liable: as per table above, Claims,
if any, which have been put forward to the property and any cther known particutars bearing on its nature and value: as per table above.
The Intending Bidder is advised 1o make thelr own independent Inquirkes regarding encumbrancas an e property including statutory
liahllifles arears of propedty iax, eleciicily eic. 12. For any other getails or for procedure online fraining on e-aucion e prospective
Ibéfcders may contact the Service Provider, M. 4Closune, Block No 605 A, Gth Floor, Maiirivanam Commardal Complax, Amperpet,
Hyderabad ~ 500038 through s coordinators Mr Adjt Kumer Das, 8142000725, 8142000085, 8142000062 Emal .-
arfitfibankauctions.in and Emall ; Infofibankauctionsin or Manish Bansal, Emall Id Manish Bansah@iatacapital com Authorised
Cfficer Mobie No B588503696, Piease send your query on WhatsAgp Number - 9889078665, 13. TDS of 1% will be applicable and
[payabile by the highest bidder over the highest declared bid amount. The payment needs o be deposited by highes biddar in the PAN of
the ownee! borrowar(s) and the copy of e challan shall be submitted io our company. 14, Plaasa rafiar to the balew link provided in
secured creditor's wabsita ttp:isu rl.Winvpxh for the above detais, 15 Kindly also wisit the Snk: hiips:/www tatacapital com/property-
gisposal.himi

Pieasa Nole - TCHFL has not engaged any brokeragent apart from the mentioned auctioning partner jor saledauction of this property.
Intzrested parties should any contact the undersigned of the Authorsed officer for all queries and enguiry in this malier.

Twenty Thousand Only) |(Land Area Admeasuring 362 Sq. Ft.) Hundred Forty Five Only) One Lakh Only)
1. Mr. Nitinkumar | 07-Sep-2022 & Rs.8,25,581/- | All that part and parcel of the property Flat 31-Mar-2024 Rs. 4,00,000/-
Mahendrabhai (Rupees Eight Lakh Twenty|No. Y-204, Umang Narol 8, Ad measuring | Total Outstanding as (Rupees Four
Chauhan Five Thousand Five Area 135 Sq. ft., Narol-Aslali Road, Narol,| On Date 07-Aug-2024 Lakh Only)
2Mrs. Ushaben | Hundred Eighty One Only) | Maninagar, Ahmedabad-382405 (Super | Rs. 10,93,820)- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
Chauhan Bid Increase Amount | Built up Area Admeasuring 405 Sq. ft.) Ten Lakh Ninety Three (EMD)
(Prospect No Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Thousand Eight Hundred | Rs. 40,000/- (Rupees
IL10155321) Twenty Thousand Only) Twenty Only) Forty Thousand Only)
1.Mr. Rohitkumar 13-Sep-2023 All that part & parcel of the property Flat No.C- 07-Apr-2024 Rs. 7,00,000/-
Ravat Rs.11,74,039/- (Rupees |505, Block No.C, 5th Floor, Kushal Awaas,| Total Outstanding As | (Rupees Seven Lakh
2.Mrs. Manishaben | Eleven Lakh Seventy Four |Survey No.1448, Final Plot No.73, B/H Patel| On Date 07-Aug-2024 Only)

Narshibhai Chitroda

Hundred Seventy Only)

Navagam, Anandpar, Rajkot, 360003,

3. Rohit R Ravat | Thousand Thirty Nine Only){Rise Mill, T.P.S No.84(Vatva-4), Taluka-Vatva, Rs. 14,77,381/- ;
Contractor S noease A Distict Ahmedabad, Gujarat, India, 382440| (Rupess Fourieen Lakh | ome™t honey Deposit
(Prospect No Rs.20,000/- (Rupees érea ,?dgreas)tgmlgt; (I!T Sg} Ft.},:q Propiréy Type: S_e};entyHSechnJhgush?;ld Rs. 70,000/~ (Rupees
IL10112185 arpet_Area, Built_Up_Area, Area_ Admeas - ree Hundred Ei
) Twenty Thousand Only) | i Broperty Area: 345,00, 401.00, 376,00 One Only) | Seventy Thousand Only)
1 Mr. Kailashku 11-Dec-2023 All'that part and parcel of the property bear- 08-Jun-2024 Rs.27,00,000/-
Ban;ilal (E?usaudhrg?; Rs.27,25,167)- (Rupees |ing Shop No 28, Ground Floor , Dharti-2, Total Outstanding (Rupees Twenty Seven
2 Miss. Chanda Twenty Seven Lakh Twenty | Plot No 92/1 , Revenue Survey No 278/3/1 as On Date Lakh Only)
Kailashkumar Five Thousand One Hundred| T.P Scheme No 45, Near N R House, Silver 07-Aug-2024 Eamest Money Deposit
Chaudhary 3. Raj | 209 Sty Seven Only) |28 T2 e e, Guaat | RS- 3162632
Tyres Works Bid Increase Amount |India Area Admeasuring (In Sq. JFt.); (Rupees Thirty One Lakh | Rs. 2,70,000/- (Rupees
(Prospect No. Rs.40,000/- (Rupees Forty |Property Type: Super_ Built _Up_Area ,| Sixty Two Thousand Six Two Lakh Seventy
961279) Thousand Only) Carpet_Area Property Area: 173.83, 170.00| Hundred Thirty Two Only) Thousand Only)
1. Mr. Vinodbhai M 08-Sep-2021 All'that part and parcel of the property Flat 02-Oct-2022 Rs. 3,00,000/-
Dulera Rs.10,14,231/- (Rupees Ten |[No 501 Wing A, on 5th Floor in Building M otal Outstanding as On|  (Rupees Three Lakh
2 Mrs. Dinaben Lakh Fourteen Thousand known as "Shree Somnath Residency’, Date 07-Aug-2024 Only)
Vinodbhai Dulera | Two Hundred Thirty OneOnly)| Revenue Survey No 28, Plot No 43 fo 57, Rs. 14,11,088)- Earnest Money Deposit
Bid Increase Amount Sub Plot No 43 to 57/2 Village Anandpar (Rupees Fourteen Lakh
(Prospect No Rs.20,000)- (Rupees | \ayadam District Rejuot, 360003, Gujaral | Eigyen Thousand Eighty | - Rs. 30,0001 (Rupees
888393) Twenty Thousand Only) |India Admeasuring 347.23 Sq. F1. (Super Eight Only) Thirty Thousand Only)
Built Up Area Ad.Measuring: 409.35)
1. Mr. Narshibhai  |10-Mar-23 & Rs.11,24,370/-| All that part and parcel of the property Flat 26-Aug-2023 Rs. 3,00,000/-
Vashrambhai Chitroda |(Rupees Eleven Lakh Twenty|No. C 404, Carpet Area Ad Measuring 283 [ Total Outstanding as On (Rupees Three
2 Mrs. Geetaben Four Thousand Three |Sg. Ft, Shree Somnath Resi, Anandpar Date 07-Aug-2024 Lakh Only)

Rs. 15,18,213/- (Rupees

Earnest Money Deposit

Place: Ahmedabad Sdi- Authorised Officer,
Date- 08-09-2024 Tata Capital Housing Finance Lid.

EE[Esd GSEC LIMITED

CIN: U52100G)1365PLCO01 347
Regd. Office: Gujarat Chambers Building, Ashram Road, Ahmedabad - 380002
Ph. No.: 078-26575757, E-Mall: csibgsect.coin, Website: www.gsecl.coln

MOTICE is hereby given that the 58" Annual General Meeting (“AGM") of the GSEC LIMITED will be held an
Friday, 27" September, 2024 at 12.00 noon. through Video Conference (VC) facility [ Other Audio Visual Means
(OAVM), in accordance with the applicable provisions of the Companies Act, 2013 and in compliance with the
circulars issued by Ministry of Corporate Affairs (MCA) dated Circular No, 1472020 dated 08.04. 2020, 172020 dated
13.04.2020 and general Circular No.20/2020 dated 5° May, 2020, Circular No.02/2021 dated January 13, 2021,
1012022 dated Dacember 28, 2022, and 372023 dated September 25, 2023 ta fransact the businesses as setout in the
Motice calling the AGM.

In compliances with above mentioned Circulars, link of Motice of AGM and Annual Report of the Company for the
Financial Year 2023-24, have been sant through electronic mode to those sharshalders who have registered their
g-mail IDs with deposiories or with the Company. The aforesaid documents are also available on the Company's
website www.gsecl.co.in.

The Company has providad its sharehaolders remate e-voling factity in compliancs with the provisions of saction 108 of
the Companies Act, 2013 and relevant rules made thereunder. The Company has engaged NSDL as the authorized
agency o provide e-voling facility toits all membsers.

The cul-off date to determine gligibility 1o cast voles by electronic voting s 207 September 2024, The remote e-voling
facility shall ba open for theee (3) days. commencing at Tuesday 24" September, 2024 at 09.00 AM. (IST) and ends
on Thursday, 26, September, 2024 at 05.00 P.M. for all the shareholders, whether holding shares in physical form or
in dematerialized form, Remote e-voting facility shall not be allowed beyond the sad date and time, The members who
remain present in the AGM through YCGIOAVM facility and had not cast their votes on the resofutions through remate
a-voling and are otherwisa not barred from doing so, shall be eligible to vole through e-voting faclity during the AGM,

Thea members may participate in the meeting even after exercising their right to vote through remote e-voting but shall

not be allowed to vole again during the meeting. Detalled instruction for remote e-voting faciity and e-voting at AGM are

farminig part of the Natice of AGM.

The Members wha have not registered their email 1Ds with the Depository Participant/Registrar and Share Transfer

agent of the Company and are willing to vote through e-vating! remote e-voling are requested to refer detailed

instruction for remote e-voting facility and e-voting at AGM forming part of the Notice of AGM,

Any person who acquires shares and becomes sharehalder of the Campany after dispatch of the notice and hodding

shares as of the cut-0ff date may cast their votes by following the instructions and process of e-voling as provided Inthe

Motice of AGM.

In case Membar who has nol registerad their e-mail address, they may follow the following instructions;

a. Member holding shares in Physical mode are requested 1o send an email to company al esiiigsecl.co.in along
with necessary details like folio no. Name of the Mamber and self attested copy of PAN card and Aadhar Card for
registering their email addresses.

b. Member holding shares in Demat mode are requested to contact their respective Depository Paricipant for
registering the email addresses.

In case of any queries, you may refer the Frequenily Asked CQuestions (FAQs) for Shareholders and e-voting user

manual for Shareholders availabls at the download section of www.evoting.nsdl.com call on.: 022 - 4888 7000 and

022 - 2499 7000 or send a request 1o Ms Paltavi Mhatre at evoling@nsdl.co.in.
FOR GSEC LIMITED

Sdi-

RAKESH SHAH

DATE: 05" SEPTEMBER, 2024 CHAIRMAN AND MANAGING NIRECTOR
PLACE: AHMEDABAD DIN: 00421920

NOTICE OF ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING

bhai Gevariya, 2.Mocktail
Soda And Icecream,
3.Mrs.Jinal Sandipbhai
Gevariya, 4.Mr. Tushar
Vinubhai Singhala
(Prospect No 859537)

(Rupees Eleven Lakh
Seventy Thousand Two
Hundred Eighteen Only)

Bid Increase Amount
Rs.20,000/- (Rupees
Twenty Thousand Only)

(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | Gujarat, India. (Area ad Measuring 326.47| Fifteen Lakh Eighteen
899667) Rs.20,000/- (Rupees  |Sq. Ft. and Built Up Area ad Measuring| Thousand Two Hundred Rs. 30,000/- (Rupees
Twenty Thousand Only) |382.77 Sq. Ft) Thirteen Only) Thirty Thousand Only)
1 Mr.Milan 09-Mar-23 & Rs.11,01,313/-| All that part and parcel of the property Flat| 26-Aug-2023 Rs. 3,00,000/-
Hasmukhbhai Naina | (Rupees Eleven Lakh One [No. C 302, 3rd Floor, Carpet Area Ad Total Outstandingas On| (Rupees Three Lakh
2 Mr. Hiren Nena Thousand Three Hundred |{Measuring 307 Sq. Ft., Shree Somnath Date 07-Aug-2024 Only)
3. Kajalben Milanbhai Thirteen Only) Residency, Anandpar, Navagam, Anandpar, | Rs. 15,15,393/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
Naina Bid Increase Amount | Rajkot, 360003, Gujarat, India. (Area ad| Fifteen Lakh Fifteen (EMD)
(Prospect No Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Measuring 347.35 Sq. Ft., and Built Up| Thousand Three Hundred| Rs,30,000/- (Rupees Thirty
884609) Twenty Thousand Only) |Area ad Measuring 409.35 Sq. Ft.) Ninety Three Only) Thousand Only)
1. Mr. Paresh Gokal 30-Sep-2021 All that part and parcel of the property Flat 25-Sep-2022 Rs. 3,00,000/-
Jadav Rs.13,45,086/- (Rupees |No. D 301, Area measuring 285 sq ft., Third [ Total Outstanding as On (Rupees Three Lakh
2. Mrs. Hasumatiben | _Thirteen Lakh Forty Five | Floor, Shree Somnath Residency, Anandpar,|  Date 07-Aug-2024 Only)
Pareshbhai Jadav | Thousand Eighty Six Only) |Navagam, Rajkot, 360003, Gujarat, India.| Rs.9,89,467/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
(Prospect No 875880 [ Bid Increase Amount | (Carpet Area Ad.Measuring: 326.47 Sq.Ft,| Nine Lakh Eighty Nine (EMD)
& 918480) Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Built Up Area Ad.Measuring: 383.41 Thousand Four Hundred Rs. 30,000/~ (Rupees
Twenty Thousand Only) | Sq.Ft) Sixty Seven Only) Thirty Thousand Only)
, 06-Feb-2024 All that part and parcel of the property bear- 14-Jul-2024 Rs.9,00,000/-
1. Mr. Rajesh Dubey | Rs.19,37,599)- (Rupees  |ing Plot No-113, R. S. No 63, Block No.72, | Total Outstanding As (Rupees Nine
2. Mrs. Janki Devi | Ninteen Lakh Thirty Seven | Aradhana Glorious, Jolwa, Palsana, Surat,| On Date 07-Aug-2024 Lakh Only)
3. Mr. Pravankumar | Thoysand Five Hundred And| 394305, Gujarat, India Area Admeasuring Rs. 21,08,274/- Earnest Monev Deposit
Houfg?;’;:seh;dhl%“bey Ninety Nine Only) (In Sq. Ft): Property Type: Land_Area, |(Rupees Twenty One Lakh y Dep
- Bid | A t |Carpet_Area, Super_Built_Up_Area,| Eight Thousand Two 3
868534, 954680) plslzng%gams?mump%:g Area_Admeasuring Property Area: 646.84,| Hundred Seventy Four I\ﬁ: é@%ﬂ%ﬂfséﬁ éJ %e:l;)
1. Mr. Rahul Hiraman | 24~-Jan-2024 & Rs.18,33,215/-| All that part and parcel of the property bear- 24-Jun-2024 Rs.9,00,000/-
Marathe (Rupees Eighteen Lakh |ing Plot No-187, Survey No. 71, Block No. fgta Gutstanding as on (Rupees Nine
2. Mrs. Bharti Namdev | Thirty Three Thousand Two |93, Garden Valley, Jolva, Palsana, Surat, Date 07-Aug-2024 Lakh Only)
Marathe Hundred and Fifteen Only) | 394305, GUJ.arat, India. Area.Admeasunng Rs. 21,51,582)- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
3. Mr. Vinubhai B Bid Increase Amount | Un Sq. Ft): Property Type: Land_Area,| Tyenty One Lakh Fifty
Khetani (ProspectNo| Rs.20,000/- (Rupees | C@rPet_Area, Super_Built_Up_Area|  One Thousand Five Rs. 90,000/ (Rupees
868145) Twenty Thousand Only) | Property Area: 648.85, 389.31, 389.31 Hundred Eighty Two Only)| ~ Ninety Thousand Only)
1. Mr.Sandipbhai Raja |16-Jul-2021 & Rs.11,70,218/-| All that part and parcel of the property Plot 21-Aug-2022 Rs. 5,00,000/-

No-28, Admeasuring 810 Sq. Ft,, Raj Mandir
Residency, Sn 301, Block No.288/28,
Shekhpur, Kamrej, Surat, 394150, Gujarat,
India. (Land Area Ad.Measuring: 462
Sq.Ft, Built Up Area Ad.Measuring:
277.20 Sq.Ft)

Total Outstanding as
On Date 07-Aug-2024

(Rupees Five Lakh Only)

Rs. 16,03,740/-
(Rupees Sixteen Lakh
Three Thousand Seven
Hundred Forty Only)

Earnest Money Deposit
(EMD)
Rs. 50,000/ (Rupees Fifty
Thousand Only)

Hathabhai Ratadiya

Rs.25,000/-(Rupees Twenty

Built Up Area Admeasuring 648 Sq. Ft.)

1. Mr. Dharmendra C | 09-Sep-2021 & Rs.13,59,352/-| All that part and parcel of the property Flat 25-Jan-2024 Rs.12,66,000/- (Rupees
2. Mrs.Nirupaben D | (Rupees Thirteen Lakh Fifty [No.1, 1St Floor, Admeasuring 322 Sq.Ft, | Total Outstanding as On| Twelve Lakh Sixty Six
Bhut Nine Thousand Three  |Plot No. 255, Ward 10/A, Ghandhidham, Date 07-Aug-2024 Thousand Only)
Hundred Fifty Two Only) |Gurukul Road, Kutch, 370201, Gujarat,| Rs.1591,503/- (Rupees |Eamest Money Deposit (EMD)|
(Prospect No 846588, Bid Increase Amount | India. (Built Up Area Admeasuring 646 Sq.| Fifteen Lakh Ninety One | Rs,1,26,600/- (Rupees One
920727 & 941371) | Rs.25,000/-(Rupees Twenty | ft.) Thousand Five Hundred || akh Twenty Six Thousand
Five Thousand Only) Three Only) Six Hundred Only)
1. Mr. Budhabhai  |05-Dec-20 & Rs.22,11,415/-| All that part and parcel of the property bear- 19-Jan-2023 Rs. 14,11,000/-
Hathabhai Ratdiya | (Rupees Twenty Two Lakh |ing Flat No 8-B, 8th Floor, Shree Apartment, [Total Outstanding as On| (Rupees Fourteen Lakh
2 Mr. Sindha Eleven Thousand Four |150ft Ring Road, Bh Alishan Apartment, Nr Date 07-Aug-2024 Eleven Thousand Only)
Hathabhai Ratadiya Hundred Fifteen Only) |Indira Circle, Rajkot, 360004, Gujarat, India.| Rs. 39,01,769/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
3. Mrs. Satiben Bid Increase Amount | (Carpet Area Admeasuring 648 Sq. Ft,| Thirty Nine Lakh One I

Thousand Seven

Rs.1,41,100/- (Rupees One
Lakh Forty One Thousand

Date of Ins‘?ecti on of pro
19-Sep-202

1100 hrs -1400 L?s

23-Sep-2024 till 5 pm.

(Prospect No 845411) | Five Thousand Only) Hundred Sixty Nine Only)|  One Hundred Only)
1. Mr. Kishor K 15-Mar-2021 & Rs.23,38,828/-| All that part and parcel of the property Sr no 17-Jan-2023 Rs.15,46,000/- (Rupees
Khoraba (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh|27/28,  Nr  Kharva  Samaj  Vandi, [Total Outstanding as On| Fifteen Lakh Forty Six
2 Mrs. Manjuben | Thirty Eight Thousand Eight|Kharvavadroad, Veraval, Gir Somnath Date 07-Aug-2024 Thousand Only)
Kishor Khoraba ~ |Hundred Twenty Eight only)| 362265, Gujarat, India. (Land Area Rs. 36,42,007)- Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount |Ad.Measuring: 704.93 Sq.Ft, Built Up| (Rupees Thirty Six Lakh |Rs.1,54,600/- (Rupees onel
834272) Rs.25,000/-(Rupees Twenty | Area Ad.Measuring: 1772.00 Sq.Ft) Forty Two Thousand | |.akh Fifty Four Thousand
Five Thousand Only) Seven Only) Six Hundred Only)
; 25-Apr-2022 All that part and parcel of the property 29-Oct-2023 For Property No. 1
1.M£.h?nﬂth?hhagan Rs.16,65,415/- (Rupees |Property No. 1: Flat No 402 4th Floor o0 Outstanding Rs.3,50,000/- (Rupees
a. Sixteen Lakh Sixty Five |Admeasuring 322.00 Sq .ft , Ajmeri as On Date Three Lakh Fifty Thousand)
2. Mr. Kaushikbhai | - Thousand Four Hundred |Gulshan , Mohmadi Baug , Vavdi , Gondal 07-Aug-2024 Earnest Money Deposit [EMD}I
Chhagan bhai Lathiya, Fifteen Only) Road , Rajkot, 360004. (Built up area Rs. 24,60 818- Rs.35,000/- (Rupees Thirty
3. Mrs. Ritaben Bid Increase Amount | Ad.Measuring: 319 Sq.fi) (Rupees Twenty Four Five Thousand Only)
Kaushikbhai Lathiya, Rs. 20,000/- (Rupees Lakh Sixty Thousand For Property No, 2
4. Mrs. Beena ben Twenty Thousand 0"'}() Property No. 2: Flat No. 403, 4th Floor| Eight Hundred Eighteen | Rs.3,50,000/- (Rupees
Sanjaybhai Lathiya (For Property No. 1) |Admeasuring 319.00 Sq .t , Ajmeri Only) Three Lakh Fitty Thousand)|
(Prospect No. Bid Increase Amount | Gulashan, Mohamadi Baug, Vavdi, Gondal Earnest Money Deposit
719238) Rs. 20,000/- (Rupees  |Road, Rajkot, 360004. (Built up area (EMD) Rs. 35,000/-
Twenty Thousand only) | Ad Measuring: 322 Sq.ft) (Rupees Thirty Five
(For Property No. 2 Thousand Only)
EMD Last Date Date/ Time of E-Auction

25-Sep-2024 1100 hrs.-1300 hrs.

Mode Of Payment :-EMD payments are to be made vide online mode only. To make payments you have to visit https://www.iiflonehome.com and|
pay through link available for the property/ Secured Asset only.Note: Payment link for each property/ Secured Asset is different. Ensure you are
using link of the property/ Secured Asset you intend to buy vide public auction.

For Balance Payment - Login https:/fwww.iiflonehome.com >My Bid >Pay Balance Amount.

@ N oo B L P

TERMS AND CONDITIONS:-

1. For participating in e-auction, Intending bidders required to register their details with the Service Provider https://www. iiflonehome.com well in
advance and has to create the login account, login ID and password. Intending bidders have to submit / send their "Tender FORM" along with the pay-
ment details towards EMD, copy of the KYC and PAN card at the above mentioned Branch Office.
The bidders shall improve their offer in multiple of amount mentioned under the column "Bid Increase Amount". In case bid is placed in the last 5 min-
utes of the closing time of the auction, the closing time will automatically get extended for 5 minutes.
The successful bidder should deposit 25% of the bid amount (after adjusting EMD) within 24 hours of the acceptance of bid price by the AO and the balance 75%
of the bid amount within 15 days from the date of confirmation of sale by the secured creditor. All deposit and payment shall be in the prescribed mode of payment.
The purchaser has to bear the cess, applicable stamp duty, fees, and any other statutory dues or other dues like municipal tax, electricity charges, land
and all other incidental costs, charges including all taxes and rates outgoings relating to the property.
The purchaser has to pay TDS application to the transaction/payment of sale amount and submit the TDS certificate with |IFL HFL.
Bidders are advised to go through the website https: //www.iiflonehome.com and https:/fwww.iifl.com/home-loans/properties-for-auction for detailed
terms and conditions of auction sale & auction application form before submitting their Bids for taking part in the e-auction sale proceedings.
For details, help procedure and online training on e-auction prospective bidders may contact the service provider E mail ID:- care@iiflone-
home.com, Support Helpline Numbers:@1800 2672 499.
For any query related to Property details, Inspection of Property and Online bid etc. call IIFL HFL toll free no. 1800 2672 499 from 09:30 hrs
to 18:00 hrs between Monday to Friday or write to email:- care@iiflonehome.com
9. Notice is hereby given to above said borrowers to collect the household articles, which were lying in the secured asset at the time of taking physical
possession within 7 days, otherwise IIFL-HFL shall not be responsible for any loss of property under the circumstances.
10. Further the notice is hereby given to the Borrower/s, that in case they fail to collect the above said articles same shall be sold in accordance with Law.
11. In case of default in payment at any stage by the successful bidder / auction purchaser within the above stipulated time, the sale will be cancelled and
the amount already paid will be forfeited (including EMD) and the property will be again put to sale.
12. AO reserves the rights to postpone/cancel or vary the terms and condition of tender/auction without assigning any reason thereof. In case of any dis-
pute in tender/Auction, the decision of AO of IIFL-HFL will be final.

15 DAYS SALE NOTICE UNDER THE RULE 9 SUB RULE (1) OF SARFAESI ACT, 2002

The Borrower are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above along with upto dated interest and ancillary expenses before the date of
Tender/Auction, failing which the property will be auctioned/sold and balance dues if any will be recovered with interest and cost.

Place:- Gujarat, Date: 06-Seop-2024

Sd/- Authorised Officer, IIFL Home Finance Limited.

17TH ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING
OF
SAGARDEEP ALLOYS LIMITED

(CIN: L29253GJ2007PLCOS5000T)
Registered Office: Plot No. 2070, Rajnagar Patia, Santej Khatraj Road,
Santej Kalol, Gandhinagar -382721.

Emaill: secretary@sdalloys.com; Websie: www.sdalloys.com
| NOTICE OF ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING |

Memibars are herely informed that disgateh of the 17 Annual Genaral Meeling Motice
dated September 03, 2024 {along with the Explanatory Statement) te the memders of the
ompany in respect of the Resolutions.as set outin the Motice of Anmesl Genaral Megting
has besn compisted on Thursday, Sememl_:le_rlilﬁ.iﬂz-’f. _ ]

To receive, consider and adopt () The audilad Sandalone Fmancial Stalement
of the Company for the fnancial year ended March 31, 2022 and the reports of the
Board of Direclors and Awditors: thereon; and {b) The sudited Consofidated
Financal Stalement of the Company for 1he fmancial year ended barch 31, 2124
andiheregorts of the Auditorsithereon. I
To appoint 3 Direcior i place of M. Safishioemar A, Mehta (DN 01053984
Directorwha retires by rotation & being elighle, offers himsalf for re appoinimanl.

lam | To Reappoint Mr. Satishkumar A Mehta (DIM; 09958%84) as a Managing |
 No.3 | Directorofthe Compiany w.e £, 30th December, 2024, fara period of three year
In comphiance with Section 108 of the Companies Act, 2013 read with Rula 20 of the
Comparies (Management and Administration) Rules, 2014 as amended by Comgpanies
(Maragement and Administrafion) Rules, 2115, and Regulabon 44 of fhe Listing
Obiigations and Disclosure Requirements Regulations, 2015, Members are provided with
the facility 1o cast their vobes on all resolutions set forth m the Nobice of the AGM using
eleclronic vating syslam frarm a place ather than the venue of the AGM, provided by CDEL
anvd tha business may be ransacted through such voting.
The e-vating period commences on Faday, Seplamber 27, 2024 from 3:00 am, IST and
shall end on Sunday, Seplember 25, 2024 a1 5:00 p.m. 15T, During this peniod. Mambars
may cast their wole alectronically Thae e-woling module shaf be disabled by CDSL
thereafter. A& vote once cast on ihe resolulion, would not be allowed o be changed
subsequently

Dnly those Sharehokders, wha will be present atthe ASM and who did not cast thairvode on
the resolutions set forthan the Motice of AGM by rernate e-woling prior o the AGM and are
otherwise nat barred from doing 5o shall be efigible o vote atthe AGM on such resclutions,
sharehoklers who have vobed thriugh remote e-woting will be eligile to attend the AGM
and their presanca shall be counted for the purpose of guorum, however such
Shareholkdars shall not be enfiled fo cast their wote again at the AGM on such rasolution(s)
farwhech the Shareholder has already cast the wole through remaote e<vafing.

The woting Aghts of Mambears shall ba i progaortion 10 the aquity shares hald by themin the
paid-up eguity share capital of the Company &5 on Monday, September 23, 2024 {cut-of
date’}. Any person, who is @ Member of the Comgany as on the cut-off date is eligibe to
cast vote on all the resolutions 5et forth in the Nofice of AGM using remaode e-wofing or
voting at the AGM,
Motice ig.as0 given that Regizter of members and Share transfiar books of the company will
remain closed from Tuesday, Septernber 24, 2024 to Monday, Seplember 30, 20i24{both
days mehesive) for the purpese of Anmual General Meeting,
Fordetails relating bo remote e-vofing, please raferta the Motice of the AGM. In case of amy
quenes refabing lo voling by elecironic means, please referfo the FAQ and e-vobng manual
avallable  at wwevalingindia com of contact at 022-230585542041, in case of any
grevance relating to e-voling please contact Mr. Rakesh Dali. Manager, Cantral
Depositary Services (India) Limitad, A& Wing, 25th Floor, Marathon Futures, Mafatal Mil
Compoonds, M M Joshi-Marg, Lower Parel (Esst), Mumbsai - 200013 or send an emal to
hefpdesk evatngiEcdslindis.com o call 122-F305ER42143,

"ours faithfully,

For, SAGARDEEP ALLOYS LIMITED
Sdi-

SATISHKUMAR MEHTA

MAMAGING DIRECTOR

(DIN: 01858984)

W
l’..}r.'.l‘!i:l
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Mo.2

Date: 05.00.2024
Place: Saniaj

SERA INVESTMENTS & FINANCE INDIA LIMITED
CIN: LS1900GJ1985PLC110976
Roglsterad Office: 306, 3rd Floor, Ashirwad Paras<1, Near Kanti Bharewad PMT,

Opposite Andaj Parly Piol, S, G. Highway, Makarba, Ahmedabad -380051, Gujarat
Phane No.; +81-9998833378 | Email: kapashicommercial1385@gmail.com
Website: www.serafinances.com

NOTICE OF 39TH ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING AND E-VOTING
Meatice & hareby given thal 39th Annual General Meeting (" AGM™) of the members af
Gera Investrments & Finance India Limited (e Company™) will be held on Monday,
septernber 30, 2024 at 02,30 pow. (15T) throwgh VG T CAVM 1o transact the businesses,
assetouliniheAGM Nolica

Fursuant to the Gensral Circular mo. 0802023 dated September 25, 2023 and oiher
circulars issuad by the Ministry of Comparate Affairs ("MCA Ciroulars’), compamss &ne
allowied 1o convane their AGKME theaugh V3 TOAYM, withowt the physical presance of the
MeETiers at 4 commaon vente. In compliance with the MCA Cinculars and the relevant
provisians of the Companies Act, 2013 [PAcl) and the Rules made thereunder, the AGM of
thee mambers of the Comparny will e hald Seaugh VO F O8I

The MCA Circulars read with the Securities and Exchange Board of India (SEBI) circulas
no, SEBNHOICEDPoD-2PICIRIARANET daled Owtober OF, 2023 (“3EB| Circutar™),
dispensed the requirement of sending fhe physical copies of the A Notice and Annus
Fepart 1o ihe members.

Acoordingly, fhe AGM Notice setting ouf the businesses to be renssoted at tha mesting
and the Annual Repor [2023-24) of the Company have bean dispatchad sleclronically on
Thirsday, Septmmber 05, 2024 [0 3l e mambers whose a-mdil aodrosses won
reqisterad with the Company and the Degasiionas

Mermbars may nobe that the AGM Nolice and the Annual Repos (2023-24) are alsa
awailable on the websile of the Company af www serafinances com, websife ofthe Stock
Exchange i.e. BSE Limiled B3ET al wahi bseindia com as well &5 an the webata of
Central Depository Servces (lndia) Usmited PCDSLY &t wwwievoltingindia com, the
agency appointed for facilitating e-voding (incleding remote e-voting) for the AGM

E-vobng {including remotle a-woling)

In compliance with Saction 108 of the Companies Act, 2013 read with Rule 20 of the
Companies [Maragament and Adminiziration} Rules, 2014 as amended by Companies
(Managemeni and Adminisirafion] Rules, 2015, and Regulation dd of the Listing
Ohligations and Disclosure Reguiraments Regulations. 2015, the Company = pleasad bo
offer e-vobing faclity 1o Hz-members to enable them o cast thair votes electronically on the
rasolutions et forth in the AGM Notice. The Membars holding either in physical form orin
alackranic fonm as on Monday, Seplember 23, 2024 fout-off dale') and who are athanwiss
not bamed ko cast thair vole, ane entitled to cast thelr vote electranically,

Molice = also givan that Register of mambears and Share transfer books of the company
will remain closed fromy Tuesday, September 24, 2024 to Monday. September 30, 2024
{both days incusive) for determiming the entifement of the Shansholers for the purpose of
Dividend and SGAA,

Any person, who acquires the shares of the Company and becomes member of fhe
Company altes the completion of dispateh of the AGM Nolice and holds shares on the Cul-
off date may obiam a login 1D and passwond tocast hishervole and for attending the AGM,
by sending request at helpdesk evoting@edslinda com. The detaled procedure for e-
wollng (including ramabe e-woling) is given in tha AGM Nobice.

The remote e-voling facility will be awailable from FPrday, September 27, 2024 &t 2,002.m,
15T and ends on Sunday, Seplember 23, 2034 at 5.00 pm. 15T, The rermate e-woling
madule shall be disabled by COSL ard no remote e-voting wit be allowed thereaftar, Cnoe
ik wole on the reschitionis | s cast by the member during the above menfioned rempte &
woling peariod, the mamber shall not ba allosed 1o change it subssquantly or cast the waba
again. However, helshe may atiend the AGM through WC ! 0AYM and who have casied
fheir vodes during the remote e-valing pericd and are otharwise not barrsd frem doing 50,
shall be efigible b vota threugh the e-voling systarm duing the AGM.

Tha Carmgany i5 plessed to provide remote e-Voling facifity of GDEL beforg-as wed as
durineg tha A toall its Members 1o cast thairvotes onall resolutions set ol in the Nalics
of the AGM, Detalled procedune for such remate e-\Woling will be provided in the Modice,
The procedure for ¢-woting at the AGM is sama &s the procedure for remote e-vofing. Only
those Sharahcldars, who will be pragant al tha AGM through WC § AWM fadlity and wha
would not have cast thesr vobe on the resolulions set forth in the Motice of AGM by remate g-
woding prior to tha AGM and are othenwise not bamed from éoing 50 shall be sligible to vabe
thraugh a-vabing system at the AGM on such resolufions.

if you have any queries o Imsues regarding atiending AGM & e-Vioting from the COSL e
Woling System, you can wite an amail o heipdask evoling@cdslindia.com or conlact al
tod freeno, 1800225533

For, SERA INVESTMENTS & FINANCE INDIA LIMITED

Sd/-

SAGAR SAMIR SHAH

Date: 0509 2024 WHOLE-TIME DIRECTOR
Place: Ahmadabad DIM: D3A0EZ957

financialexp

.epapr.in

Ahmedabad
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