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To,

Department of corporate Service (DSC-CRD)
BSE Limited

Phiroze Jejeebhoy Towers, Dalal Street, Fort,
Mumbai- 400 001.

Scrip Code: 531775

Sub: Submission of Newspaper Clippings of Advertisement Published Post-dispatch of Notice
and Annual Report for 32nd Annual General Meeting to be held on Thursday, 25th July, 2024
through Video conferencing / other audio-visual means

Dear Sir/Madam,

Pursuant to Regulation 47 and 30 read with schedule III of the SEBI (Listing Obligations and
Disclosure Requirement) Regulations, 2015, in connection with, the for 32nd Annual General
Meeting of Cistro Telelink Limited, to be held on Thursday, 25th July, 2024 through Video
Conferencing/Other Audio-Visual means, please find attached, the copies of newspaper
advertisement published on Wednesday, 03rd July, 2024 in Free Press Journal (English) and Indore
Samachar (Hindi) Newspapers regarding completion of dispatch of Notice of AGM along with
Annual Report for the Financial Year 2023-2024 to the shareholders, E-Voting Information and
Notice of Book Closure.

Kindly take the same on your record and acknowledge receipt of the same.
Thanking you,

Yours truly,

FOR CISTRO TELELINK LIMITED

Digitally signed by ARUN
ARU N KU MAR KUMAR SHARMA

Date: 2024.07.03 11:55:41
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DIRECTOR
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Encl: as below.
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NEPAL | Development comes as Nepali Congress and CPN-UML
strike a deal to form new coalition government

Prachanda will not quit

PTI
KATHMANDU

Embattled Nepal Prime Min-
ister Pushpa Kamal Dahal 'Pra-
chanda' has decided not to
resign from the post despite an
agreement reached between
the country's largest parties --
Nepali Congress and CPN-
UML -- to form a new coalition
government.

In a meeting of the Commu-
nist Party of Nepal (Maoist
Centre) office-bearers held in
Baluwatar on Tuesday, Prime
Minister Prachanda said he
would rather face a vote of
confidence in Parliament than
resign from the post, party
Secretary Ganesh Shah told
PTL

"The Prime Minister has de-
cided to seek a vote of con-
fidence," said Shah.

Prachanda, 69, has won
three votes of confidence in
Parliament during his one-
and-a-half-year term.

The development came
after Nepali Congress Presi-
dent Sher Bahadur Deuba and
the Communist Party of
Nepal-Unified Marxist Lenin-
ist (CPN-UML) inked a mid-

Briefs

ISLAMABAD
Imran Khan's
wife gets bail

A Pakistani anti-corruption
court on Tuesday granted
pre-arrest bail to jailed ex-
prime minister Imran
Khan's wife and former
first lady Bushra Bibi in a
case of alleged corruption.
Khan and Bibi face
charges of causing a loss
of about Rs50 billion to the
national exchequer in the
Al-Qadir Trust corruption
case. Judge Muhammad
Ali Warraich presided over
the hearing at Adiala Jail in
Rawalpindi and approved
her pre-arrest bail plea.
However, despite the grant
of bail, Bushra, 49, will re-
main behind bars due to a
conviction in the illegal
marriage case.

BRAZIL
30injuredin
turbulence

Aflight hit by "strong tur-
bulence” made an emerg-
ency landing in Brazil, with
30 people reported in-
jured. The Air Europa
Boeing 787-9 Dreamliner
was flying from Madrid to
Montevideo when the mid-
air incident happened. The
plane, with 325 passen-
gers, ran into turbulence
over the Atlantic near the
Brazilian coast. A local
medical team said they at-
tended to 30 passengers,
of which 10 were taken to a
hospital. The patients had
hit their heads during the
turbulence and suffered
injuries including cranial
fractures and cuts to the
face, the team added.

SYDNEY

Teen held for
stabbing

A 14-year-old boy dressed
in military clothing was ar-
rested after police alleged
he stabbed a 22-year-old
student in the neck Tues-
day at the University of
Sydney. The student was
taken to hospital and is
stable. The suspect was
treated in hospital for cuts
and awaits mental health
assessment, police said.
No motive or ideology be-
hind the attack has been
determined.

Cambodia jails 10
green activists

Agencies
PHNOM PENH

Ten activists from a prominent
youth-led environmental
group in Cambodia, Mother
Nature, have been sentenced
to between six and eight years
in jail in a case human rights
experts have widely con-
demned.
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The Nepal Prime Minister declared that he would rather
face a vote of confidence in Parliament

night power-sharing deal to
form a new “national consen-
sus government” to replace the
Prachanda-led coalition gov-
ernment.

Nepali Congress, the largest
party in the House of Repre-
sentatives (HoR) has 89 seats at
present, while CPN-UML has
78 seats. The combined
strength of the two large
parties is 167, which is suffi-
cient for a majority of 138 seats
in the 275-member HoR.

Deuba, 78, and Oli, 72,
agreed to share the prime
ministerial position on a rota-
tion basis for the rest of the
term of the Parliament.

Meanwhile, the talks be-
tween Prime Minister Pra-
chanda and CPN-UML chief
Oli to save the current coali-
tion has failed, according to
Maoist sources.

Quoting Prachanda, Shah
said that a conspiracy has been
hatched to topple the coalition

government and create insta-
bility in the country.

As per the constitutional
provision, the prime minister
will have 30 days to seek a vote
of confidence in the House of
Representatives, which would
give Prachanda some time for
political manoeuvring.

"We will engage in dis-
cussions with various parties,
including the Rashtriya Swa-
tantra Party (RSP), Nepali Con-
gress, and CPN-UML, so as to
save the coalition,” Prachanda
was quoted as saying.

Nepali Congress President
Deuba briefed party officials
about the agreement with the
CPN-UML during a meeting of
office-bearers at his residence
in Budhanilkantha on Tuesday
morning, according to party
sources.

In the meantime, the RSP,
one of the key ruling coalition
partners, has decided not to
participate in the new alliance
between the Nepali Congress
and the CPN-UML.

During a secretariat meet-
ing on Tuesday, the party also
decided to withdraw from the
current government, party
sources said.

Public Notice For E-Auction Cum Sale (Appendix - IV A) (Rule 8(6))

Sale of Immovable property mortgaged to IIFL Home Finance Limited (Formerly known as India Infoline Housing Finance Ltd.) (IIFL-HFL) Corporate
Office at Plot No.98,Udyog Vihar, Phase-IV,Gurgaon-122015.(Haryana) and Branch Office at:- "102/103, Darshan Mall, 15/2 Race Course Road,
Indore- 452001, Madhya Pradesh "/ Ground Floor , Plot no. 8/1 A & 8/2 A, Amar Singh Marg Freeganj , Ujjain 456001 under the Securitisation
and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (hereinafter "Act"). Whereas the Auhorized Officer ("AQ") of
IIFL-HFL had taken the possession of the following property/ies pursuant to the notice issued U/S 13(2) of the Act in the following loan
accounts/prospect nos. with a right to sell the same on "AS IS WHERE IS BASIS, AS IS WHAT IS BASIS AND WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS" for
realization of [IFL-HFL's dues, The Sale will be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website: www.iiflonehome.com

809446, 965767
& IL10111454)

Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty
Five Thousand Only)

Teh Sanwer, Indore, Indore,
452001, Madhya Pradesh, India.

Seven Thousand Seven
Hundred Eighty Eight Only)

Borrower(s) / Demand Notice Description of the Inmovable Date of Physical Reserve
Co-Borrower(s) Date and Amount property/ Secured Asset P i Price
I Guarantor(s) | 1g.\ar-2021 & Rs.6,21,791/- | All that part and parcel of the prop- 16-Feb-2023 Rs. 7,20,000/-
1.Mr. Virendra | (Rupees Six Lakh Twenty |erty Plot No A-139 Shri Gita Vihar,[ Total Outstanding as (Rupees Seven Lakh
Singh Thakur One Thousand Seven Village Tajkhedi Block Depalpur,| On Date 05-Jun-2024 | Twenty Thousand Only)
2 Mrs. Kamla | Hundred Ninety One Only) |Indore, Madhya Pradesh, 453001 | Rs. 10,43,413/- (Rupees [Earnest Money Deposit
Thakur Bid Increase Amount ) ) Ten Lakh Forty Three (EMD) Rs.72,000/-
(Prospect No | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty | (BUilt Up Area Admeasuring: 500| Thousand Four Hundred | (Rupees Seventy Two
839885) Thousand Only) Sq.Ft) Thirteen Only) Thousand Only)
1. Mr. Kuldeep |20-Oct-2022 & Rs.26,70,582/- All that part and parcel of the prop- 21-Feb-2024 Rs.23,16,000/- (Rupees
Kumar Gupta (Rupees Twenty Six Lakh |erty Flat No 307, Area Admeasuring [ Total Outstanding as on | . Twenty Three Lakh
2 Mrs. Shikha Seventy Thousand Five |945 Sq.Ft. Super Built Up Date 05-Jun-2024 Sixteen Thousand Only)
Gupta Hundred Eighty Two Only) |,Karolbagh Grand 3rd Floor, Block Rs.33,87,788/- (Rupees | Eamest Money Deposit (EMD)|
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | 2iamond A-4, Gram Bhavarshala, | Thiry Three Lakh Eighty |Rs.2,31,600/- (Rupees Two

Lakh Thirty One Thousand
Six Hundred Only)

world

Indore, Wednesday, 3 July 2024

“Trump ruling undermines rule of law’

Agencies
WASHINGTON

Joe Biden has described as a
"dangerous precedent” a Su-
preme Court ruling giving
former President Donald
Trump partial immunity
from criminal prosecution.

The current US president
said the judgement under-
mined the "rule of law" and
was "a terrible disservice" to
Americans.

Earlier, Trump hailed the
court's decision as a "big win"
for democracy.

The justices found on
Monday that a president had
immunity for "official acts"
but was not immune for "un-
official acts", and referred the
matter back to a trial judge.

The judgement will
further delay the criminal
case against Trump for alleg-
edly trying to subvert the
2020 election result that gave
victory to Mr Biden.

The trial judge must now
determine which actions

WESTERN RAILWAY - VADODARA DIVISION

GATI SHAKTI DEPARTMENT
CONSTRUCTION OF ROAD OVER BRIDGE
e-TENDER NOTICE NO.
CPM-GSENGG-BRC-02-2024-25
Sealed Tenders for and on behalf of the
President of India are invited by Chief
Project Manager (Gati Shakti), Western
Railway, Pratapnagar, Vadodara-390 004
for the following works. i) E-Tender No.
CPM-GS-ENGG-BRC-02-2024-2025 ii)
Name of Work: Vadodara-Geratpur
section: Elimination of Level X-ing No. 294
between Nenpur-Kanij at Km 471/16-18
by providing two lane Road Over Bridge
(ROB) iii) Approximate Cost of work (in
Rs.): ¥ 47,88,15,334.26 (Rupees Forty
Seven crores, Eighty Eight Lakhs, Fifteen
thousand Three Hundred Thirty Four and
Twenty Six Paisa Only) iv) Earnest
Money to be deposit (in Rs.): T
25,44,100/- (Rupees Twenty Five Lakhs,
Forty Four Thousand, One Hundred Only)
v) Availability of online Tender for
bidding: From 09-07-2024 at 11:00 Hrs.
to 23-07-2024 up to 15:00 Hrs. Opening
of Technical Bid Date and time: 23-07-
2024 at 15:30 Hrs. vi) Regarding detailed
notice containing cost of tender document
(non refundable), EMD, eligibility criteria,
Similar Nature of work, detailed tender
conditions, please visit www.ireps.gov.in

Manual offers will not be considered
BRC-099

Like us on: [ facebook.com/WesternRly

dent of the United States,”
President Biden said in a tele-

were carried out in Trump's
capacity as president, which
could take months.

day.

vised statement late on Mon-

Any trial is unlikely to start
before November's presi-
dential election.

"This nation was founded
on the principle that there
are no kings in America.
Each of us is equal before the
law. No one, no one is above
the law. Not even the presi-

CIN: L19201MP1992PLC006925

WESTERN RAILWAY

ON

E-TENDER NOTICE
Tender Notice No. M247GLRSRP2419,
Date: 27.06.2024 Name of work:
Repiping of 73 Electric Locomotives.
Location: Office of CWM / Dahod W.Rly.
Estimated Cost of work: Rs.
4,69,70,025/- Earnest Money Deposit:
Rs.3,84,900/- Date & time of
Submission & opening of E-Tender:
Submission of E-tender Up to 14.30 Hrs.
on 19-07-2024 and Opening of E-tender
at 15.00 Hrs. on same day. Tender
Notice and documents available at:
www.ireps.gov.in / E-Tenders / Works /
IR Electrical.
apex17/1116 DY.CPM (Elect.) DHD. W.RIy.

WESTERN RAILWAY - VADODARA DIVISION

VARIOUS SIGNALING WORKS
Tender Notice No. S&T/BRC/24-25/07/SIG
Date : 28-06-2024
Sr.DSTE/Vadodara acting for and on
behalf of The President of India invites
E-Tenders against Tender No. SandT_
BRC_24-25_07_SIG. Bidders will be able
to submit their original/revised bids up to
closing date and time only, Manual offers
are not allowed against this tender and
any such manual offer received shall be
ignored. (1) Name of the Work with its
location: Design of circuits, Alteration in
Electronic Interlocking (El), Supply,
digging of trenches, cable laying, outdoor
works, Installation, testing,
commissioning etc. of Multi Section Digital
Axle Counters (MSDACs) in connection
with the work of (1) Vadodara Yard- Bajva
section: Replacement of ABB
(Bombardier) AFTC by Dual MSDAC in
Automatic Signalling Section. (2) Bajva-
Ranoli Section: Replacement of ABB
(Bombardier) AFTC by Dual MSDAC in
Automatic Signalling Section (2)
Approximate cost of the work:
¥ 4,57,57,818.33 (3) Earnest Money to
be deposit: ¥ 3,78,800.00 (4) Date and
time for submission of e-tender and
opening of e-tender: 24-07-2024 @
15:00 Hours and 24-07-2024 @ 15:30
Hours. (5) Website particulars and
notice for location where complete
details can be seen etc: http://
www.ireps.gov.in Senior Divisional
Signal & Telecommunication Engineer,
2nd Floor, Annex Building, DRM's Office,
Western Railway, Pratapnagar,
Vadodara-390 004. BRC-101

Follow us on: X4 twitter.com/WesternRly

quorumunder Section 103 of the CompaniesAct, 2013.

the members are informed that:

may be transacted through voting by electronic means.

is Tuesday, 16th July, 2024.

as provided in the Notice of AGM.

facility of remote e-voting as well as voting atthe AGM through E-voting.
VL.

VI

to evoting@nsdl.co.in or contact 1800 1020 990/ 1800 224 430.

scrutinize the e-voting process in a fair and transparent manner.

daysinclusive).

Date : 03rd July, 2024
Place : Indore

CISTRO TELELINK LIMITED

The remote e-voting shall commence on Monday, 22nd July, 2024 (at9.00 a.m.)
The remote e-voting shall end on Wednesday, 24th July, 2024 (at5.00 p.m.)
The cut-off date for determining the eligibility to vote by electronic means or at the AGM

Registered Address: 206, Airen Heights, AB Road Indore MP 452010 IN Tel No: 0731-2555022;
Fax No.:0731-2555722 Email ID:cistrotelelink @gmail.com Website: www.cistrotelelink.com

NOTICE OF 32" ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING, E-VOTING AND BOOK CLOSURE

1. NOTICE is hereby given that the 32nd Annual General Meeting (AGM) is scheduled to be held
on Thursday, 25th July, 2024 At 03.00 P.M. through Video Conferencing (VC)/Other Audio
Visual Means (OAVM), to transact the businesses as set out in the Notice convening the said
Meeting and the Explanatory Statement thereto, in compliance with the applicable provisions of
the Companies Act, 2013. The Ministry of Corporate Affairs (‘MCA”) has vide its circulars dated
May 5, 2020, January 13, 2021, December 8, 2021, December 14, 2021 and May 5, 2022 read
with the circular dated April 8, 2020, April 13, 2020 and December 28, 2022 (collectively referred
as “MCAcirculars”) and Securities and Exchange Board of India (“SEBI") vide its circulars dated
May 12,2020, January 15, 2021, May 13, 2022 and January 5, 2023 (collectively referred to as
“SEBI Circulars”) permitted the holding of Annual General Meeting (‘AGM") through VC/OAVM,
without the physical presence of the Members at a common venue till September 30, 2024. In
compliance with the MCA circulars and SEBI circulars, the 32nd AGM of the Members of the
Company is being held through VC/OAVM. The registered office of the company shall be
deemed to be the venue for the AGM. Members will be able to attend and participate in the
ensuing AGM through VC /OAVM and the facility of appointment of proxy will not be available.
Members attending the AGM through VC JOAVM will be counted for the purpose of reckoning the

. Electronic copies of the Notice of 32nd AGM and Annual Report for the financial year ended
on 31st March, 2024 have been sent to all the members whose email IDs are registered with
the Company/ Depository participant(s). The same is also available on the website of the
Company https://www.cistrotelelink.com and on the website of the Stock Exchange,
www.bseindia.com. Members are requested to note that the physical copies of the aforesaid
documents will not be made available to them by the Company. The dispatch of Notice of
32nd Annual General Meeting has been completed on Tuesday, 02nd July, 2024.

. Members holding shares either in physical form or in dematerialized form, as on the cut-off
date of Tuesday, 16th July, 2024 may cast their vote electronically on the Ordinary and
Special Business(es) as set out in the Notice through electronic voting system of National
Security Depository Limited from a place other than the Venue of AGM (‘remote e-voting”). All

The Ordinary Resolutions & Special Resolutions as set out in the Notice of 32nd AGM

Person who acquires shares of the Company and becomes the member of the
Company after the dispatch of Notice of AGM and holding shares as on cut-off date i.e
Tuesday, 16th July, 2024 can follow the process of generating the login ID and password

Members may note that a) the remote e-voting module shall be disabled by the NSDL
after the aforesaid date and time for voting and once the vote on the resolution is cast by the
member, the member shall not be allowed to change it subsequently ; b) the member who
have cast their vote by remote e-voting prior to the AGM may also attend the AGM but shall
not be entitle to cast their vote again ; c) the facility for voting through E-voting shall be made
available during the course of AGM for those who have not voted previously ; and d) a
person whose name is recorded in the register of members or in the register of beneficial
owner maintained by the depositories as on cutoff date only shall be entitled to avail the

The Notice of 32nd AGM is available at the website of the Company
https://www.cistrotelelink.com, the stock Exchange, i.e. BSE Limited at
www.bseindia.com and also on NSDL website https:/www.evoting.nsdl.com/
In case of any queries, members refer Frequently Asked Question (FAQ's) and e-voting
manual available at https:/www.evoting.nsdl.com/ under help section or write an e-mail

. The Board of Directors have appointed Mr. Hemant Shetye having Membership No. FCS-
2827 & Certificate of Practice No. 1483 and/or Mr. Prakash Naringrekar, Company Secretary,
having Membership No. ACS- 5941 & Certificate of Practice No. 18955, Designated Partners
of M/s HSPN & Associates LLP, Practicing Company Secretaries, as the Scrutinizer to

. The Register of Members and Share Transfer Register in respect of equity shares of the
Company will remain closed from Friday, 19th July, 2024 to Thursday 25th July, 2024 (both

For CISTRO TELELINK LIMITED

Sid-

ARUN KUMAR SHARMA

DIRECTOR
(DIN:00369461)

6. For details, help procedure and online training on e-auction prospective bidders may contact the service provider E mail ID:-
care@iiflonehome.com, Support Helpline no.1800 2672 499.
7. For any query related to Property details, Inspection of Property and Online bid etc. call IIFL HFL toll free no.1800 2672 499 from 09:30
hrs to 18:00 hrs between Monday to Friday or write to email:-care@iiflonehome.com.
8. Notice is hereby given to above said borrowers to collect the household articles,which were lying in the secured asset at the time of
taking physical possessionwithin 7 days, otherwise IIFL-HFL shall not be responsible for any loss of property under the circumstances.
9. Further the notice is hereby given to the Borrower/s, that in case they fail to collect the above said articles same shall be sold in accordance with Law.
In case of default in payment at any stage by the successful bidder / auction purchaser within the above stipulated time, the sale will be
cancelled and the amount already paid will be forfeited (including EMD) and the property will be again put to sale.
. AO reserves the rights to postpone/cancel or vary the terms and condition of tender/auction without assigning any reason thereof. In case
of any dispute in tender/Auction, the decision of AO of IIFL-HFL will be final.

15 DAYS SALE NOTICE UNDER THE RULE 9 SUB RULE (1) OF SARFAESI ACT, 2002

The Borrower are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above along with upto dated interest and ancillary expenses before the date
of Tender/Auction, failing which the property will be auctioned/sold and balance dues if any will be recovered with interest and cost

Place:- Indore, Date: 03-July-2024

Sd/- Authorised Officer, lIFL Home Finance Limited.

Yash (Borrower), Smt. Vandana Kag
(Co-Borrower)

Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
Recorded No 307, Ph No 07, Gp Talwada Barwani, Anjad,
Madhya Pradesh-451556 Admeasuring 900 Square Feet

Rs. Ten Lac Twenty-Seven
Thousand Seventy-Eight Only
ason 11-Mar-24

1. Mr. Sunil  |21-Mar-2022 & Rs.13,77,326/-|All that part and parcel of the prop- 06-Feb-2024 Rs.7,85,000/- (Rupees
Kochale  |(Rupees Thirteen Lakh Seventy ZQ)"‘ 6Plot l\:o PéBO, ag_rpyea\illllnng Total Outstanding as Sev%: Lakh dE%htly)Fwe
2Mrs. Kavita | Seven Thousand Three 46 sq. mirs. , Super Gity , Village | on“Date 05-Jun-2024 ousand Only) A U SMA L I_ F I N A N C E BA N K I_ I M IT E D .
Prospect N Hundred Twenty Six Only) ’;"i:gg’dg:?‘{‘&%'gfk’ﬂg"dmvp:;‘gggﬁ» Rs. 19,50,467/- (Rupees | Eamest Money Deposit (END)| (A Scheduled Commercial Bank)
rospect No Bid Increase Amount A P » | Nineteen Lakh Fifty Nine | Rs.78,500/- (Rupees . ice: - i i - :
B36304) | Re 20,0001 (merome Tty K]gr]ﬁea(silrlirr)ler' \ s?ou's" ng Area | icicand Four Hundred | Soventy Eight hausand il Regd. Office: 19-A, Dhuleshwar Garden, Ajmer Road, Jaipur - 302001 (CIN:L36911RJ1996PLC011381)
Thousand Only) g 4 Sixty Seven Only) Five Hundred Only) APPENDIX IV [SEE RULE 8(1)] POSSESSION NOTICE
1. Mr. Mukesh ?th'ggg-szOElzezvgnRLsa';:fZ%fez:tg éﬂythgfo’:aﬁoirgj ’;\fgﬁﬁl gfa:?eofp i - talg-ct)cttz;z?i?s ?l?niﬁl?r?%hﬁ;%?vees Whereas, The undersigned being the Authorized Officer of the AU Small Finance Bank Limited (A Scheduled Commercial Bank) under the “Securitization and
2"5'[‘;”"53;:":; Thousand Six Hundred ~ |12/6 Area admeasuring 350 Sq.ft (;]" Dat:; ga.gu::goza: Thousand Only) Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest [Act, 2002 (54 of 2002)] and in exercise of powers conferred under section 13 (12) read
Vishkarma _Twemy Eight Only) ngﬂyﬁ‘ﬂaﬁgfg‘ ﬁné’i’a’a”‘* 456010, ?; 15{5?']17’{]-_ (Rup’ges Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)| with rule 3 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002 issued demand notice on the date as mentioned below calling upon the borrowers to repay the
(Prospect No ngg&gﬁ,{e(a;jp':g:’}wénty (Built Up Area ad Measuring 325| ‘Tporeary Sixlﬂit,{dr'e‘f Nﬁ'g,%sh?gg ﬁgﬂzzﬁd amount mentioned in the said notice within 60 days from the date of receipt of the said notice as per the details given in below table: -
863934) Thousand Only) Sq. Ft) Seventeen Only) Five Hundred Only) N B /Co-B / 13 (Z) Notice Date of
1. Mr. Rajesh | 06-0ct-2021 & Rs.5,79,711/- | Al that part & parcel of the property| 24-Aug-2022 Rs.4,90,000)- (Rupees S (17 LT A H A Description of Mortgaged Property ¢
Kushwah | (Rupees Five Lakh Seventy |EWs Flat No 214 on Second Floor in—iergicnas == Four Lakh Ninety Mortgagor/Guarantor/Loan A/c No. Date & Amount Possession Taken
2 Mrs. Meena Nine Thousand Seven ~ (Block B1 ,on "ANMOL® of Residential| 5 "nzta 0s. Jun—g024 Thousand Only)
Hundred Eleven Only) &olljoona émgvlv\nL kA KﬁggEHAgGAN Rs. 8,68,029/- Eamest Money Deposit (Loan A/C No.) L9001060117133160, 07-Mar-22  %6,37,817/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount Happy Home Phase 2 and Sr?urg:: (Rupees Eight Lakh (EMD) Abhishek Sharma (Borrower), Rs. Six Lac Thirty-Seven Thousand | Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
879121) Rs.20,000/- ngari Villas in the village Baliyakheda S'XWE'%E‘£‘°+’522d Rs. 49,000/~ (Rupees Jagdishchandra Sharma (Co- Eight Hundred Seventeen only House No 1145, Ward No 5,Phn. 17, Tehsil- Mohan
(Rupees T"é?_lrl‘;))’ Thousand | Tehsil and Distgigglr;goge ( héP) India| "¢ NLiIne[OnIy)W ty Forty ngil';?ousand Borrower), Gayatri Sharma (Co- as on 05-Mar-22 Barodiya,Dist Shajapur, Mp Admeasuring 600 Sqft East:
d ing 339.72 Sq . Feet. Borrower) Gopal Patidar (Guarantor) House Of Mr Murli Dhar Sharma, West: House of Mr. Rajesh
1. Mr. Sandeep |09-Feb-2021 & Rs.11,22,364- [All that part and parcel of the prop- 18-Aug-2022 Rs.9,22,000/- (Rupees Sharma, North: House Of Shankar Sharma, South: N/A
Sagre (Rupees Eleven Lakh Twenty |erty Flat No 401, NG 7 tal Outstanding as | Nine Lakh Twenty Two
2 Mrs. Alka Two Thousand Three  [Super area of 46.65 sq. metres, 4Th| 5 “n o 0e™y 1 5004 Thousand Only) (Loan A/C No.) L9001061124360373 & 12-Feb-24 ¥ 1,48,153/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
Yadav Hundred Sixy Four Only) |flcr. aabh Apart Q;T;eﬂfyt '}‘,?"a?e Rs. 18,58,835- (Rupees |Eamest Money Deposit (END)| 9001060114032421, Devendra Kumar | Rs. One Lac Forty-Eight Thousand | Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
Bid Increase Amount  |\oin 4 Toheil and District Indore, | Eighteen Lakh Fifty Eight|  Rs.92,2001- (Rupees Sethiya (Borrower), Jayesh Kumar Jain| One Hundred Fifty-Three Only & | Ph No. 29, Ward No. 06, Gram -Bidwal, Te.- Badnawar, Dist.-
(Prospect No | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty 1 "| Thousand Eight Hundred| Ninety Two Thousand A ) L .
900425) Thousand Only) Madhya Pradesh, India 453112. Thirty Five Only) Two Hundred Only) (Co-Borrower), Smt.Dilkhush Jain (Co- %11,12,016/- Rs. Eleven Lac Ujjain, Madhya Pradesh Admeasuring 63.88 Sq. Yrd. East:
T Wr Akash | 1-0ct-2021 & Rs.20,52,163/- |l thal part and parcel of e prop- 03-Apr-2024 Rs. 15,79,000)- (Rupess Borrower), Kavar Lal (Guarantor) Twelve Thousand Sixteen Only House Of Plllp SISOdIYa West.: Main Road Ngrth: House Of
2 Mrs Gita Bai | (Rupees Twenty Lakh Fifty |erty Flat No 202 Second Floor, [Total Outstanding as on | Fifteen Lakh Seventy ason 12-Feb-24 Raisingh Kachhi South: House Of Hakim Bohra
Two Thousand One Hundred |admeasuring 82.43 sq. mirs. | Date 05-Jun-2024 Nine Thousand Only)
3 Mr. Gopal Sixty Three Only) Chakradev , Appartment House No | Rs,28,25,897/- (Rupees [Eamest Woney Deposit (EMD)| (Loan A/C No.) L9001060818806771, 12-Feb-24  ¥5,90,900/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
(ProspectNo |— 10, (C?Id B:°°k No 127! 5c_||_1em$ No| * Twenty Eight Lakh | Rs 1,57,900/- (Rupees One Vinod Kumar (Borrower), Smt. Rs. Five Lac Ninety Thousand Nine | Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
805271) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty Sneh|la¥agar?péi‘fimﬁg 2 Ir:gf)re )_' EWE;R'%’_‘ F|vde 1;?0’{:_53”‘1 Lakh Fifty Seven Thousand Kashmira Bai Daiya (Co-Borrower) Hundred Only as on 12-Feb-24 | Freehold - Municipal Limit Semi Urban And Rural Gram Rajod
Five Thousand Only) 452003, Madhya Pradesh, Indi 2 19! Sel\i/gnf% nly)'"ety Nine Hundred Only) Rajod Sardarpur, Dist- Dhar, MP Admeasuring 92 Sqyds
1.Mr.Binod | 6-Apr-2021 & Rs.4,35,858/- |All that part and parcel of the prop- 02-Jun-2022 Rs. 7,04,000/- _Jan- - i i i -Jun-
Kimar Gupta | _ (Rupees Four Lakh Thirty _[erty Plot No. A94, admeasuring 500 (oar Outstanding As | (Rupees Seven Lakh (Loan A/C'No.) L9001060117100661, 06 an 24 X 5,78,070/ All That Ear't And Parcel Of Resml'entlaI/Commerua'I Property 28-Jun-24
2 Mrs. Suman |Five Thousand Eight Hundred [sq. ft. ie. 4646 sq. mirs, Geeta| ‘o' Date 05-Jun-2024 |__Four Thousand Only) Narayan Singh (Borrower), Smt.Durga Rs. Five Lac Seventy-Eight Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At -
Fifty Eight Only) Vihar Colony, Gram Tajkhedi Teh Rs. 8,34,026/- Eamest Money Deposit (EMD Kunwar (Co-Borrower), Thousand Seventy Only as on Plot No 17, Phn 26, Vill- Satkali, Th- Badnawar, Dist - Dhar,
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount Be%alprt:r 45%'381 Ilnz(ijpre, Madhya| (Rupees Eight Lakh Rs.70,40t¥/— (Pp?upe(es ) 05-Jan-24 MP Admeasuring 167.28 Sq.Mtr. East: Plot Of Donor West:
1L10009095) | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty | 2oeS: » India Thirty Four Thousand | Seventy Thousand Four Road North: Road, South: Plot Of Mr Shankar Singh
Thousand Only) Twenty Six Only) Hundred Only) - X -
1M Gunjan | 21-Mar-2022 & Rs 14,39 836~ | All h part and parcel of he prop- 20-May-2023 Rs.22,06,000 (Rupees (Loan A/C No.) L9001060119408539, 12-Feb-24 ?_2,97,595/- All That F_’ar_t And Parcel Of Reﬂd_entnal/Commerc@l Property 28-Jun-24
Kumar Singh | (Rupees Fourteen Lakh Thirty |erty Plot No 313 Red Wood Park, [—rogar Outstanding 2 Twenty Two Lakh Six Basant Jadam (Borrower), Smt.Rekha Rs. Two Lac Ninety-Seven Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Sittuated At-
2 Mrs. Nine Thousand Eight Hundred|Area Measuring 700 Sq. Ft, Gram | o1 'nate 05.Jun-2024 Thousand Only) Jadam (Co-Borrower), Smt.Kala Bai Thousand Five Hundred Ninety- | 195/2/10, P.H. No. 49, Village- Sala, Tehsil- Dharampuri, Distt-
Snehalata Thirty Six Only) Pigdamber Teh How Dist, Indore, | p 17,41,761/- (Rupees |Eamest Money Deposit (EMD)| (Co-Borrower) Rajesh Jadam (Co- Five Only as on 12-Feb-24 Dhar, Madhya Pradesh Admeasuring 78 Sqyds East: Kachha
Kumari Bid Increase Amount L”Sds"argi Madhya Bpﬁ?tdeah' IRd'a' Seventeen Lakh Forty |Rs.2,20,600/- (Rupees Two Borrower) Rasta West: Kachha Rasta North: Remaining Part Of Seller
(Prospect No | Rs 25,000/- (Rupees Twenty R (Bui P Ar®a| One Thousand Seven | Lakh Twenty Thousand South: Plot Of Nana
1L10028991) Five Thousand Only) Ad.Measuirng: 920 Sq.Ft) Hundred Sixty One Only) Six Hundred Only) - - - -
1 Mr Suresh_|30-Nov-2021 & Rs.12,11,5601-| All that part and parcel of the prop- 30-Nov-2022 Rs.10,38,000/- (Rupees (Loan /_\/C No.) L9001060118057792, 06-Jan-24 X 12,87,999/— All That P‘ar‘_t And Parcel Of ReS|dgnhaI/CommerC|alI Property 28-Jun-24
Sharma (Rupees Twelve Lakh Eleven |erty Flat No 121, 15t Floor Laabh [~Tomar Outstanding as Ten Lakh Thirty Eight Chunnilal Mahaple (Borrower), Hukum Rs. Twelve Lac Eighty-Seven Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At-
2 Mrs. Jyoi Thousand Five Hundred  |Apartment , Area Admeasuring 462 - "nate 05- Jun-2024 Thousand Only) Mahaple (Co-Borrower), Smt.Laxmi Thousand Nine Hundred Ninety- Plot No 1564/1592, Sector No 02, Dharampuri, Dist- Dhar,
Sharma Sixty Only) Sq. Ft., Shri Ramkamal Residency | p 16,80 524/- (Rupees [Eamest Money Deposit (EMD)| Mahapale (Co-Borrower) Nine Only as on 05-Jan-24 Madhya Pradesh Admeasuring 2400 Sqft.
(ProspectNo [~ Bidncrease Amount | s N, village, Nainod: Distt| siicen'lakh Eighty |Rs.1,03,8001- (Rupees One — -
IL10037227 & | Rs,25,000/- (Rupees Twenty 4"52‘3& adhya Pradesn, India, | thoysand Five Hundred | Lakh Three Thousand (Loan A/C No.) L9001060117640968, 06-Mar-24 %7,21,194/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
1L10076475) Five Thousand Only) : Twenty Four Only) Eight Hundred Only) Shree Sai Trading Company Rs. Seven Lac Twenty-One Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
1. Mr. Manish 19-Mar-2022 All that part and parcel of the prop- 30-Jan-2023 Rs.14,27,000/- (Rupees (Borrower), Rohit Maru(Dayya) (Co- Thousand One Hundred Ninety- | House On Land S.No. 2048/1, Phn.-7/12, Gram.- Labriya, Te.-
Ojha, 2 Mrs. Rs.13,74,000/- (Rupees |erty Plot No 132, area admeasuring ooy Outstanding as | ourteen Lakh Twenty Borrower), Smt.Shyama Bai Four Only as on 06-Mar-24 Sardarpur, Dist.- Dhar, Mp Admeasuring 0.094 Hect. East:
Taruna Ojha Thmee_lphLakh geovelnty Four GDtoanSn% dFt.]"ehGI%):l a\{aﬂfy (S;i’)“ On Date 05-Jun-2024 | Seven Thousand Only) Rameshwar (Co-Borrower) Land Of Shree Ambaram West: Land Of Munnalal North:
3 Maa Dadha ousand Only) Dist. Indore. M.P. 453‘3335 ’ Rs. 14,84,044)- Earnest Money Deposit (EMD){ Rameshwar Maru (Co-Borrower) Land Of Munnalal South: Road
m:tl Sllal Cteﬂter Bid Increase Amount g 2 VD (Rupees Fourteen Lakh |Rs.1,42,700/- (Rupees Onel
o oTocars, - hwor- Sl A el Lot et Al et (Loan A/C No.) L9001060121748360, 12-]an-24  ¥7,78,164/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property |  28-lun-24
ATt pariand o Bheemsingh (Borrower), Smt.Papeeta Rs. Seven Lac Seventy-Eight Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
1. Mr. Rahul Rs. 10 (1267;586%'/)-%23?)9(%5 Ton lerty ?’Igta N'Z" Gggrcepﬁ Neoprgér — 1;9;‘]:"'3_024 %ﬁgﬁ{ﬁﬁﬁ%é&f%ﬁs Bai (Co-Borrower) Thousand One Hundred Sixty- Gram Panchayat Phn 169, Sagdi ,Dist-Dhar, Madhya Pradesh
2 Mr. Mulchand atapcinagl . i 30 *| lotal Quistanding as on F Onl 10-Jan-24 Ad ing 217 Sqyd
d 480 ot our Only as on an measuring qyds
s | B e g L) SR e G
(Prospect No |- >0 2SN ) {o o bilod,  Tohsil ~ Depalpur, | <& 1277237k (Rupees | Eamest Money Deposit (EWD) (Loan A/C No.) L9001060122615300, 12-Feb-24 ¥ 5,27,240/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property | 28-Jun-24
1110146843 Bid Increase Amount Depalour. Indore. Madhya Pradesh’ Twelve Lakh Seventy Rs.84,200/- (Rupees itendra Namdev (B Rs. Five Lac T Land / Buildi And Fi P . d A
) Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty |DePalpur, Indore, Madhya Pradesh, | ge,en Thousand Two Hun|  Eighty Four Thousand Jitendra Namdev (Borrower), s. Five Lac Twenty-Seven and / Building / Structure nd Fixtures Property Situated At
Thousand Only) India, 453115. dred Thirty Seven Only) |  Two Hundred Only) Omprakash (Co-Borrower), Jagannath|  Thousand Two Hundred Forty  |Phn 13, Settriment No 21, Pridarshni Complax Vill - Kasrawad,
1. Mr. Devindra 14-Apr-2021 Al that part and parcel of the prop-|_Symbolic Possession | Rs.15,94,000/- (Rupees (Co-Borrower) Only as on 12-Feb-24 Dist - Kharagone , Madhya Pradesh Admeasuring 77 Sq.Ft.
Gupta Rs.4,44,402/- (Rupees Four ety Plot No 1-B, admeasuring 4150 21-May-2022 Fifteen Lakh Ninety Four East: Shop Of Sheru West: Shop Of Anil North: Land And
2 Baba Buildsoft | Lakh Fourty Four Thousand (9. ft, "Future City", Patwari Halka [Tofal Outstanding as on| __Thousand Only) Shop Of Nagar Panchayat Kasrawad South: Road
Private Limited | Four Hundred Two Only) |No. 34, Survey No 285-1-5, 310-6-| * pate 05-Jun-2024 | Earnest Money Deposit
3MrSandhya —Biqincrease Amount | 1T , 31_?-%-2» 3|10-6-3|. ?ram ?Aaﬁ:ia, Rs.7,59,933/- (Rupees | (EMD) Rs. 1,59,400/- (Loan A/C No.) L9001060123732250, 12-Jan-24  ¥10,19,001/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
(gigpig?ﬁo Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty P?ajlesh 54%33%; ndore, Madhya Tﬁeven Iaak’L‘. F"LY N(Iined (Rﬁ_pee_?hOne L?ikhF Fifty Chintu Yadav (Borrower), Smt Rs. Ten Lac Nineteen Thousand | Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
756239) Five Thousand Only) ’ O-:—Jﬁiar?y Thrgeeorl:lr;l)re '"ﬁundﬁgga%nlyfur .Archana Yadav (Co-Borrower) One Only as on 10-Jan-24 Gram - Bakwadi , Panji .No. 100 Gram- Panchayat Bakwadi,
Date of Inspection of property EMD Last Date Date/ Time of E-Auction Tehsfll -Raipur ,Dist- Barwani MP Adr.neasurlng 1912.50 SqFt
19-JUL-2024 11:00hrs -14:00hrs 22-JUL-2024 till § pm. 24-JUL-2024 11:00 hrs.-13:00 hrs. East: House Of Mr . Mahendra West: House Of Mr‘. Manohar
Mode Of Payment:- EMD payments are to be made vide online mode only. To make payments you have to visit https:/www.iiflonehome.com North: Common Road South: Property Of Mr Jitendra
and pay through link available for the property/ Secured Asset only. Note: Payment link for each property/ Secured Asset is different. Ensure N N N
you are using link of the property/ Secured Asset you intend to buy vide public auction. (Loan A/C No.) L9001060123849820, 12-Jan-24  %2,94,392/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
For balance payment, upon successful bid, has to pay through RTGS/NEFT. The accounts details are as follows: a) Name of the Account:- Bherulal (Borrower), Smt.Pawan Bai Rs. Two Lac Ninety-Four Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At
IIFL Home Finance Ltd., b) Name of the Bank:- Standard Chartered Bank, c) Account No:-9902879xxxxx followed by Prospect Co-Bi : - |G Panchavyat Ph No 73, Village- K Tehsil Bad
Number, d) IFSC Code:-SCBL0036001, ¢) Bank Address: Standard Chartered Bank, 90 .G Road, Fort, Mumbai-400001. (Co-Borrower) ThO;"ili“g:Ihrsse‘:'n“;giig';‘ety  Dist Dhar Madhya Pradesh Admeasuring 522 Sq.Ft, Eact:
IERNS AND CONDITIONS:. Y House Of ;vleharban West: Road North: House (')f éunar.n
1. For participating in e-auction, Intending bidders required to register their details with the Service Provider https://lwww.iiflonehome.com, . .
well in advance and has to create the login account, login ID and password. Intending bidders have to submit / send their "Tender FORM" Chand South: House Of Ramesh
along with the payment details towards EMD, copy of the KYC and PAN card at the above mentioned Branch Office. N N N
2. The bidders shall improve their offer in multiple of amount mentioned under the column "Bid Increase Amount". In case bid is placed in (Loan A/C No.) L9001060125281786, 13-Feb-24  ¥6,95,943/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24
the last 5 minutes of the closing time of the auction, the closing time will automatically get extended for 5 minutes. Rakesh Yadav (Borrower), Smt.Anita Rs. Six Lac Ninety-Five Thousand | Land / Building / Structure And Fixtures Property Situated At-
3. E(\)e Suﬁﬁssglﬂl bidde;ss!/\ouflt{hdegpdsit 25% ?f ‘_ft\;]’-_ bifsa?OU"f‘r(aﬂ?; ﬂgiUtStin]g EMfD) wi!hin 2f4 hfurbs l;;the acwgtanc;tof l;-l\(lil gn'oe l?tY thg Bai Yadav (Co-Borrower) Nine Hundred Forty-Three Only | Recorded No 02, Ph No 16, Gram Pipari Bujurg , Tehsil Rajpur,
an € Dalance 0 OF the DId amount within lays from the aate of confirmation of sale by the secured creditor. ieposit an ey B : .
payment shall be in the prescribed mode of payment. as on 12-Feb-24 Dist- Barwani, M‘adhya Pr'adesh Admeasuring 750 Sq:Ft East:
4. The purchaser has to bear the cess, applicable stamp duty, fees, and any other statutory dues or other dues like municipal tax, electrici- House Of Shantilal West: HO‘;'5e Of Tarachand North: Raod
ty charges, land and all other incidental costs, charges including all taxes and rates outgoings relating to the property. South: Agriculture Land
5. Bidders are advised to go through the website https:/iwww.iiflonehome.com and https:/www.iifl. It loans/properties-f tion for
detailed terms and conditions of auction sale & auction application form before submitting their Bids for taking part in the e-auction sale proceedings. (Loan A/C No.) L9001060127091536, 12-Mar-24 10,27,078/- All That Part And Parcel Of Residential/Commercial Property 28-Jun-24

Date
Place

:02/07/2024
: Indore

The borrower having failed to repay the amount, therefore notice is hereby given to the borrower and the public in general that the undersigned has taken possession
of the property described herein above mentioned table in exercise of powers conferred on him/her under section 13(4) of the said [Act 2002]
read with Rule 8 of the said rule on the date mentioned in the above table.

“The borrower’s attention is invited to provisions of sub section (8) of section 13 of the Act, in respect of time available, to redeem the secured assets.”
The borrower in particular and the publicin general is hereby cautioned not to deal with the property and any dealings with the property will be subject to
the charge of the AU Small Finance Bank Limited (A Scheduled Commercial Bank) forthe amount and interest thereon mentioned in the above table.

sd/-

Authorised Officer AU Small Finance Bank Limited
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