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T
he literature on the role of agri-
culture indevelopment con-
cludes that structural transfor-
mationof economy ismarked

bydecline in share of agriculture in eco-
nomy’s output andemployment as an
economygrows from low income towa-
rdsmiddle andhigher income.Based
on this, policy emphasis for growthand
development tilted towardsnon-agricu-
lture sectors, speciallymanufacturing.

The root of this line of thinking is
traced to theworkofBritishEconomist
ArthurLewis (1954),whodescribed eco-
nomicdevelopment as a growthprocess
of relocating resources fromagriculture,
characterisedby lowproductivity and
traditional technology, tomodern
industrial sectorwithhigher productiv-
ity. This theory assigns verypassive role
to agriculture in economicdevelopment
but it has beenwidelyusedbymany
developing countries to support indus-
trialisation. In thepost-Green
Revolutionperiod, someassumptions
of Lewismodel of developmenthave
been refuted. First, the green revolution
shows that technology canplay a signif-
icant role inmodernising agriculture
and in generationof surplus as visual-
ised for the Industry. Two, the assump-
tionof unlimited supply of labour in
agricultureholdsnomore. These
changeshave implications formodel
of economic transformation from
agrarian economy to industrialised
economy.

Recentexperience
Experience of last three-fourdecades in
case of developing aswell as fast-devel-
oping economies shows that theprocess
of shiftingworkforce out of agriculture
is very slowandnot smooth. Share of
agriculture in gross domestic product
(GDP) is found to followmuch faster
declinewhile employment share falls at
amuch smaller rate. This is demon-
stratedby the experience of large
number of countries at different stages
of economic transition anddevelop-
ment. For instance, during the three
decades between 1991 and2021, per cap-
itaGDP (measured in 2015 inUS$)
increasedbymore than 10 times in
China, 4.8 times inVietnam, 3.4 times
in India, and2.4 times in Indonesia.
However, this didnot lead towards con-
vergence in labourproductivity (gross
value-addedperworker) in agriculture
andnon-agriculture sectors. In the set
of these four emerging economies,
highest disparity inperworker produc-
tivity or incomebetweenagriculture
andnon-agriculture iswitnessed in
China,which experiencedveryhigh
growth inPCI (per capita income) and
output ofmanufacturing in the last
threedecades.Anagricultureworker in
China generatesmerely one-fourthof
the incomegeneratedbyanon-agricul-
turalworker. India andVietnamare
close toChinawhile Indonesia shows
lowerdisparity. It emerges from these
experiences that faster growth innon-
agriculture and so-calledmodern
industrial sector didnot lead to com-
mensurate shift inworkforce fromagri-
culture.As a result, share of agriculture
in employment remained stubbornly
higher than its share in output or
incomeof the economy—three times
inChina, two-and-half times in India
andVietnam, andmore than two times
in Indonesia.

Someother contradictionswith con-
ventionalmodel of structural transfor-

mationare:One, SouthAfrica, atmuch
higher level of per capita incomeand
development, shows thehighest dispar-
ity inperworker income in the list of
major countries studiedby the author.
Anagricultureworker there earns less
thanone-tenthofnon-agriculture
worker; and two, share of agriculture in
totalGDP shows increase in the recent
period in somecountries likeBrazil and
SouthAfrica, and for theworld as a
whole, after the global financial crisis
that beganaround2007.

It is evident that structural transfor-
mationof economy towardsmanufac-
turing andothernon-agricultural activ-
ities doesnot adequately addresswide
gaps inproductivity across sectors and
low income in agriculture. This is in
sharp contrast to theLewismodel and
theories of economicdevelopment
basedon thismodel. Theunderlying
reasonbeing inability ofmanufacturing
sector to create jobs at faster rate.

Povertyandother
developmentgoals
Strong empirical evidencepoints to cen-
trality of agriculture growth for poverty
reduction andoverall growth indevel-
oping countries. Analysis basedon
state-level data in case of India shows
that agriculturedevelopmentmeasured
byany indicators like landproductivity,
orworker productivity in agriculture,
has very strong impact on incidenceof

rural aswell as total poverty.
Thepathway to eradicate poverty

and raise incomeofmasses is through
remunerative employment.However,
employment is emerging as themost
serious challengeof our time.
Technological innovations of
various kinds like robotics,machine
learning, automation,AI etc. are favour-
ing capital-intensiveproduction in
somecases to thedetriment of deploy-
ment of labour.

Sustainability andclimate challenge
are emerging as serious threat to sur-
vival of people and theplanet.
Agriculture is amajor user of natural
resources.According to official sources,
80-90per cent of totalwater used in
India is used in agriculture.Global aver-
age is 70per cent. Stillmore than50per
cent areaunder cultivation iswithout
irrigation.Groundwater resources are
gettingdepleted in almost all the states
in the country.Almost half of the land
in India is for agricultureuses (arable
land). Therefore, thewayagriculture is
donedetermines quality of soil and
othernatural resources. Very less area is
available for ecological activities and
functions.Meeting land requirement
fornon-agricultural uses andaddress-
ing sustainable landusenecessitate
higher productivity in agriculture.

Agriculture’s share in globalGHG
(greenhouse gas) emission is reported to
bemuchhigher than its share in global
output and income. In India, agriculture
is responsible for 14per cent of total
GHGemissions, though the emissions
fromagricultural activities are generally
not visible. It is evident fromabove that
agriculture is central to climate change

andcleanair, and sustainableuse of
landandwater. Agriculture is bothpart
of theproblemandpart of the solution
to climate change and sustainability.
Amongall sectors, agriculture offers the
best hope for greengrowth that is envi-
ronmentally sustainable.

Healthandnutrition
Consumers are increasingly becoming
conscious about foodquality and show-
ingpreference for foodwith specific
attributes. The awareness of strong con-
nect between foodandhealth& immu-
nity is spreading. This requires integrat-
ingdemandwith supply through
well-designed supply chains anddirect
linkages betweenproducers andcon-
sumers.New interest has emerged in
the therapeutic values of foodand its
properusage inorder tomaintain over-
all immunity and for goodhealth.As a
result, thedemand formedicinal plants
andvarietieswith specific attributes is
on the rise. Someentrepreneurs are
connecting consumers andproducers
through innovative value chains for the
supply of suchproducts. Large-scale
supply of suchproductswill require the
creationof value chainswith traceabil-
ity and labelling.Overall, all these
changes in fooddemandbrings an
opportunity for anew typeof agricul-
ture,which canoffermore attractive
andmorepaying employmentwithin
the sector.

Agri-focusedinclusivedevelopment
Thepathway to eradicate poverty and
raise incomeofmasses is through
remunerative employment.However,
technological innovations are favouring
capital-intensiveproduction to the
detriment of deployment of human
labour in industry and services sec-
tors. As a result, it takes very long to
shiftworkforce out of agriculture.
Evenwith rapid growthof economy,
the share of agriculture in employ-
ment remainshighas seen from the
experience ofChina. This implies that
agriculturehas to continue as a source
ofmajor employment for long time
evenafter reachinghigh level of PCI.

This necessitates focusingonnew
activities in andaroundagriculture, and
making agri jobsmore remunerative
andattractive. Thiswill requiremod-
ernisationof agriculture fromseed to
sale andvery close linkagebetweenpro-
duction andend-use.On theproduction
side, this should includehigh-tech, high
productivity andknowledge- and skill-
intensive farming. Further, there is tre-
mendous scope for “on farmvalue
addition”. Consumerpreferences in
foodare shifting towards freshness,
quality, safety, andunique traits. Even
innon-food, choices are shifting
towards “bios” fromsynthetics and
chemical products. Awhole lot of farm-
level cottage industry canbedeveloped
toharness suchopportunities.

The second route for agriculture-led
economic transformation is possible
from innovations inbiotechnology.
Advances inplant biotechnology are
making it possible toproduce custom-
isedproducts tomeethealth, pharma-
ceuticals, andotherneeds. The counter
to adverse effect of digital technology
on jobs can come fromplant biotech-
nology that leads todevelopment of
cropswhich can serve as factories for
the synthesis of valuablemetabolites
andorganic compounds.

The context of economicdevelop-
menthas changedas employment, sus-
tainability, environment services, pov-
erty, nutrition, andhealthhavebecome
major concerns of our time. In this
changed context, agriculture is seen to
play amuch larger anddifferent role
thanperceived in thedominant think-
ing indevelopment economics.

(Theauthorismember,NationalInstitutionfor
TransformingIndia,NITIAayog.Views
expressedarepersonal)

Inthechangedcontextofeconomicdevelopment,agricultureisseenplayingamuch
largerrolethanperceivedinthedominantthinkingindevelopmenteconomics

REIMAGINING ROLE
OF AGRICULTURE
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