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29th September 2022 

 
BSE Limited, 

Phiroze Jeejeebhoy Towers, 

Dalal Street, 

Mumbai 400 001 

Scrip code: 532343 

National Stock Exchange of India Limited,  

Exchange Plaza, 5th Floor,  

Bandra-Kurla Complex, 

Bandra (E), Mumbai 400 051 

Scrip code: TVSMOTOR 

 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
Reg : Press Release - TVS Motor Company Signs MoU with The Foreign, 

Commonwealth And Development Office (FCDO) To Offer 
“Chevening TVS Motor Company Scholarships” 

 

 
We enclose a Press Release regarding “TVS Motor Company Signs MoU with The 

Foreign, Commonwealth And Development Office (FCDO) To Offer 

“Chevening TVS Motor Company Scholarships”, for dissemination. 

 
Thanking you, 
 
Yours truly, 
For TVS MOTOR COMPANY LIMITED 
 
 
 
K S Srinivasan 
Company Secretary 
 
Encl : a/a 
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TVS Motor Company Signs MoU With The Foreign, Commonwealth And 
Development Office (FCDO) To Offer “Chevening TVS Motor Company 

Scholarships” 

  
  
Hosur, September 29, 2022: TVS Motor Company, a reputed manufacturer of two-wheelers 
and three-wheelers in the world, today signed an MoU with The Foreign, Commonwealth and 
Development Office (FCDO) to offer “Chevening TVS Motor Company Scholarships.” 
  
The Chevening Programme is a prestigious scholarship programme that aims to attract and 
select students from around the world who demonstrate the greatest potential to become 
leaders, decision-makers, and opinion-formers in their own countries. This is the United 
Kingdom Government’s global scholarship programme, by which scholarships are awarded to 
those individuals with strong academic backgrounds who can also demonstrate their 
leadership potential. 
  
The Chevening Programme offers financial support to study at any of the United Kingdom’s 
universities and the opportunity to become part of an influential global network of 50,000 
alumni in over 160 countries and territories worldwide.  
  
Commenting on the announcement, Mr. Sudarshan Venu, MD, TVS Motor Company, 
said, “At TVS Motor Company it has always been our endeavour to create future leaders and 
support them in their journey. Our collaboration with the FCDO and the Government of United 
Kingdom is a testimony to this commitment. This partnership is a unqiue opportunity for the 
talented and dynamic minds in the country and we are excited to be a part of their growth. 
We look forward to more partnerships of this nature.” 
  
Mr Alex Ellis, The British High Commissioner to India, said, “I am delighted that TVS Motor 
Company is partnering with the Chevening Scholarship Programme; Chevening offers a 
unique, fully funded opportunity to experience the UK and study in some of the best 
institutions in the world. With TVS Motor Company’s support the Chevening programme in 
India, already the largest in the world, will get bigger still. The applications are now open 
[www.chevening.org] and I hope to see applicants from across India.” 
  
The Chevening TVS Motor Company Scholarships will be open to nationals of India, who are 
residents of India and are based in the country at the time of applying. The Scholarships 
programme will start in the UK academic year of 2023/24 (for which applications are currently 
open) and will continue in effect for a three-year period. A maximum of five Chevening TVS 



Motor Company Scholarships will be available under this Chevening Partnership for each 
academic year covered by this MOU.   
  
To apply for to this programme, applicants must demonstrate the potential to rise to positions 
of leadership and influence. The candidates will need to demonstrate the personal, 
intellectual, and interpersonal attributes reflecting this potential.   
  
About TVS Motor Company 
 
TVS Motor Company is a reputed two and three-wheeler manufacturer globally, championing 
progress through Sustainable Mobility with four state-of-the-art manufacturing facilities in 
Hosur, Mysuru and Nalagarh in India and Karawang in Indonesia. Rooted in our 100-year 
legacy of Trust, Value, and Passion for Customers and Exactness, we take pride in making 
internationally aspirational products of the highest quality through innovative and 
sustainable processes. We are the only two-wheeler company to have received the 
prestigious Deming Prize. Our products lead in their respective categories in the J.D. Power 
IQS and APEAL surveys.  We have been ranked No. 1 Company in the J.D. Power Customer 
Service Satisfaction Survey for consecutive four years. Our group company Norton 
Motorcycles, based in the United Kingdom, is one of the most emotive motorcycle brands in 
the world. Our subsidiaries in the personal e-mobility space, Swiss E-Mobility Group (SEMG) 
and EGO Movement have a leading position in the e-bike market in Switzerland. TVS Motor 
Company endeavours to deliver the most superior customer experience across 80 countries 
in which we operate. For more information, please visit www.tvsmotor.com  
 
 

About The Chevening Programme 
  

Chevening is the UK Government’s international awards scheme aimed at developing global 
leaders since 1983. Funded by the Foreign Commonwealth and Development Office (FCDO) 
and partner organizations, Chevening offers two types of awards – Chevening Scholarships 
and Chevening Fellowships – the recipients of which are personally selected by British 
Embassies and High Commissions throughout the world. Chevening India programme is the 
largest in the world offering up to 100 fully paid awards every year. 160 countries offer 
Chevening with 50000 alumni in the world. There are over 3600 Chevening alumni in India. 
One year Master’s scholarships are given to outstanding Indian graduates with a minimum of 
two years’ work experience to study any subject of their choice at any recognized UK 
University. 
  
For more information, please contact: 

Ks.harini@tvsmotor.com 

Priyanka.kumar@tvsmotor.com 
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