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sPRESS RELEASE 
 

Infosys Collaborates with Motherhood Hospitals to Foster Learning in Healthcare 
through Infosys Springboard 

This first-of-its-kind collaboration will democratize education in healthcare for school students, 

graduates, and lifelong learners 

 
Bengaluru, India – March 1, 2023: Infosys (NSE, BSE, NYSE: INFY), a global leader in next-generation 

digital services and consulting, today announced that it has signed an MoU with Motherhood Hospitals, a 

specialty hospital chain providing women and child-care, to digitally upskill learners in the healthcare sector 

through Infosys Springboard. This first-of-its-kind collaboration will democratize healthcare education for 

school students, graduates, and lifelong learners, giving them access to masterclasses in health-related 

topics. 
  
Furthermore, Infosys Springboard will empower learners to develop a deep understanding of the healthcare 

industry through free interactive sessions with healthcare experts. Additionally, masterclasses on health-

related themes will be held for learners registered on Infosys Springboard. The initiative will aim to educate 

them while opening new avenues for people looking to pursue careers in the sector. This collaboration will 

also enable nurses, customer care executives and the administrative staff at companies under Motherhood 

Hospitals to benefit from a comprehensive learning and development program. 
  
Congruent with its ESG Vision 2030, Infosys aims to enable digital skills at scale and empower over 10 

million people in India by 2025 through the Infosys Springboard program. Infosys Springboard continues to 

expand its reach to learners by growing its thriving community to more than 5 million registered users in 

India, since its launch.  
  
Shedding light on the idea behind this initiative, Thirumala Arohi, Senior Vice President and Head – 
Education, Training and Assessment, Infosys, said, “Infosys’ collaboration with Motherhood Hospitals 

strengthens its long-established commitment towards democratizing knowledge and learning for lifelong 

learners. The success of the Infosys Springboard program has been elevated with this collaboration, which 

offers young, ardent learners the opportunity to scale up their knowledge of healthcare, harness career 

opportunities and monetize their passion for this rapidly growing industry.” 
  
Mr. Vijayarathna Venkatraman, CEO, Motherhood Hospitals, said,  “Our association with Infosys 

Springboard strengthens our commitment towards continuous learning and growth of talent within the 

Motherhood Hospitals network. We are certain, that through this strategic collaboration, we can enhance 

their knowledge and equip them with skills to make better impact in the healthcare service industry.” 

https://www.infosys.com/
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.motherhoodindia.com%2F&data=05%7C01%7Cvishwa.desai%40infosys.com%7C717b62ebbdef44811c8608db1874d759%7C63ce7d592f3e42cda8ccbe764cff5eb6%7C0%7C0%7C638130662326675363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=mvrfAfA2VKVL%2FD7VP6S4lvmKXCquBwicO9uuFaM5xC0%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Finfyspringboard.onwingspan.com%2Fweb%2Fen%2Flogin&data=05%7C01%7Cvishwa.desai%40infosys.com%7C717b62ebbdef44811c8608db1874d759%7C63ce7d592f3e42cda8ccbe764cff5eb6%7C0%7C0%7C638130662326675363%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=bl7LPFjPicIIbjllOvNCtWNt5OQiVPN%2FeoN1enykBZw%3D&reserved=0
https://www.infosys.com/content/dam/infosys-web/en/about/corporate-responsibility/esg-vision-2030/index.html


 
 

 

About Infosys 
Infosys is a global leader in next-generation digital services and consulting. Over 300,000 of our people 
work to amplify human potential and create the next opportunity for people, businesses and communities. 
With over four decades of experience in managing the systems and workings of global enterprises, we 
expertly steer clients, in more than 50 countries, as they navigate their digital transformation powered by 
the cloud. We enable them with an AI-powered core, empower the business with agile digital at scale and 
drive continuous improvement with always-on learning through the transfer of digital skills, expertise, and 
ideas from our innovation ecosystem. We are deeply committed to being a well-governed, environmentally 
sustainable organization where diverse talent thrives in an inclusive workplace. 
 
Visit www.infosys.com to see how Infosys (NSE, BSE, NYSE: INFY) can help your enterprise navigate your 
next. 
 
  
Safe Harbor 
Certain statements in this release concerning our future growth prospects, financial expectations and plans 
for navigating the COVID-19 impact on our employees, clients and stakeholders are forward-looking 
statements intended to qualify for the 'safe harbor' under the Private Securities Litigation Reform Act of 
1995, which involve a number of risks and uncertainties that could cause actual results to differ materially 
from those in such forward-looking statements. The risks and uncertainties relating to these statements 
include, but are not limited to, risks and uncertainties regarding COVID-19 and the effects of government 
and other measures seeking to contain its spread, risks related to an economic downturn or recession in 
India, the United States and other countries around the world, changes in political, business, and economic 
conditions, fluctuations in earnings, fluctuations in foreign exchange rates, our ability to manage growth, 
intense competition in IT services including those factors which may affect our cost advantage, wage 
increases in India and the US, our ability to attract and retain highly skilled professionals, time and cost 
overruns on fixed-price, fixed-time frame contracts, client concentration, restrictions on immigration, 
industry segment concentration, our ability to manage our international operations, reduced demand for 
technology in our key focus areas, disruptions in telecommunication networks or system failures, our ability 
to successfully complete and integrate potential acquisitions, liability for damages on our service contracts, 
the success of the companies in which Infosys has made strategic investments, withdrawal or expiration of 
governmental fiscal incentives, political instability and regional conflicts, legal restrictions on raising capital 
or acquiring companies outside India, unauthorized use of our intellectual property and general economic 
conditions affecting our industry and the outcome of pending litigation and government investigation. 
Additional risks that could affect our future operating results are more fully described in our United States 
Securities and Exchange Commission filings including our Annual Report on Form 20-F for the fiscal year 
ended March 31, 2022. These filings are available at www.sec.gov. Infosys may, from time to time, make 
additional written and oral forward-looking statements, including statements contained in the Company's 
filings with the Securities and Exchange Commission and our reports to shareholders. The Company does 
not undertake to update any forward-looking statements that may be made from time to time by or on behalf 
of the Company unless it is required by law. 
 
  
Media contacts: 
For more information, please contact: PR_India@Infosys.com 
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