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Married man abandons infant born from relationship with Class 11 girl
VADODARA: This infant girl

got a new lease of life when
villagers and police rescued
the newborn near a canal in
Chhota Udepur district village.
But the little baby girl, born
out of an il legit imate
relationship, still faces an
uncertain future.

Investigation revealed that
the infant’s father, a married
man, had abandoned her at a
canal near Tarapur village last
week. The man had a
relationship with a class XI girl
who gave birth to the girl last
week.

However, neither the
father identified as Arvind
Rathwa nor the girl and or her
family want to take the
responsibility of bringing up
this infant.

The infant’s father is now
booked for abandoning her
and raping her mother at
Jetpur and Chhota Udepur
police stations respectively.

While the person who had
abandoned the girl remained
unidentified initially, police
traced her father Rathwa who
had left her there. Rathwa has

not been arrested yet.
After a week-long probe

when cops reached the girl’s
house, it came to light that
Rathwa had taken the infant
girl away after a long

altercation between him and
the girl’s parents. “The mother
herself is a minor girl, so her
parents did not want to keep
the child and they asked
Rathwa to take the baby girl
away. Rathwa initially refused
saying that he is married and
has his own child, but when
he was threatened of dire
consequences, he took the girl
and left her near the canal,”
said a police official.

On questioning the school
student’s parents, police learnt
that she and Rathwa had

developed feelings for each
other while travelling daily in
auto-rickshaw. The duo then
had physical relationship due
to which the girl got pregnant,
but she did not tell her parents

immediately.
“Her parents are claiming

that she had informed Rathwa
that she had missed menstrual
cycles but he did not pay much
heed. Her parents final ly

learnt noticing the physical
changes in the girl’s body,” the
police official said. He added
that since the girl is minor
aged, the rape case has been
registered.

New Delhi: The white water
rafting expedition christened as
‘Rudrashila’ undertaken by
Kalidhar Battalion was flagged in
by Lieutenant General VS
Sreenivas, General Officer
Commanding Konark Corps on
25 October 2019 at Jodhpur
Military Station.

The white water rafting
expedition was organized by
Kalidhar Battalion  to
commemorate its 75th Raising
Day. The team comprising of two
officers, four Junior
Commissioned Officers and 18
Soldiers led by Major Ravikant
Gaurav covered a total distance

White water rafting expedition –
Rudrashila’ flagging in at Jodhpur

of over 140km from Rudraprayag
to Rishikesh in the mighty
Ganges River in the mountains
of Uttarakhand.

Lieutenant General VS
Sreenivas, expressed that such
expeditions in our Army are
carried out to prepare the
soldiers to overcome adversities
with determination and grit. It
also helps to promote spirit-de-
corps and courage amongst the
soldiers. The team also spread
awareness among locals on
current social issues of ‘Swachh
Bharat Campaign’ and
‘Preservation of River Eco-
Systems’.

M/S HCP Design, Planning & Management
Pvt. Ltd Awarded Consultancy Work

New Delhi: CPWD has
awarded the consultancy work
to M/s HCP Design, Planning &
Management Pvt. Ltd. on
18.10.2019 and now the firm is
on board for development of the
Master Plan of Central Vista area
and design of buildings as per
new requirements.The Govt. has
set stringent timelines to
complete the development/
redevelopment of Parliament
building, Common Central
Secretariat and Central Vista.
While the timelines given to
CPWD to complete the Central
Vista project is November, 2021,
the work on Parliament building
is to be completed by March,
2022 and the common Central
Secretariat by March 2024.

With an aim of improving the
old buildings on Raisina Hills,
make improved Common
Secretariat Buildings, refurbish
old Parliament building, make
new space for new requirement
of MPs and upgrade the entire
Central Vista area by revisiting
entire Master Plan, a world class
Consultant was required.The
process of selection of
Consultant was started on
02.09.2019 when a Notice
Inviting Bid was issued by
CPWD.To meet the objective of
selection of a reputed consultant,
a system of QCBS (80 : 20) has
been adopted.  The sanction
towards cost of consultancy has
been issued for Rs. 229.75 Cr.
As per the RFP, a pre-bid
conference meeting was also
held on 12.09.2019 where 24
bidders participated. The issues
raised in the meeting were
addressed.  The Technical Bids
were opened on 30.09.2019. A
total of six bids were received.
After examining the initial
eligibil ity and technical
parameters, all bidders were
asked to make their presentation
on 11.10.2019 on Approach and
Methodology before a Jury
consisting of reputed Architects
and Landscape Designer under
the chairmanship of Prof P.S.N
Rao, Director, School of Planning
& Architecture(SPA), Delhi and
chairman Delhi Urban Art

Commission(DUAC). Four
Bidders were formally selected
for opening of financial bid,
which was opened on
12.10.2019.  After assigning the
weightage of 80% to technical
i.e. quality aspect and 20% to
financial, M/s HCP Design,
Planning & Management Pvt.
Ltd. have emerged the highest
scores.  They are one of the
leading architect firms in India,
having vast experience of
designing various buildings and
spaces like Central Vista and
State Secretariat at
Gandhinagar; Sabarmati River
Front Development,
Ahmedabad; Mumbai Port
Complex;Redevelopment of
Temple Complex, Varanasi; New
Campus, IIM Ahmedabad and
CII-SN Centre of Excellence
Kolkata etc. They have designed
some projects outside India also.
After the Master Plan is prepared
the steps would be taken to
execute the works by CPWD by
awarding the works to reputed
eligible contractors.

The buildings on Raisina Hills
were constructed in the period
from 1911 to 1931, designed by
Sir Edwin Lutyen and Sir Herbert
Baker.  At that time, also these
were designed to have office for
viceroy & Secretariat.  The
Parliament building was
constructed in the same period.
Various buildings along Rajpath
have been constructed at
different stages for
accommodating offices of
various Central Govt. Ministries
and Departments. The Central
Vista starting from Rashtrapati
Bhawan upto India Gate is the
heart of city which has been
point of attraction for visitors
from all over the world.

Over a period of above 100
years after the conceptualisation
of building on Raisina Hill and
adjoining to Rajpath, the
requirement has now increased
manifold.  These buildings
designed earlier are not now able
to provide enough space,
amenities and comfort
requirement.  The requirement
of safety standards have also got

improved.  In terms of offices,
now more space is required to
accommodate all Central Govt.
offices at nearby area.  Due to
delimitation, more Nos. of MPs
may be there in future and hence
more space is required for them.
Even for present MPs, the space
and amenities required is quite
insufficient in Parliament
House.Lots of visitors come to
Central Vista from India & abroad
and there is an imperative need
to improve the beauty of Central
Vista to make it a world  class
tourist attraction point.

Health Ministry to observe Vigilance Awareness
Week from 28th October to 2nd November, 2019

New Delhi: The Ministry of
Health and Family Welfare will
observe the Vigilance Awareness
Week from 28th October to 2nd
November, 2019 as per
directions of Central Vigilance
Commission (CVC), Government
of India. The theme of the
vigilance awareness this year is
“Integrity- a way of life”.
Vigilance Awareness Week will
commence with the
administration of ‘Integrity
Pledge’ to the officers/staff of the
Ministry by the Union Minister for
Health and Family Welfare, to
fight against corruption and
commit to highest standards of
honesty and integrity. It is also
proposed to award prizes to
winners of the competitions to
be conducted by this Ministry.

The Central Vigi lance
Commission aims to promote
integrity, transparency and
accountability in public life. As
part of its efforts to promote

probity in public life and to
achieve a corruption free society,
CVC observes Vigilance
Awareness Week every year. The
observation of Vigilance
Awareness Week creates greater
awareness among public and
encourages all the stakeholders
to collectively participate in
prevention of and fight against
corruption.

During the week-long
Vigilance Awareness campaign,
various activities like public
interaction for redressal of their
grievances, usage of generic
medicines, surprise inspections,
conducting seminars, workshops,
debates among students, faculty,
children of staff/ officers, poster
competitions, essay writing, quiz,
painting competitions inculcating
moral/ethical values, and other
vigilance related awareness
activities will be carried out in
sync with the theme of the
year 2019.

Shipping Ministry Observes Swachhta
Hi Sewa & Swachhta Pakhwada

New Delhi: Ministry of
Shipping observed the Swachhta
Pakhwada from 16th to 30th
September 2019. This followed
launch of ‘Swachhta Hi Sewa’
campaign by Prime Minister Shri
Narendra Modi from 11th
September 2019 to celebrate the
150th birth anniversary of
Mahatma Gandhi in a grand way.

Shri. Mansukh Mandaviya,
Union Minister of State for
Shipping (I/C) planted saplings
in Cochin Port Trust, Mormugao
Port Trust and Paradip Port Trust
during the Swachhta Pakhwada
2019.

All the Major Ports and
organizations of the Ministry of
Shipping participated
enthusiastically in the campaign
and organized a host of activities
to make this campaign a grand
success.

The campaigns run by the
major ports and organizations
included cleaning of office/
residential premises, swachhta
awareness campaigns,
cleanliness drives and
Shramdaan. Various activities
like pledge ceremonies, street
plays and walkathons were
organized during the period.
Numerous competitions like
elocution, drawing, slogan and
wall painting were also organized
by Ports and Organizations.
Swachhta message
dissemination was done through
display of banners, posters with
swachhta slogans and pamphlets
distribution to local public. Tree
plantation, beautification drives
and solid & electronic waste
management were also
undertaken at all Ports and other
Organizations.

Shri. Mansukh Mandaviya,
MoS (I/C) Shipping
administering Swachhta Pledge
to the Cochin Port officers,
employees, students and
teachers of Kendriya Vidyalaya
Port Trust.(20.09.2019)

 The fortnight long campaign
also saw the advent of new ideas
such as: Pledge Ceremony
(Swachhta Shapath) paperless
for the first time in Shipping
Corporation of India Ltd.

Zero water leakage drive by
Shipping Corporation of India
Ltd.

Distribution of cloth bags/
eco friendly cotton bags/ jute
bags to employees, shopkeepers
and public by Mormugao Port
Trust, Shipping Corporation of
India Ltd., Kamarajar Port
Limited, Paradip Port Trust and
V.O. Chidambaranar Port Trust
and Haldia Dock Complex.

Rain water harvesting
projects and water recycling
schemes to prevent wastage of
water initiated by Kolkata Port
Trust.

Water ATMs being set up by
Kolkata Port Trust.

New public toilet complexes
were build as a part of the
Swachhta campaign by port and
stakeholders by Kolkata Port
Trust.

Extensive beach cleaning
drives by V.O. Chidambaranar
Port Trust.

Visakhapatnam Port Trust
inaugurated 25 KLD Sewage
Treatment plant at Port Hospital.

Cochin Port Trust organized
a cycle rally with the motto “Burn
Carbohydrates not
Hydrocarbon”. Cochin Port Trust
collected 200 kg of plastics which
will be utilized for road tarring
within the port area. Plogging
activity to collect plastic waste
from various roads in the Port
area was also conducted on 2nd
October, 2019 by Cochin Port
Trust. Cochin Shipyard Limited,
Dredging Corporation of India
Ltd. and Chennai Port Trust
organized awareness class on
plastic waste management and
effective ban on Single USE
Plastic (SUP) for school children.

Directorate of Lighthouses
and Lightships distributed
sanitary pads in Rajagiya Kanya
College, Noida and V.O.
Chidambaranar Port Trust
distributed the sanitary pads to

the colony and nearby
community

Deendayal Port Trust has
signed an MoU recently at the
cost of about 3 crores, with State
Forest Department, Gujarat to
develop greenbelt with the
survival condition of 80% plants
at suitable sites of Deendayal
Port Trust and its surrounding
areas covering 31.942 hectares.

Deendaya l  Por t  Trust
organized a short play on the
topic “Kachro –Ke-Khiladi”
which was staged by Navjyoti
Charitable Trust in order to
spread awareness to not to
use Single Use Plastic and
mainta in  c lean l iness .
Jawaharlal Nehru Port Trust
organ ized an awareness
program for women health.
Kamarajar Port Trust planted
around 500 saplings. Mumbai
Port Trust, Mormugao Port
Trust and Indian Maritime
University also organized a
massive tree plantation drive.

Kamarajar Port Trust installed
a RO water plant in the kitchen
of the School to provide safe
drinking water to the school
children. Kamarajar Port Trust
organized a “Medical camp” for
employees, Port users, BOT
operators, stakeholders &
Contractors Workers.

New Delhi to Host First “Global Bio-India
2019” Summit from 21st - 23rd November

New Delhi : The Global Bio-
India 2019, one of the largest
biotechnology stakeholders
conglomeratewill be held for the
first time in India at New Delhi
from 21st to 23rd November,
2019. Announcing this at a
Curtain Raiser in Delhi today, the
Union Minister for Science &
Technology, Earth Sciences and
Health & Family Welfare, Dr.
Harsh Vardhan said“India for the
first time is hosting a mega event
for the biotech community to
attract investments, showcase
our indigenous strengths and
more importantly fuel the hopes
and aspirations of the indigenous
talent pool”.

Speaking on the occasion, Dr
Harsh Vardhan expressed India’s
continued commitment in
scientific research, its translation
and commercialization and laid
emphasis on how this event
would be a huge opportunity to
showcase India’s strength and
build new partnerships and
investment opportunities.

Echoing similar sentiments,
Secretary, Department of
Biotechnology (DBT),
Dr.RenuSwarup stated "Biotech
is one of the identified champion
sectors in the Make in India 2.0.
Our ambition for the event is to
showcase the strength in the

sector and let the world know
India is the destination to invest”.

A brochure of GlobalBio-
India2019 was also released at
the Curtain Raiser.

The DBT, Ministry of Science
& Technology, Government of
India along with its Public Sector
Undertaking, Biotechnology
Industry Research Assistance
Council (BIRAC) is organizing
this event.

The event has been
structured to bring together
stakeholders from 30 countries,
250 start-ups, 200 exhibitors.
Central and State ministries,
regulatory bodies, investors,
totalling to 3500 participants is
anticipated.

The event is expected to
strengthen the indigenous
research capabilities, bio-
entrepreneurship, investments
and last-mile-delivery of
technology across rural India and
tier-2, 3 cities.

It is noteworthy to point that
Biotechnology is recognized as
the key driver for contributing to
India’s USD 5Tn economy target
and is identified as one of the
thrust areas for driving GDP
growth of our country. India is
positioned today at about
USD51bn and is marching
towards USD150bn.
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Mðkr{™khkÞý ‚t«ËkÞ{kt ‚ki «Úk{
51 Vqx Ÿ[e ð[™k{]Œ™e «rŒf]rŒ

™rzÞkË,  ÞkºkkÄk{ ðzŒk÷{kt
fkrŒofe ‚{iÞk-ð[™k{]Œ {nkuí‚ð™e
Wsðýe  r™r{Œu ¼ÔÞkrŒ ¼ÔÞ Äkr{of
fkÞo¢{ku Þkuòþu. yk ÞkºkkÄk{{kt
Mðkr{™khkÞý ‚t«ËkÞ{kt ‚ki «Úk{
51 Vqx Ÿ[e rðhkx ð[™k{]Œ™e
«rŒf]rŒ W¼e fhkR Au. fkrŒofe
‚{iÞk™k «Úk{ rËð‚u ‚ðkhu 9 f÷kfu
…q. yk[kÞo hkfuþ«‚kËS {nkhks™k
nMŒu yk «rŒf]rŒ™u ¾wÕ÷e {qfkþu.
{nkuí‚ð Ëhr{Þk™ Ëhhkus 200 {ý
{kuŒeÚke rðhkx ð[™k{]Œ f]rŒ™wt ‚tŒku
ŒÚkk ¼fŒku ðÄk{ýk fhþu. fkhŒf
‚wË nrh ™ku{Úke fkrŒofe …qrýo{k ‚wÄe
ð[™k{]Œ rîþŒkçËe {nkuí‚ð
‚t«ËkÞ{kt ™ ¼qŒku ™ ¼rð»ÞrŒ ‚{k
Wsððk™ku Au. yk {nkuí‚ð{kt y™uf
‚k{krsf, Äkr{of Œu{s ‚uðkfeÞ
«ð]rŒyku Úk™kh Au. ðzŒk÷ {trËh™k
sq™k ƒ‚ zu…ku™e søÞkyu …1 Vqx W[wt
rðhkx ð[™k{]Œ «rŒf]rŒ™wt Œk.
6êe™k hkus ‚ðkhu 9 f÷kfu yk[kÞo
©e hkfuþ«‚kËS {nkhks ŒÚkk

‚t«ËkÞ™k ðze÷ ‚tŒku™k ðhË nMŒu
WÆ½kx™ Úkþu. ¼„ðk™ ©e nrh™e
…hkðkýe yux÷u ð[™k{]Œ. ð[™k{]Œ
yu ©e nrh™wt MðY… {k™e {nkuí‚ð
…ÞOŒ hkus ‚ðkhu 6.30Úke 8 ŒÚkk
‚ktsu 7Úke 8 Ëhr{Þk™ {nk…qs™
Úkþu. 108 ¼fŒku îkhk 108 f÷kf™wt
…qs™ Úkþu. ð[™k{]Œ™wt …È„k™ Úkþu
y™u fzeyu fzeyu Þ¿knku{ y™u hk‚
Úkþu. ‚tŒku y™u ¼fŒku îkhk y¾tz
«Ërþûkýk y™u ËtzðŒ Úkþu. ËtzðŒ
[k÷w hnuþu. 100-100 nrh¼fŒku™k
„]…{kt …-… r{r™x ðkhkVhŒe …qs™
‚kÚku ‚{qn ykhŒe Úkþu.

ð[™k{]Œ™e ô[kR …1 Vqx Au.
18 Vqx™e …eXefk (Ã÷uxVku{o) ‚kÚku 69
Vqx ô[kR ÚkkÞ Au y™u sÞkhu Œu™e
…nku¤kR 80 Vqx Au. h000 Þs{k™ku
îkhk ð[™k{]Œ …kuÚke …qs™ Úkþu.
ð[™k{]Œ Þ¿k …ý Þkuòþu. y™u h00
{ý {kuŒe™e {k¤kÚke rðhkx
ð[™k{]Œ™wt …qs™ fhðk{kt ykðþu.
yk rðhkx ð[™k{]Œ™wt …qs™ ytËksu

…00 {ý …qs™‚k{„úeÚke Úkþu.
ytËksu 1h00 ‚tŒku y™u 1… ÷k¾Úke
ðÄw Ëuþ-rðËuþ™k nrh¼fŒku™e
W…rMÚkrŒ{kt f÷kí{f …eXefk W…h
ftzkhkÞu÷k …1 Vqx ô[k ð[™k{]Œ
„útÚk™wt ht„ƒuht„e h00 {ý {kuŒe™e
{k¤kykuÚke …qs™ yr¼»kuf Úkþu. su™wt
÷kRð «‚khý …ý fhðk{kt ykðþu.
ð[™k{]Œ yu ©enrh™e …hkðkýe
yÚkkoŒ MðÞtðkýe MðY…u Au yux÷u fu
ð[™k{]Œ yu ¼„ðk™™wt MðY… Au.
suÚke yk …rðºk y™u «‚kËe™k „útÚk
…h {kuŒe ðzu …qs™ yr¼»kuf Úkþu. yk
rðhkx MðY… ð[™k{]Œ MÚkk…™k™u
‚whŒ „wYfw¤™k …q.ïuŒMðk{e ŒÚkk
rððufMðk{e yk¾he yku… yk…e hÌkk
Au. fkrŒofe ‚{iÞk™k «Úk{ rËð‚u
‚ðkhu 9 f÷kfu …q. yk[kÞo
hkfuþ«‚kËS {nkhks™k nMŒu yk
«rŒf]rŒ™u ¾wÕ÷e {qfkþu. {nkuí‚ð
Ëhr{Þk™ Ëhhkus 200 {ý {kuŒeÚke
rðhkx ð[™k{]Œ f]rŒ™wt ‚tŒku ŒÚkk
¼fŒku ðÄk{ýk fhþu.  108 ¼fŒku
îkhk 108 f÷kf™w t …qs™ Úkþu.
ð[™k{]Œ™wt …È„k™ Úkþu y™u fzeyu
fzeyu Þ¿knku{ y™u hk‚ Úkþu. fkrŒofe
‚{iÞk™k «Úk{ rËð‚u ‚ðkhu 9 f÷kfu
… q. yk[kÞo hkf uþ«‚kËS
{nkhks™k nMŒu yk «rŒf]rŒ™u
¾wÕ÷e {qfkþu. {nkuí‚ð Ëhr{Þk™
Ëhhkus 200 {ý {kuŒeÚke rðhkx
ð[™k{]Œ f]rŒ™wt ‚tŒku ŒÚkk ¼fŒku
ðÄk{ýk fhþu. fkhŒf ‚wË nrh
™k u{Úke fkrŒofe …qrýo{k ‚wÄe
ð[™k{]Œ rîþŒkçËe {nk uí‚ð
‚t«ËkÞ{kt ™ ¼qŒku ™ ¼rð»ÞrŒ ‚{k
Wsððk™ku Au. yk {nkuí‚ð{kt y™uf
‚k{krsf, Äkr{of Œu{s ‚uðkfeÞ
«ð]rŒyku Úk™kh Au.

LÞw rËÕne: fuLÿeÞ «Äk™ ™erŒ™
„zfheyu sýkÔÞwt nŒwt fu xku÷ ™kfk
…h xÙkrVf ò{ ™ ÚkkÞ yu {kxu
R÷uõxÙkur™f xku÷ f÷ufþ™ fkÞo¢{
suðe Þkus™k™e {ËËÚke ykðŒk …kt[
ð»ko{kt ¼khŒ™e xku÷™e ðkŠ»kf ykðf
ðÄe™u yuf ÷k¾ fhkuz Yr…Þk™e Úkþu.

„zfheyu sýkÔÞw t  nŒw t  f u
yu™yu[yuykR nuX¤ 1.4 ÷k¾ rf.
{e. nkRðu{ktÚke 24,996 rf.{e.
nkRðu …h xku÷ ð‚q÷ðk{kt ykðu Au
y™u ð»kkOŒ ‚wÄe{kt yu™e ÷tƒkR
ðÄe™u 27000 rf.{e. ÚkR sþu.
1÷e ™ðuBƒh, 2019Úke xku÷™wt
…u{uLx VõŒ ™uþ™÷ R÷uõxÙkur™f xku÷
f÷ufþ™ (yu™Rxe‚e) fkÞo¢{ nuX¤
VõŒ VkMxu„ îkhk s Úkþu. ð™ ™uþ™,
ð™ xu„- VkMxu„-ykÄkh Vkuh y
ÂÔnf÷™k rð»kÞ …h ykÞkursŒ
ƒuXf™e ‚kRz÷kR™{kt yu{ýu

ykðŒkt …kt[ ð»ko{kt xku÷™e ykðf ðÄe™u
yuf ÷k¾ fhkuz Yr…Þk™e Úkþu: „zfhe

…ºkfkhku™u yk…u÷e {krnŒe «{kýu
yk…ýe xku÷™e ykðf Y. 30,000
fhkuz «rŒ ð»ko™e Au. y{u ðÄw
hMŒkyku ƒktÄe hÌkk Aeyu. yuf
ytËks «{kýu ykðŒkt …kt[ ð»ko{kt
xku÷™e ykðf Ëh ð»kuo yuf ÷k¾ fhkuz
Yr…Þk™e Úkþu. òu ykx÷e ykðf
ÚkŒe hnuþu Œku ƒìtfku{ktÚke ÷kì™ {¤þu,
ƒòh{ktÚke ðÄw ™kýkt W…kze™u ðÄw
Þkus™k{kt hkufký fhe þfeþwt.

rh‚kuŠ‚‚™e fkuR f{e ™Úke y™u
yu™yu[yuykR™e 75 xfk
Þkus™kyku {kxu ƒìtfku ÷kì™ yk…e þfu
yu{ Au. fu‚÷u‚ r‚Mx{™u ÷eÄu VõŒ
‚{Þ s ™nª ƒ[u, …ý yu ‚kÚku
÷kufku™k ðkn™™wt ƒ¤Œý ƒ[þu y™u
yu heŒu Sze…e™e ð]rØ{kt …ý {ËË
Úkþu. yk «‚t„u yu{ýu VkMxu„ {kxu
r«…uRz yu™yu[yuykR ðu÷ux™wt …ý
Wjkx™ fÞwO nŒwt.

©eLkøkh: sB{w-fk~{eh{ktÚke
f÷{ 370 nxkððk{kt ykÔÞk™kt
70Úke ðÄkhu rËð‚ ðeŒe [wõâk Au.
yk Ëhr{Þk™ íÞkt rðhkuÄ «Ëþo™ …ý
òuðk {¤e hÌkk Au. Œku rðhkuÄ «Ëþo™
Ëhr{Þk™ …qðo {wÏÞ{tºke VkY¾
yçËwÕ÷k™e ƒnu™ y™u Ëefhe™e
Äh…fz fhðk{k t ykðe Au.
©e™„h{kt yksu yux÷u f u
{t„¤ðkh™kt r‚rð÷ ‚ku‚kÞxeyu
rðhkuÄ «Ëþo™ fÞkuo. ÷k÷ [kuf …h
½ýe fk~{ehe {rn÷kykuyu 370™u
nxkðk™ku rðhkuÄ fÞkuo.

yk rðhk uÄ «Ëþo™{k t … qð o
{wÏÞ{tºke VkY¾ yçËwÕ÷k™e ƒnu™
y™u Ëefhe …ý ‚k{u÷ nŒk. rðhkuÄ
«Ëþo™ fhe hnu÷e {rn÷kyku™u
…ku÷e‚u fMxze{kt ÷eÄe Au. fMxze{kt

f÷{-370Lkku rðhkuÄ fhe hnu÷ VkÁf
yçËwÕ÷kLkk çknuLk-ÃkwºkeLke yxfkÞík

÷uðk{kt ykðu÷e {rn÷kyku{kt VkYf
yçËwÕ÷k™e ƒnu™ y™u Ëefhe …ý
‚k{u÷ Au. sB{w-fk~{eh™kt …qðo
{wÏÞ{tºke y™u ™uþ™÷ fkìLVhL‚™kt
[eV VkYf yçËwÕ÷k™e Ëefhe ‚krVÞk
y™u ƒnu™ ‚whiÞk™u …ku÷e‚u fMxze{kt
÷eÄk Au.

WÕ÷u¾™eÞ Au fu 5 ykì„ü™kt
ßÞkhu fuLÿ ‚hfkhu f÷{ 370™e
òu„ðkEyku{kt ƒË÷kð fhŒk sB{w-
fk~{eh™u ƒu fuLÿþkr‚Œ «Ëuþ{kt
ƒËÕÞwt Œu …nu÷kÚke VkYf yçËwÕ÷k
fMxze{kt Au. Œuyku™u Œu{™k ½h{kt
™shfuË hk¾ðk{kt ykÔÞk Au. VkYf
yçËwÕ÷k™e ‚kÚku Œu{™k Ëefhk W{h
yçËwÕ÷k y™u sB{w-fk~{eh™e …qðo
{wÏÞ{tºke {nuƒqƒk {w^Œe …ý
™shfuË Au.

Wå[MíkhLke xufLkku÷kuS{kt ¼khíkLke
ÂMÚkrík Ëw:¾Ë hne Au: ySík zku¼k÷

LÞw rËÕne: hküÙeÞ ‚whûkk
‚÷knfkh (NSA)ySŒ zku¼k÷
y™u yk{eo [eV s™h÷ rƒr…™
hkðŒu {t„¤ðkh™k zeykhzeyku™e
41{e fk uLVhL‚ Ëhr{Þk™
xuõ™ku÷kuS y™u ‚whûkk rðþu ðkŒ
fhe. ySŒ zku¼k÷u fÌšt fu Ëwr™Þk™k
y{wf yuðk Ëuþ hÌkk Au su{™e …k‚u
Wå[ MŒh™e x uõ™k u÷k uS nŒe.
¼khŒ™e yk {k{÷u ÂMÚkrŒ Ëw¾Ë hne
Au. yk{eo [eVu fÌšt- ¼khŒ ykð™khe
÷zkE MðËuþe nrÚkÞkhk u y™u
xuõ™ku÷kuSÚke ÷zþu y™u {™u ¼hku‚ku
Au fu yk…ýe SŒeþwt.

zk u¼k÷u fÌš t- xuõ™ku÷k uS™k
{k{÷k{kt yk…ýu nt{uþk W…rðsuŒk
s hÌkk Aeyu. W…rðsuŒkyku {kxu
fkuR E™k{ ™Úke nkuŒwt. yk…ý™u
yk…ýe hûkk ‚uðkyku y™u „wó[h
yusL‚eyku ‚kÚku yk {k{÷u ‚{eûkk
fhðe …zþu fu fR [eòu sÁhe Au su
yk…ý™u Ëw~{™ku …h ÷ez y…kðe Ëu.
yíÞkh™k ‚{Þ{kt fk uR ûk uºk™u
«¼krðŒ fhðk {kxu xuõ™ku÷kuS y™u
…i‚k {níð™k Au. ÞwØ™e ÂMÚkrŒ{kt
fkuR …ûk™e SŒ™ku r™ýoÞ …ý yk
ƒu [eòu fhþu. Œu{kt xuõ™ku÷kuS ðÄkhu
sÁhe Au fkhý fu ßÞkt …ý ‚u™k …k‚u
ðÄw ykÄwr™f nrÚkÞkh hÌkk Au Œu{ýu
s {k™ðŒk™k ¼rð»Þ™ku r™ýoÞ fÞkuo
A u. hküÙeÞ ‚whûkk ‚÷knfkh
(NSA)ySŒ zku¼k÷ y™u yk{eo
[eV s™h÷ rƒr…™ hkðŒu
{t„¤ðkh™k zeykhzeyku™e 41{e
fkuLVhL‚ Ëhr{Þk™ xuõ™ku÷kuS y™u
‚whûkk rðþu ðkŒ fhe. ySŒ zku¼k÷u

fÌšt fu Ëwr™Þk™k y{wf yuðk Ëuþ hÌkk
Au su{™e …k‚u Wå[ MŒh™e
xuõ™ku÷kuS nŒe. ¼khŒ™e yk {k{÷u
ÂMÚkrŒ Ëw¾Ë hne Au. yk{eo [eVu fÌšt-
¼khŒ ykð™khe ÷zkE MðËuþe
nrÚkÞkhku y™u xuõ™ku÷kuSÚke ÷zþu
y™u {™u ¼hku‚ku Au fu yk…ýe
SŒeþwt.

zk u¼k÷u fÌš t- xuõ™ku÷k uS™k
{k{÷k{kt yk…ýu nt{uþk W…rðsuŒk
s hÌkk Aeyu. W…rðsuŒkyku {kxu
fkuR E™k{ ™Úke nkuŒwt. yk…ý™u
yk…ýe hûkk ‚uðkyku y™u „wó[h
yusL‚eyku ‚kÚku yk {k{÷u ‚{eûkk
fhðe …zþu fu fR [eòu sÁhe Au su
yk…ý™u Ëw~{™ku …h ÷ez y…kðe Ëu.

yk{e o  [eV u  fÌš t  -  ¼khŒ
yk„k{e ÷zkR MðËuþe nrÚkÞkhku
y™u W…fhýkuÚke ÷zþu y™u ¼hku‚ku
A u f u  SŒ yk…ý™u s {¤þu.
zeykhzeyku AuÕ÷k ½ýk ‚{ÞÚke yu
r™rïŒ fhðk™e fkurþ»k fhe hÌšt
Au fu yk…ýe sÁrhÞkŒku ½hu÷w
Wí…kË™Úke …qhe fhðk{kt ykðu.
y{u  ¼rð»Þ™e ÷zkR {kx u
nrÚkÞkhku òuR hÌkk Aeyu. nðu
yk…ý™u  ‚kRƒh, ÷ uÍh,
R÷uõxÙk u r™f, hk uƒk urxf y™u
ykŠxrV~Þ÷ RLxur÷sL‚ suðe
xuõ™ku÷kuS …h æÞk™ Ëuðwt …zþu.
ÞwØ™e ÂMÚkrŒ{kt fkuR …ûk™e SŒ™ku
r™ýoÞ …ý yk ƒu [eòu fhþu. Œu{kt
xuõ™ku÷kuS ðÄkhu sÁhe Au fkhý fu
ßÞkt …ý ‚u™k …k‚u ðÄw ykÄwr™f
nrÚkÞkh hÌkk Au Œu{ýu s {k™ðŒk™k
¼rð»Þ™ku r™ýoÞ fÞkuo Au.

rËðk¤e{kt ¼u¤‚ur¤Þk {kðk™ku Ä{Ä{Œku ðu…kh : Œtºk™kt Úkkƒz¼kýkt
ykýtË, rËðk¤e™k ‚…h{k

rËð‚ku{kt r{XkR™k ðÄŒk sŒk W…Þku„
‚k{u {kðk™e {kt„ …ý ðÄe Au. su™u
÷R™u {kðk™e ¼êe ÄhkðŒk ðu…kheyku
{kðk™e ƒ™kðx{kt y¾kã …ËkÚkkuo

W{uhe ykuAk ‚{Þ{kt ðÄw {kðku ÚkkÞ
Œuðe heŒh‚{ y…™kðŒk nkuÞ Au.
…htŒw {kðk™e ¼êeyku W…h Vqz yuLz
zÙø‚ rð¼k„ îkhk ¼køÞu s Œ…k‚ ÚkŒe
nkuÞ {kðk™e ¼êeyku™k ðu…kheyku™u

½e-fu¤kt ÚkR …zu Au.  Vqz yuLz zÙø‚
rð¼k„™k Œ…k‚™eþku Œnuðkh{kt
{÷kR Œkhðe ÷uŒkt nkuðk™wt òýðk {éÞwt
Au. ËqÄ™„he ykýtË™e yk‚…k‚ {kðku
ƒ™kððk™e y™uf ¼êeyku Ä{Ä{u Au.

ÞqLkkRxuz LkuLþLk îkhk ònuh fhu÷ ynuðk÷{kt ¾w÷kMkku

ðirïfMŒhu «íÞuf ºký …ife yuf ƒk¤f
fw…ku»ký yÚkðk MÚkq¤Œk Ähkðu Au

ÞwyuLk: …kt[ ð»ko fhŒkt ykuAe
ô{h ÄhkðŒk ykþhu 700 r{r÷Þ™
ƒk¤fku …ife ºkeò ¼k„™k ƒk¤fku
fw…ku»ký yÚkðk ðÄkhu …zŒk ðs™
(MÚkq¤Œk) fu Sð™ …ÞOŒ ykhkuøÞ
‚tƒtrÄŒ ‚{MÞkÚke r…zeŒ Au, Œu{
ƒk¤fku{kt fw…ku»ký yt„u Þw™kExuz
™uþL‚ îkhk òhe fhðk{kt ykðu÷k
ynuðk÷{kt yk {krnŒe yk…ðk{kt
ykðe Au. òu ƒk¤fku™u …qhŒwt ¼kus™
™nª ÷u Œku Œuyku™wt Sð™ …ý yuftËhu
™ƒ¤w s hnuþu, Œu{ Þwr™‚uV™k
yuÂõÍõâwxeð rzhuõxh nu™heè Vkuhu
sýkÔÞwt nŒwt.

yk…ýu ykhk uøÞ«Ë ¼kus™
{kxu™e ÷zŒ{kt ÂMÚkrŒ „w{kðe hÌkk
Aeyu. yk ÂMÚkrŒ „heƒ y™u {æÞ{-
ykðf ÄhkðŒk Ëuþku{kt ‚rðþu»k òuðk
{¤u Au. ðirïf yÚkoŒtºk™u «íÞuf ð»ko
fw…ku»ký™ku ykþhu 3.5 xÙer÷Þ™
zku÷h™ku ƒkus …zu Au. ð»ko 1990 Úke
2015 Ëhr{Þk™ „heƒ Ëuþku{kt
ykþhu 40 xfk sux÷ku ½xkzku ÚkÞku
nkuðk AŒkt nswt …ý ykþhu 149
r{r÷Þ™ sux÷k [kh ð»ko yÚkðk {kuxe
ô{h™k ƒk¤fku fw…ku»ký™ku ¼ku„ ƒ™u
Au yÚkðk Œku ykhkuøÞ™e ÿÂüyu
{k™r‚f y™u þkherhf heŒu {w~fu÷e

Ähkðu Au. Ëk¾÷k Œhefu ÞwØ„úMŒ
Þ{™{kt Œ{k{ r«-Mfq÷ ƒk¤fku …ife
46 xfk ƒk¤fku™u yk «fkh™e rðrðÄ
‚{MÞkyku™ku ‚k{™ku fhðku …zâku
nŒku, Œu{ ð»ko 2013 Úke 2018 ™e
yktfzkfeÞ {krnŒe{kt òýðk {éÞwt
nŒwt. rðï¼h{kt ðÄw 50 r{r÷Þ™
ƒk¤fku ðuMxª„, Ëwƒ¤k…ýk Œu{ s
{ktË„e™ku ‚k{™ku fhe hÌkk Au.

Œ{k{ ð„osqÚk{kt ykþhu 800
r{r÷Þ™ fhŒkt ðÄkhu ÷kufku ‚ŒŒ
¼qÏÞk hnu Au y™u yLÞ ykþhu ƒu
rƒr÷Þ™ ÷kufku yÞkuøÞ yknkh xuð,

{uËMðeŒk, ÓËÞ ‚tƒtrÄŒ rƒ{kheyku
ŒÚkk zkÞkrƒxe‚ hku„™ku ‚k{™ku fhe
hÌkk Au.

yk Œ{k{ ÂMÚkrŒÚke ŒÆ™
rð…heŒ ò…k™{kt þeþw {]íÞw Ëh
‚kiÚke ykuAku Au íÞkhu …kt[Úke 19 ð»ko
ðå[u 14.42 xfk ƒk¤fku MÚkq¤Œk
Ähkðu Au, su rðfr‚Œ Ëuþku{kt ‚kiÚke
™e[ku Ëh Au. r™»ýkŒku ò…k™{kt
ƒk¤fku™e ŒtËwhMŒe y™u …ku»ký™k
Wå[ Mfkuh {kxu Œu{™e þk¤k™k ÷t[
«ku„úk{ ŒÚkk ykhkuøÞ«Ë ¼kus™™u
¢urzx yk…u Au.

{k„kuo™wt …u[ ðfo …qýo fhðk „ktÄe™„h
f÷uõxh™k yæÞûk MÚkk™u ƒuXf ÞkuòR

økk tÄeLkøkh: „k tÄe™„h
rsÕ÷k{k t  [k u{k‚w t  ‚kÁt hnuŒk
rsÕ÷k™k yk tŒrhf y™u { wÏÞ
{k„k u o™ w t   ½k uðký ÚkÞ w t  nŒ w t .
„k t½e™„h rsÕ÷k{k t ½k uðkÞu÷
{k„kuo™wt …u[ ðfo fhðk™k fk{™e
‚{eûkk  {kx u  rsÕ÷k f÷ ufxh
fw÷Ëe… ykÞo™k yÎÞûk MÚkk™u ƒuXf
ÞkuòR nŒe.

yk ƒuXf{kt rsÕ÷k f÷ufxh
fw÷Ëe… ykÞoyu sýkÔÞwt nŒwt fu,
„k tÄe™„h rsÕ÷k{k t  yk ð»k u o
[ku{k‚wt ‚kÁt hÌšt Au. su™k …rhýk{
MðY… u  „k tÄe™„h þn uh™k
yktŒrhf, „úkBÞ y™u hksÞ fûkk™k
{k„kuo …h y{wf y{wf ytŒhu {kuxk
¾kzk …ze sðk y™u ½kuðký ÚkR
„Þk Au. s u™k …rhýk{u {k„o
yfM{kŒ™e …ý þõâŒk ™fkhe

þfkŒe ™Úke. yk„k{e rËð‚ku{kt
rËðk¤e™k Œn uðkhk u  ykðŒk t
nkuðkÚke {k„kuo …h ðkn™ku™e yðh-
sðh …ý ð½þu. s uÚke Œ{k{
hksÞ, „ ú kBÞ y™u  þn uh™k
yktŒrhf {k„kuo™wt …u[ ðfo™wt fk{  ƒu
Úke ºký rËð‚{kt …qýo fhðk {kxu
‚tƒtr½Œ yr½fkheyku™u ¼kh…qðof
sýkÔÞwt nŒwt.

ƒuXf{k t W…ÂMÚkŒ …kx™„h
Þkus™k rð¼k„-3 ™k fkÞo…k÷f
Rs™uh ©e fu.ze.…xu÷u sýkÔÞwt nŒwt
f u, „ktÄe™„h rsÕ÷k{kt hksÞ
fûkk™k 560 rf÷ku{exh  {k„o
Au.su{k tÚke 148 rf÷ku{exh™k
{k„o …h [ku{k‚k ËhBÞk™ ™k™k
{kuxk ¾kzk …ze sðk y™u {k„o™wt
½k uðký ÚkR „Þ w t  nŒ w t .  …h tŒ w
[ku{k‚k™k rðhk{ ƒkË ŒhŒ s …u[

ðfo™wt fk{ þY fhe Ëuðk{kt ykÔÞwt
nŒwt. su{ktÚke 129 rf÷ku{exh™k
{k„o™wt …u[ ðfo fk{ …qýo ÚkÞwt Au.
19 rf÷ku{exh™wt fk{ ƒkfe Au.

„k tÄe™„h rsÕ÷k … t[kÞŒ
{k„ o  y™u  {fk™ rð¼k„™k
fkÞ o…k÷f Rs™uh ©e rðh u™
ƒkðe‚kyu sýkÔÞwt nŒwt fu, y{khe
nMŒf rsÕ÷k{k t  f w÷ 1446
rf÷ku{exh zk{h™k hMŒkyku™k u
‚{kðuþ ÚkkÞ Au.

su{k t rsÕ÷k fûkk™k {wÏÞ,
„úkBÞ y™u yLÞ rsÕ÷k™k {k„kuo™ku
‚{kðuþ ÚkkÞ Au. yk {k„kuo …h
ytËksu 72.75 rf.{e ÷tƒkR™k
{k„o™e [k u{k‚k …Ae {hk{Œ
fhðk Þk uøÞ nk uÞ Au. 18.50
rf.{e.™k {k„o …h …u[ ðfo™wt fk{
…qýo fhðk{kt ykÔÞwt Au.


