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NOTICE OF EXTRA-ORDINARY GENERAL MEETING

TO BE HELD THROUGH VIDEO CONFERENCING (VC)/

OTHER AUDIO VISUAL MEANS (OAVM)

Notice is hereby given that an Extra-Ordinary General Meeting (EGM) of

STEL Holdings Limited will be held on Friday, March 26, 2021, at 11 AM

(IST) through Video Conferencing (“VC”)/Other Audio Visual Means in

compliance with the applicable provisions of the Companies Act 2013

and the rules framed thereunder (“the Act”) read with General Circulars

14/2020 dated 8
th
April 2020, 17/2020 dated 13

th
April 2020, 20/2020

dated 5
th
May 2020, 39/2020 dated 31

st
December, 2020 respectively

issued by the Ministry of Corporate Affairs, Government of India (“MCA

Circulars”) and the SEBI circular dated May 12, 2020 and January 15,

2021 to transact the business as set out in the Notice of EGM which will

be sent to members through email.

The notice of the EGM will be sent by email only to members whose email

id’s are registered with the Company or with the Depository Participant

(Depositories) in accordance with the MCA Circulars and the

SEBI Circular and is also available on Company’s website

www.stelholdings.com and on the website of stock exchanges i.e

nseindia.com and bseindia.com and on the website of Central Depository

Services (India) Ltd i.e www.evotingindia.com

Members can join and participate in the meeting through VC/OAVM

Facility. Detailed process and manner for attending the EGM and casting

vote through remote e-voting and e-voting at the EGM for members holding

shares in dematerialised mode, physical mode and for member who have

not registered their email address will be provided in the notice of EGM.

In case the shareholder has not registered his/her/their email address

with the Company/its RTA/Depositories and or not updated the Bank

Account mandate, the following instructions to be followed:

(i) Kindly login to the website of our RTA, Link Intime India Private

Ltd., www.linkintime.co.in under Investor Services>Email/Bank detail

Registration - fill in the details and upload the required documents and

submit. The members are requested to provide details such as Name,

Folio Number, Certificate number, PAN, e – mail id along with the copy

of the PAN & cheque leaf with the first named shareholders name

imprinted, in PDF or JPEG format & also upload the image of share

certificate with the request letter duly signed in PDF or JPEG format OR

(ii) In the case of Shares held in Demat mode:

The shareholder may please contact the Depository Participant (“DP”)

and register the email address and bank account details in the demat

account as per the process followed and advised by the DP.

The above information is being published for the benefit & information

of shareholders and is in compliance with the MCA Circulars and

SEBI Circular.

Cochin - 682003

March 1, 2021

For STEL Holdings Limited

Sd/-

Lakshmi P.S

Company Secretary

FE BUREAU

NewDelhi, March 1

THE SUPREME COURT on
Mondayheldthatcriminalpro-
ceedings can not be initiated
against a corporate debtor
underthechequebounce lawif
theNCLThasalreadypassedan
orderofmoratoriumunderthe
Insolvency and Bankruptcy
Code.However,itsaidthatsuch
proceedings can continue
againsterstwhiledirectors/per-
sons in chargeof and responsi-
ble for the conduct of the busi-
nessofthecorporatedebtor.
Disagreeing with the con-

traryviewtakenbytheBombay
and theCalcuttaHighCourts,a
BenchledbyJusticeRFNariman
in a batch of cases led by P
Mohanrajv.M/SShahBrothers
Ispat Pvt Ltd said thatmorato-
rium under Section 14 of IBC
also includes criminalproceed-
ings for cheque bounce cases
underSection138of theNego-
tiableInstrumentsAct,thuspar-
allel proceedings against a cor-
poratedebtorcannotbeallowed.
“The legal impedimentcon-

tained inSection14of the IBC
would make it impossible for
suchproceeding to continueor
be institutedagainst thecorpo-
ratedebtor.Thus,fortheperiod
ofmoratorium,sincenoSection
138/141 proceeding can con-
tinueorbe initiatedagainst the
corporate debtor because of a
statutorybar,suchproceedings
can be initiated or continued
against the persons (directo-
rs/persons inmanagement or
controlof thecorporatedebtor)
mentioned in Section 141(1)
and(2)oftheNegotiableInstru-
mentsAct,”JusticeNarimansaid.
Itsaidtheobjectofamorato-

riumprovision suchas Section
14istoseethatthereisnodeple-
tion of a corporate debtor’s
assetsduringtheinsolvencyres-
olutionprocess so that it canbe
keptrunningasagoingconcern
duringthistime,thusmaximis-
ing value for all stakeholders.
“Theideaisthatitfacilitatesthe
continuedoperationofthebusi-
ness of the corporate debtor to
allow it breathing space to
organiseitsaffairssothatanew
management may ultimately
takeoverandbringthecorporate
debtoroutof financial sickness,
thusbenefittingallstakeholders,
whichwould includeworkmen
ofthecorporatedebtor,”accord-
ingtotheapexcourt.
Various appealswhere filed

seeking the clarityonwhether
theNCLT'smoratoriumduring
corporateinsolvencyresolution
process will bar parallel pro-
ceedings underSection138of
theNIAct.Intheleadcase,Shah
Brothers Ispat Private Ltd
(SBIPL), the supplier of steel
products, had filed a criminal
complaint under Section 138
beforeatrialcourtagainstdirec-
tors of Diamond Engineering
Chennai Ltd (corporate debtor)
after51chequesissuedbydebt-
ridden firmwere dishonoured
for“insufficientfunds”.

Cheque bounce:
No criminal
proceedings
against corporate
debtorunder
moratorium
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