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is0 900r 2015

Sub: Submission of Newspaper Clio relatins to Board Meeting to be held on loth November, 2021

Dear Sir,

Please find enclosed herewith copies of newspaper advertisement published in The Pioneer (English

& Hindi), New Delhi Edition dated 3oth bctober, 2021 in respect of publication of notice of Board

Meeting of the Company to be held on lOth Novembe r, 2027 tn compliance with Regulation 47 of

SEBI (Listing Obligations and Disclosure Requirements) Regulations, 2015.

Please take the same on record.

Thanking you,

Yours faithfully,

For Pasupati Acrylon Limited

&x-
Company Secretary & Compliance Officer

PASUPATI ACRYLON LTD.

To,

BSE Limited

Listing Department

251.h Floor,PJTowers,

Da lal Street

Mumbai -400001

Stock Code. 500455

To,

Manager - Listing Compliances

National Stock Exchange Of lndia Ltd

Exchange Plaza

Bandra Kurla Complex

Bandra (E), Mumbai-400051

. 'Stock Code: PASUPTAC

tr coRpoRATE OFFICE . M-14 CONNAUGHT CTRCUS (M]DDLE CTRCLE) NEW DELHI-110 001 (iNDiA) tr PHONE EPABX 47627400
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tr E-MAIL : works@pasupatiacryion.com . pasupati_tkd@redlffmail.cofir
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Kolkata: Bangladesh
Information and Broadcasting
Minister M Hasan Mahmud on
Thursday blamed Opposition
Bangladesh Nationalist Party
(BNP) and pro-Pakistan ele-
ments for the recent commu-
nal violence in the country dur-
ing Durga Puja.

Addressing the media at
Kolkata Press Club, Mr
Mahmud said, “The people of
Bangladesh and West Bengal
are well aware of who is behind
this. Some parties like BNP and
Jamaat believe in communal-
ism and they capitalise on it
and create instability.”

“You all know that even
during the country’s libera-
tion struggle (1971), there were
some people who supported
the Pakistani army. Don’t for-
get that their descendants are
still there,” added the
Bangladesh minister.

Violence had erupted in
pockets of Bangladesh over an
alleged blasphemy incident at
a Durga Puja pavilion at
Cumilla, following which para-
military forces were deployed
in many affected areas.

Sporadic clashes broke out
between the police and hard-
liners resulting in the vandal-

isation of Hindu temples and
Durga puja venues.

At least five people were
killed and scores injured in the
clashes. Based on the analysis
of the CCTV footage, the police
identified Iqbal Hossain, a res-
ident of Cumilla, as the person
responsible for the incident.

The police official said he
confessed to placing the Quran
on the lap of the idol of
Hanuman, a central character
in the epic of Ramayana, before
stealing the club from the idol’s
hand.

He further blamed the
communal politics of BNP and
Pakistan for the violence in the
country and stated that the
Bangladesh government has
taken strict action against all
the culprits.

BNP do communal poli-
tics, they who follow the ide-
ology of Pakistan, their religion
first for the people. This is the
difference between those peo-
ple and us. Bangladesh gov-
ernment has taken strict action
against all the culprits after
communal incidents took place
in different parts of the coun-
try,” said Mr Mahmud.

“When elections come,
these people give anti-India,

anti-Hindu slogans and also say
that you people should not go
to vote and these people have
done this incident for political
purpose,” Mr Mahmud said.

He said that atrocities on
the Hindu community were
one such attempt through
which they wanted to incite
riots across the country.

“No Hindu had kept the
Quran in the puja pandal. In
the end, the investigation
revealed that a Muslim named
Iqbal had done it under provo-
cation. Agencies are probing
the matter and strict action is
being taken,” he added.

“In Bangladesh, we do not
believe in minorities. Everyone
is Bangladeshi and this is our
first identity. The festival of
worship is not only for Hindus
as we all participate in it and so
is the case with Eid, which is
celebrated by all,” added the
minister.

“When Eid is celebrated in
Bangladesh, not only Muslims
but people of all religions take
part in it and the same happens
in India. Out of 32,000 pujas,
only five or six were attacked by
some people who are trying to
communalise Bangladesh’s pol-
itics,” he said. PTI
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ROME: Prime Minister
Narendra Modi was on Friday
greeted by a jubilant and cheer-
ing Indian diaspora, who recit-
ed hymns and chanted his
name to welcome him on his
visit to Italy.

In a video shared on social
media, Prime Minister Modi is
seen in a happy mood, walking
along a park cloaked with
heavy security, greeting and
shaking hands with the mem-
bers of the Indian diaspora.

Before meeting the Indian
community, Modi paid floral
tributes at the bust of Mahatma
Gandhi at Piazza Gandhi.

The community members,
holding Indian flags, are seen
chanting Modi’s name cheer-
fully, with PM Modi recipro-
cating by waving to the crowd.

With folded hands and full
attention, Prime Minister Modi
listened to the recital of hymns
by a group of members, who
also offered a bunch of books
to him.

Modi also joined them in
reciting “Om Namah Shivay” at
the end. 

He praised their effort and
also exchanged a few words
with them.

With concern, he enquired

about a community member’s
injured hand, “what did you do
to your hand?”

Prime Minister Modi, who
arrived here earlier in the day
to participate in the G20

Summit, began his official
engagements in Rome with a
“productive interaction” with
President of the European
Council Charles Michel and
President of the European
Commission Ursula von der
Leyen.

Prime Minister Modi held
wide-ranging talks with the top
leaders of the European Union
here during which the two
sides discussed deepening the
India-EU friendship, particu-
larly in areas such as trade,
commerce, culture and the
environment.

PTI
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Jerusalem: For years, Zebulon
Simentov branded himself as
the “last Jew of Afghanistan,”
the sole remnant of a centuries-
old community. He charged
reporters for interviews and
held court in Kabul’s only
remaining synagogue. He left
the country last month for
Istanbul after the Taliban seized
power.

Now it appears he was not
the last one.

Simentov’s distant cousin,
Tova Moradi, was born and
raised in Kabul and lived there
until last week, more than a
month after Simentov depart-
ed in September. Fearing for
their safety, Moradi, her chil-
dren and nearly two dozen
grandchildren fled the country

in recent weeks in an escape
orchestrated by an Israeli aid
group, activists and prominent
Jewish philanthropists.

“I loved my country, loved
it very much, but had to leave
because my children were in
danger,” Moradi told The
Associated Press from her
modest quarters in the
Albanian town of Golem,
whose beachside resorts have
been converted to makeshift
homes for some 2,000 Afghan
refugees. Moradi, 83, was one
of 10 children born to a Jewish
family in Kabul. At age 16, she
ran away from home and mar-
ried a Muslim man. She never
converted to Islam, maintained
some Jewish traditions, and it
was no secret in her neigh-

bourhood that she was Jewish.
“She never denied her Judaism,
she just got married in order to
save her life as you cannot be
safe as a young girl in
Afghanistan,” Moradi’s daugh-
ter, Khorshid, told the AP from
her home in Canada, where she
and three of her siblings moved
after the Taliban first seized
power in Afghanistan in the
1990s.

Despite friction over her
decision to marry outside the
faith, Moradi said she stayed in
touch with some of her family
over the years. Her parents and
siblings fled Afghanistan in
the 1960s and 1980s. Her par-
ents are buried at Jerusalem’s
Har Menuhot cemetery, and
many of her surviving siblings

and their descendants live in
Israel.

But until this week, she had
not spoken to some of her sis-
ters in over half a century.

“Yesterday, I saw my sisters,
nieces and nephews after
around 60 years through a
video call. We spoke for hours,”
Moradi said. “I was really
happy, I saw their children
and they met mine.” “They said
it’s like she came back from the
grave,’’’ Khorshid said. During
the first period of Taliban rule,
from 1996 until the 2001 US-
led invasion, Moradi tried to
maintain a low profile. But she
risked her life by hiding Rabbi
Isaak Levi, one of the few
remaining Afghan Jews, from
the Taliban. AP
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WASHINGTON: India and
the US have called on the
Taliban to ensure that
Afghanistan is not used as a
safe haven for terrorists, as offi-

cials from the two countries
concluded their joint dialogue
on counter-terrorism to expand
their cooperation to combat the
scourge.

The Indian and the US
sides also called for concerted
action against all terror groups,
including those proscribed by

the UN Security Council such
as al-Qaida, ISIS/Daesh,
Lashkar-e-Taiba (LeT) and
Jaish-e-Mohammad (JeM), a
joint statement issued after the
meeting here said on Thursday.

Reaffirming counter-ter-
rorism cooperation as an
important pillar under the US-
India Comprehensive Global
Strategic Partnership, both
sides pledged to further expand
cooperation on law enforce-
ment, information sharing,
exchange of best practices and
strategic convergence on
counter-terrorism challenges, it
said.

During the two-day meet-

ing here on October 26 and 27,
the US reiterated its commit-
ment to stand together with the
people and the government of
India in the fight against ter-
rorism.

ALSO READ | Taliban
founder Mullah Omar’s son
gives first public appearance as
hardline rulers polish image

They called on the Taliban
to ensure that Afghanistan is
not used as a safe haven for ter-
rorists.

The Taliban seized power
in Afghanistan on August 15,
two weeks before the US’ com-
plete troop withdrawal on
August 31 after a costly two-

decade war.
According to the joint US-

India statement, the two coun-
tries strongly condemned any
use of terrorist proxies and
cross-border terrorism in all its
forms, and called for the per-
petrators of the 26/11 Mumbai
attack to be brought to justice.

The 2008 Mumbai attack
was one of the most horrific
terrorist attacks in India in
which 166 people, including six
Americans, were killed and
over 300 injured as 10 heavily-
armed terrorists from Pakistan
created mayhem in the coun-
try’s financial capital.

IANS

Washington: The US Secretary
of State Tony Blinken
announced on Thursday that
the United States will roll out
USD144 million in a bid to help
the people of Afghanistan who
have been facing a grave
humanitarian crisis since the
atrocious Taliban takeover.

Blinken also added that the
financial assistance would be
provided directly to indepen-
dent international and non-
governmental humanitarian
organisations, including the
United Nations High
Commissioner for Refugees
(UNHCR), United Nations
Children’s Fund (UNICEF),
International Organization for
Migration (IOM), and the
World Health Organization
(WHO), following extensive
vetting and monitoring.

“This funding provides
support directly to some of the
more than 18 million vulner-
able Afghans in need in the

region, including Afghan
refugees in neighbouring coun-
tries,” he said.

“To be clear, this humani-
tarian assistance will benefit the
people of Afghanistan and not
the Taliban, whom we will
continue to hold accountable
for the commitments they have
made,” he asserted.

Observing that
Afghanistan’s neighbours have
long hosted one of the largest
and most protracted refugee
situations in the world, Blinken
thanked the host countries and
urged them to keep their bor-
ders open to Afghans seeking
international protection.

“With this new humani-
tarian funding, we will contin-
ue to support our partners in
the region with lifesaving assis-
tance and protection services to
Afghan refugees, while we con-
tinue to support Afghans in
need inside Afghanistan,”
Blinken said. IANS

New Delhi: An unprecedented
meeting of Inter-Parliamentary
Alliance on China (IPAC) is
taking place in Rome to coin-
cide with the G20 summit to
expose China’s human rights
abuses before the internation-
al community.

“Hello from Rome! I’m
here as Co-Chair of @ipac-
global, and today we’re talking
about #China and its disrespect
of human rights and the rule of
law. As the #G20summit kicks
off, we’re highlighting China’s
behaviour to the international
community,” Barry Ward said
in a tweet.

“I’m in Rome today for the
first in-person conference of
@ipacglobal. As world leaders
come together for the G20, they
must confront the CCP’s
attacks on human rights and
the rule of law,” Garnett Genius,

another participant of the meet,
tweeted.

“‘Every time I see a world
leader shaking hands with Xi
Jinping, I am reminded that the
survival of my community is
not important enough for them
to take a stand’... An incredibly
powerful statement from
@MahmutRahima at the
@ipacglobal #G20 counter-
meeting this morning,” Stop
Uyghur Genocide said in a
tweet.India has joined IPAC as
the 21st legislature represented.
“India joins IPAC with co-
chairs @SujeetKOfficial and
@ninong_erring. As the world’s
largest democracy, India has an
integral part to play in the
upholding of the rules based
international order. India is the
21st legislature represented in
#IPAC,” IPAC tweeted.Chinese
mouthpiece Global Times has

attacked IPAC as conversion of
secessionists. 

Global Times said that
Taiwan Foreign Minister
Joseph Wu’s visit is a trip about
the convergence of China’s
secessionist forces. Later this
month, the Inter-Parliamentary
Alliance on China (IPAC), a
group of anti-China lawmakers
from the West, will hold a
meeting in Rome. The leading
figures of many secessionist
groups that aim to divide China
will attend the meeting, and
Wu was invited to it as well.

“Wu, a leading pro-Taiwan
secession figure, has attacked
the Chinese mainland and
advocated secessionist ideas
through this anti-China coali-
tion. With Wu’s participation,
a combination of secessionists
of Taiwan, Tibet, Xinjiang and
HK has formed. IANS
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During a meeting with 14
foreign envoys, The

Taliban’s Acting Foreign
Minister Amir Khan Muttaqi
has urged the international
community’s support for the
removal of sanctions on the
incumbent government of
Afghanistan led by the group,
the media reported.

The meeting took place in
Doha on Wednesday, TOLO
News reported.During the
meeting, “Minister Muttaqi
elaborated on the new Islamic
government, ensuring security,
ties with the international com-
munity, economic situation,
sanctions imposed on
Afghanistan, and elimination
of corruption”, Foreign
Ministry spokesman Abdul
Qahar Balkhi said in a state-
ment.

“Afghanistan is witnessing
a dominant government in 40
years, therefore the interna-
tional community should call
on the US to remove sanctions
on the Afghan people’s nation-
al wealth,” the Minister was
quoted as saying in the meet-
ing.The new Afghan govern-
ment “as a responsible govern-
ment” fulfilled all of the con-
ditions and that it should be
recognised, he added.In the
meeting, reportedly mediated
by the Qatari government, the
envoys urged the Taliban to
abide by international rules,
respect human rights, guaran-
tee safe passage to Afghanistan
and eradicate terrorism.Earlier
on Wednesday, the Acting
Foreign Minister held talks
with Markus Potzel, Germany’s
Ambassador-designate to
Afghanistan.

IANS

New Delhi: A senior Pentagon
official has informed that
Pakistan continues to give the
US access to its airspace and the
two sides are also talking about
keeping that access open, Dawn
reported.US Undersecretary of
Defence for Policy Colin Kahl
shared this information with
the Senate Armed Services
Committee on Tuesday during
an open hearing on “Security in
Afghanistan and in the regions
of South and Central Asia”.

He was replying to a ques-
tion from the Committee’s
chairman Senator Jack Reed,
who asked him to update the
panel on “our arrangement
with Pakistan regarding their
cooperation with us in counter-
terrorism”.

The Senator referred to
recent press reports claiming
that Pakistan was working with
the Taliban to attack the Islamic
State terror group, the report
said.”Pakistan is a challenging
actor, but they don’t want
Afghanistan to be a safe haven
for terrorist attacks.” 

IANS
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Chinese People’s Liberation
Army (PLA) has abruptly

restricted the use of its navi-
gation system, BeiDou along
borders with India fearing their
movement might be
tracked.Sources said the change
in Chinese stance happened the
moment India increased its
surveillance mechanism along
the Line of Actual Control.
China, lately, has been making
attempts of transgression in
Indian territory.

Taking note of all these, the
India Army enhanced surveil-
lance both close to the LAC as
well as in the depth areas by
synergizing efforts of all sur-
veillance equipment right from
the strategic level till the tacti-
cal level where soldiers actual-
ly deployed.As surveillance
increased, Intelligence agencies
stated, a decrease in activation
of BeiDou terminals all along
the Northern Borders in the
last one month was
observed.Sources said that PLA
is now using it only to send
confirmations that they have
reached their desired loca-
tions. 

“It may be a deliberate
attempt by the PLA to hide its

important activities or prepa-
rations across Northern
Borders,” the source said.

The system was launched
on June 23, 2020 finally ending
a project that went on for two
decades.BDS, stated to be
rivalling US’ GPS, is the fourth
global satellite navigation sys-
tem in the world.

Other systems are Russia’s
GLONASS and the European
Union’s Galileo. India too is
developing its own naviga-
tional system called the Indian
Regional Navigation Satellite
System (IRNSS), with an oper-
ational name of NAVIC.China
wants to end the US-based GPS
hegemony and push for its
own developed navigation sys-
tem first in the Asian region. 

To do so, China has estab-
lished a monitoring station at
its Space and Upper
Atmosphere Research
Commission (SUPARCO) for
monitoring and assessing the
BeiDou Global Navigation
Satellite System (GNSS).Now
China is pushing the use of
Beidou in many countries as
part of their ambitious Belt and
Road Initiative.

Currently, Beidou covers
nearly 30 countries including
Pakistan, Egypt and Indonesia.
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Yangon: Myanmar’s military
sentenced a close aide of oust-
ed civilian leader Aung San Suu
Kyi to 20 years in prison on
Friday, his lawyer said, the
first high-ranking member of
her party to be jailed by a junta
court.

The country has been in
turmoil since a February 1
coup ousted Suu Kyi’s National
League for Democracy (NLD)
government, accusing it of
fraud in 2020 polls it won in a
landslide.

Myanmar has since been in
chaos, with huge democracy
protests and a crackdown on
dissent that has killed more
than 1,200 people, according to
a local monitoring group.

Former member of parlia-
ment and NLD speaker Win
Htein was handed 20 years in
jail for treason by a special
court in the capital Naypyidaw,
lawyer Myint Thwin told AFP.

He added that he would
appeal the sentence, and that
his client was in good health.

Win Htein, 80, is the first
high-ranking NLD member to
be sentenced by the junta after
a trial.

The former soldier is a
longtime political prisoner who
has spent long stretches of
time in detention for cam-
paigning against military rule.

Considered Suu Kyi’s right-
hand man, he was long been
sought out by international
and domestic media for
insights into what Myanmar’s
former de facto leader is think-
ing.

The wheelchair-bound
politician requires oxygen to
help him breathe, according to
local media. PTI
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Seoul: South Korea will launch
a project next month to devel-
op a homegrown naval inter-
ception system designed to
protect warships from hostile
aircraft and missiles, the state
arms procurement agency said
Friday.

The Defense Acquisition
Program Administration
(DAPA) said the project aims
to develop the Close In
Weapon System-II (CIWS-II) -
- a ship-based gun capable of
countering incoming attacks in
the final stage of the Navy’s
multilayered interception pro-
gram — by 2027. IANS
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