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SUBHOMOYBHATTACHARJEE
New Delhi, 1 July

One of the quirky ele-
ments of the coal sup-
plycrisis is thatthegov-

ernment has nominated a
companywithnoexperienceof
importingcoalasasortofcanal-
ising agency to import for gov-
ernment- and private-owned
power generation companies.
This is state-owned Coal India
Ltd (CIL), the world’s largest
producer and monopoly
domestic supplier.

It is unclear why the coal
ministry decided that it would
not be useful to rope in spe-
cialised state-run importers
such as MMTC. An email to
MMTC did not elicit a reply.
Instead, CIL, with no experi-
ence of importing coal, has
raised three import tenders,
importing from mostly India-
basedentities that theeventual
consumers could have bought
from directly since coal is on
the Open General Licence list.

The coal ministry has
claimed that CIL’s canalising
will keep import prices down.
CIL in a response to Business
Standard, however, said: “The
internationalcoaltraderswould
be of Indian origin or if part of
an international consortium,

CIL shall deal only with the
India-registeredpartner.”Such
anarrangement givesCIL little
bargainingpower.

CIL held pre-bid meetings
with importers where it was
decidedthetimewindowforbid
price validity would be nar-
rowed from 90 to 60 days. The
firstofitsthreetendersisfor2.41
million tonnes to be supplied
immediately.Therearetwo“on-
taptenders”of3milliontonnes
each to keep supplies ready
abroad if there is a flare-up in
demand in the Indian market.
For instance, supplies tend to
dwindleinthemonsoonseason,
when coal mines, mostly open
cast, are flooded. This is what
happened last year, creating a
crisis inSeptember.

Since early this year, the
problem has become acute;
averagedailydemand touched
205 Gw in the first quarter of
FY23, a 14 per cent jump year-
on-year. Power Minister R K
Singh recently said he saw this
asasecular jumpinpowerdem-
and which would not recede.
This creates huge pressure on
CIL since production had not
grown commensurately, even
in FY22, when it had gone all
out to raise output (see table).

So the shortage seems to be
here to stay. But though CIL is

not equipped to handle
imports, throughout June the
company pivoted around to
organise itself to do so. It has
set up, for the very first time, a
new import-oriented unit
under its marketing and sales
division at its Kolkata head
office. It admitted that “import
ofcoal isnotCIL’scoreactivity”
but argued that “the company
hasbeenimportingheavyearth
movingequipmentandmining

machinery for the past several
years and themodality is simi-
lar”.Thecomparisonisnotapt,
since the latter are not meant
to be resold. Meanwhile, CIL
found out it did not even have
therequisitedocumentationto
arrange importsandhadtoask
NTPC,whichhasbeen import-
ing coal for the past few years,
toprovide them.

Two more reasons make
CIL’s importstorycurious.First,

CILhasasubsidiarycalledCoal
Videsh. This entity was set up
in 2006 to acquire coal mines
abroadanddiversifyintochem-
icalsandfertiliser,buthasdone
little so far. It is part of CIL’s
International Cooperation
Divisionbuthasplayedno role
in the current round of coal
imports. At one stage there
were plans to expand Coal
Videsh’s equity base with par-
ticipation from state-owned

steel companies SAIL and
RINL. That never came
through. CIL experts say that if
coal imports becomeadistinct
line of business, Coal Videsh
might be repurposed for that.

The second curious aspect
is that exactly two years ago,
CIL’s marketing department,
which is spearheading imports
now,wastaskedwithspreading
import substitution in the
domestic market. To this end,
some 14 public notices were
issued to companies in sponge
iron,cementandcaptivepower
to goad them to substitute
imported coal with domestic
supplies fromCIL.

Though Covid-19 subdued
demand, many analysts pre-
dicted a huge rebound in
energydemandwhenthepan-
demic ended. Despite being
India’s largest coal mining
company and one of the top
three globally, CIL lacked the
internal forecastingcapacity to
track these developments. So
anychange in thedemandand
supplychain for the fuel catch-
es it unawares.

Tobe fair, CILhas acknowl-
edgedcoal import isuncharted
terrain and has swung into
actionwithin aweek of receiv-
ing indents from 26 thermal
power companies — 19 state-
run, seven private. “CIL
finalisedandfloatedthetender
onawar footing,” a source said

So where is CIL importing
from? “The current short-term
tenderfor importofcoal, forQ2

ofFY23, issourceagnostic.This
means the coal can be sourced
fromanycountry,”aCILsource
said. But the importing firms
that showed up at the pre-bid
meetings were largely Indian
enterprises, such as Adani
Enterprises, Mohit Minerals
andChettinadLogistics.

A CIL internal assessment
shows that each consignment
of 3 million tonnes of coal
imports at current prices will
costitabout~3,850crore.Under
theterms,“fromthedateofplac-
ing the indents, deliveryof coal
would bemade within 30 days
atthefree-on-raildestinationof
thepowerplantsthatseekcoal.”

For such doorstep delivery,
thecompanyrunsanexchange
risk since it will buy in dollars
andsell inrupees. Inaresponse
CILsaidtherisksaretakencare
of, since it would be dealing
with the India-registered part-
ner. But the bid documents do
not indicate who bears the
exchange risks.

CILhasnot takenanyhedg-
ing for the imports, relying
instead on the strength of its
balance sheet. The company
says itwill “ensure that its bot-
tomlinewouldnotbeadverse-
ly impacted out of this initia-
tive”. For the shareholders of
CIL this is a call they will have
to take at face value. The com-
pany’snon-governmentshare-
holding is 33.87 per cent, of
which foreign portfolio
investors account for 6.94 per
cent. In the last week of June,
CIL had amarket cap of $14.54
billion. Whether the numbers
would hold up if CIL becomes
acoal tradingcompanyaswell
would beworthwatching.

Coal India: Producer turns importer

SHREYA JAI
New Delhi, 1 July

At the dawn of this century,
the Sheila Dikshit-led Delhi
government of the time took
the bold decision of privatis-
ing the power distribution
business in the national capi-
tal. A similarmodelwas shap-
ing up only in two other cities
— Ahmedabad and Surat.
This made the Delhi model
the largest and also the most
politically sensitive.

During the two decades,
Delhi’s electricity sector has
never beenout of thenews. In
the initial years, theBharatiya
Janata Party used it to attack
Dikshit with charges of crony
capitalism, and since 2013, it
is a populist tool for the
current Aam Aadmi Party
(AAP) government. While the
electricity infrastructure and
supply have seen immense
improvement, the shackles of
populist electoral promises of
free power and regulations
supporting themhavecontin-
ued to tie the sector down.

In the middle of this,
Delhi’s power distribution
companies (discoms) are
realigning their focuson tech-
nology and newer energy
sources to bring down their
electricitycostandalsoensure
seamless supply.

Techasgamechanger
On July 1, 2002, the Delhi
government awarded two of
three regions to private distri-
bution licensees, while the
New Delhi Municipal
Corporation (NDMC) area
remained with the govern-
ment. Tata Power got the
North and Northwest part of
the city, while Reliance Infra-
promotedBSESLtdgotSouth,
West, East and Central Delhi.

A BSES spokesperson
said theAT&C(aggregate tech-
nical and commercial) losses
had come down to 7 per cent
from 55 per cent in 2002.
According to industry esti-
mates, the AT&C loss reduc-
tion alone fetched ~95,000
crore to theDelhi government
in this period.

Ganesh Srinivasan, CEO,
TataPowerDelhiDistribution
Ltd (TPDDL), said there were
layers of improvement in the
city. “This canbeattributed to
mainly technological and
commercial milestones, con-
sistent investment innetwork
outlay and development of
infrastructure and grid mod-
ernisation efforts.”

BSES said it upgraded
and modernised its distribu-
tion network and deployed
technologies like (supervisory
control and data acquisition
(SCADA), geographic informa-
tion system (GIS), intelligent
management system (iOMS)
andDistributionManagement

System (DMS). “We have
maintained network reliabil-
ity of over 99.9 per cent for
the last five years,” said a
BSES spokesperson.

Similar investment was
made by Tata Power, which
started with SCADA at 66kv
and33kv levels, thenmovedto
11kv andnowoperates at even
lower levels. (SCADAisusedto
remotely monitor and control
power demandand supply.)

“The adoption and imple-
mentation of smart technolo-
gies is theback-
bone of the
company’snet-
work. This has
been signifi-
cant in reduc-
ing dependen-
cy on manual
systems,”
Srinivasansaid.
“It has also
helped to cater
to load growth,
whichhasnear-
ly doubledover
the years.”

Whilesignif-
icant investment has hap-
penedon thebackend, several
policy niggles continue to
haunt discoms. There are his-
toric and costly power pur-
chase agreements signed in
the pre-privatisation era that
discoms continue to bear. On
top of it, since 2013 there is an
additionalburdenofproviding
free electricity.

Politicalandregulatory
hiccups
The Arvind Kejriwal-led AAP
swept topower inDelhion the
promiseofproviding freeelec-

tricity. The subsidy quantum
has changed over the years
with no increase in power
tariff in Delhi since 2014.
Currently, domestic con-
sumers who use 200 units a
month get 100 per cent
subsidy, and there is
50percentsubsidy for the201-
400-unit slab.

A senior executive said
Delhi’s power purchase
cost has increased by 300 per
cent since 2014 but the
tariff has risen by only 90 per

cent. The regu-
latory assets of
Delhi’s dis-
coms stand
at ~51,646crore
asonMarch31,
2022.
Regulatory
assets are dis-
com expenses
that are recov-
erable in future
power tariff
hikes, but the
electricity reg-
ulators do not
take them into

consideration while calculat-
ing current electricity tariffs.

“Power purchase cost for
Delhidiscoms is thehighest in
the country. While on other
fronts there have been
improvements, thereareques-
tions over the financial aspect
—cost that has been incurred
over time and how it will
recover.Acost-reflective tariff
can play an important role in
liquidating the regulatory
assets,” Srinivasan said.

Thewayforward
Delhi government-owned

power plants are all gas based
where the lack of an adminis-
tered price mechanism leads
to an increase in power pur-
chasecost toashighas ~20per
unit during peak period.

The Centre recently
allowed discoms across the
country to exit from power
purchase agreements (PPAs)
older than 25 years, which are
costlier. BSES is in theprocess
of ending the PPA with six
thermal power plants —
Unchahar, Farakka, Auraiya,
Anta,KahalgaonandDadri, all
of them owned by NTPC Ltd.
Cumulatively, these plants
supply 800MW to BSES at an
average cost of ~6 per unit.

To fill the gap, the discoms
arenow looking at greenener-
gy and demand-side manage-
ment to reduce their cost. By
FY24, BSES intends to have
green energy as 50 per cent of
itspowerportfolio.TPDDLsaid
it was looking at “solar + wind
+ storage” to cover asmuch of
the day with green energy as
possible and shut down some
of the thermal units.

To ensure smooth transi-
tion to green energy and also
engage consumers in energy
efficiency, BSES and TPDDL
are investing in smart meters
and demand-side manage-
ment. TPDDL has already
installed 300,000 metres.
BSEShasrecentlyplacedaten-
der for procuring 5 million
meters.TPDDLcommissioned
South-Asia’s largest grid-scale
battery-based Battery Energy
Storage System in 2019 and
also India’s first grid-connect-
edCommunityEnergyStorage
System in 2021.

20yearssinceDelhi
discomswereprivatised

Thecountry’slargestdomesticsupplier
hasbeenappointedaquasi-canalising
agencyforsourcingoverseassupplies

Discoms are now
looking at green energy
and demand-side
management to reduce
their cost. By FY24,
BSES intends to have
green energy as 50 per
cent of its power
portfolio. TPDDL said it
was looking at “solar +
wind + storage” to
cover as much day
with green energy
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THE SUPPLY GAPS
Non-cokingcoal imports

(mt)

FY15 168.39
FY17 149.3
FY18 161.2
FY19 183.5
FY20 196.7
FY21 164.05
FY22 151.8
FY23 Being firmed up
Source: Ministry of coal & parliament
questions

Coaldespatchtosectors(AprilandMay2022)
nFY22 (mt) 132.68
nFY23 (mt) 149.47
nGrowth rate (%) 12.65

Power Captive Steel Cement Sponge Others
powerplants Iron

Source: Ministry of coal

19.49 -31.67 26.24 2.62 -14.49 -11.66
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POSITIVE CHARGE
AT&C loss reduced from
2002 to 2022

Total savings to the govt due
to improved services

Savings on account of AT&C
loss reduction

Last tariff hike in Delhi

Increase in power-purchase
cost since 2002

Increase in power tariff
since 2002

55% to less
than7%

~1.2 trillion

~95,000 cr

Since2014

300%

91%

VINAYUMARJI
Ahmedabad, 1 July

Of the top eight cities in the
country,Ahmedabadwas the
mostaffordableforhomebuy-
ers inthefirsthalfofcalendar
year2022, findsKnightFrank
India’slatestproprietarystudy
Affordability Index.

In termsof thehomepur-
chase affordability index,
Ahmedabad improved from
46 per cent in 2010 to 25 per
centin2019andto22percent
in H1 of 2022. The city’s best
performancewas,however,at
20 per cent in 2021, with the
affordabilityindeximproving
afterthepandemic.Following
the city are Pune and
Chennai, at 26 per cent each,
even as it was found that all
marketshadseenadeclinein
affordability due to a rise in
home loanrates.Kolkatawas
thenextmostaffordableat27
per cent, followed by Benga-
luru(28percent),NCR(30per
cent),Hyderabad(31percent)
andMumbai (56per cent).

Ahmedabad
housing
market most
affordable

Agiantstepforwardintechnology,butfeetstillshackledinpopulism
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For JM Financial Limited
Prashant Choksi

Date: July 2, 2022 Group Head – Compliance, Legal
Place: Mumbai & Company Secretary

NOTICE OF THE THIRTY SEVENTH
ANNUAL GENERAL MEETING

NOTICE is hereby given that the Thirty Seventh Annual General Meeting
(the “AGM”) of the members of JM Financial Limited (the “Company”) will
be held on Tuesday, August 2, 2022 at 4.00 pm through video conferencing
(“VC”) / other audio visual means (“OAVM”). The holding of AGM as above
is in compliance with the applicable provisions of the Companies Act, 2013
(the “Act”), the rules made thereunder and the guidelines and circulars
issued by the MCA and SEBI.
The Company’s Annual Report for the financial year 2021-22, containing,
inter-alia, the Notice convening the AGM and other documents required
to be attached thereto, has been sent by email on July 1, 2022, to those
members who have registered their e-mail address with the Company or its
Registrar and Transfer Agents (the “RTA”), viz., KFin Technologies Limited.
The said Annual Report and the Notice convening the AGM is also made
available on the website of the Company at www.jmfl.com, the websites
of the stock exchanges viz., BSE – www.bseindia.com and NSE –
www.nseindia.com and on the website of National Securities Depository
Ltd. (the “NSDL”) at www.evoting.nsdl.com.
Pursuant to the provisions of Section 108 of the Act read with Rule 20 of the
Companies (Management and Administration) Rules, 2014 and Regulation
44 of the Listing Regulations, the Company is providing remote e-voting
facility (the “remote e-voting”) to all its members for casting their votes
on the resolutions set out in the Notice of the AGM. The Company will
also provide the facility of e-voting during the AGM. For this purpose, the
Company has engaged the services of NSDL as the agency to provide
remote e-voting / e-voting facility.
Information and instructions including the details of Login id and the process
for generating or receiving the password for remote e-voting / e-voting
facility are forming part of the Notice convening AGM.
Members of the Company are requested to note the following important
timelines:

Date of completion of dispatch of Notice Friday, July 1, 2022

Commencement of remote e-voting period Friday, July 29, 2022 (9:00 am)

End of remote e-voting period Monday, August 1, 2022 (5:00 pm)

Cut-off date for remote e-voting Tuesday, July 26, 2022
The remote e-voting module shall be disabled by NSDL after 5.00 pm on
Monday, August 1, 2022.
Any person, who becomes a member of the Company after dispatch of the
Notice of AGM and before the cut-off date i.e., Tuesday, July 26, 2022,
may obtain the Login id and Password by sending a request at evoting@
nsdl.co.in. If a member is already registered with NSDL for remote
e-voting, then he / she / it can use his / her / its existing user id and password
for casting the vote. Password can also be reset by using “Forgot User
Details / Password” or “Physical User Reset Password” option available at
www.evoting.nsdl.com or call on any of the toll free nos. 1800 1020 990
or 1800 2244 30.
Individual members holding shares in demat mode may follow steps
mentioned in the Notice of the AGM under “Access to NSDL e-Voting
system”.
The facility for voting will also be made available during the AGM and those
members present at the meeting through VC /OAVM, who have not cast
their votes through remote e-voting shall be eligible to vote through the
e-voting system at the AGM.
Members who have cast their votes by remote e-voting prior to the AGM
may also attend the AGM but shall not be entitled to cast their votes again.
Once the vote on a resolution is cast by a member through remote e-voting,
then such member shall not be allowed to change it subsequently.
A person whose name is recorded in the register of members or in register
of beneficial owners maintained by the depositories viz., NSDL and CDSL,
as on the cut-off date viz., Tuesday, July 26, 2022 shall only be entitled to
avail the facility of remote e-voting or e-voting at the AGM.
The Register of Members of the Company shall remain closed from
Monday, July 11, 2022 to Friday, July 15, 2022 (both the days inclusive)
for the purpose of determining the members eligible to receive the final
dividend for the financial year 2021-22, if declared at the AGM.
Members whose names appear in the register of members / beneficial
ownership as on Friday, July 8, 2022 and wishing to register mandates
for receiving electronic credit of dividend for the financial year 2021-22, are
requested to write to the company at ecommunication@jmfl.com.
Members may refer the Company’s communication in relation to tax
deduction at source on dividend payment during the financial year 2021-
22 and related Forms /Declaration thereto on the Company’s website viz.,
https://jmfl.com/investor-relation/unclaimed-dividend.html.
Ms. Jayshree S Joshi, Company Secretary (Membership No. FCS 1451),
Proprietor of Jayshree Dagli & Associates has been appointed as the
Scrutiniser to scrutinise the e-voting (both remote e-voting and e-voting at
the AGM) in a fair and transparent manner.
In case of any assistance during or before the e-AGM, members may
contact Mr. Amit Vishal, Assistant Vice President at amitv@nsdl.co.in /
022-24994360 or contact him at 1800 1020 990 and 1800 22 44 30 or can
send mail at evoting@nsdl.co.in.

��
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!,����0
� �0���2��0��

��
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

 �
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

!�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

"�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

#�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

$�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

%�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

&�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

���
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

���
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

���
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

� �
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

�!�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

,>�� �� ����� �� �����
>���� 
�
��>���
�
��>	�>����
>���� >�� ������� ��� ����	�����

	>�� ��
���
�@���� ����	�����>

	�@>���

�"�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

�#�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

�$�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

�%�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

�&�
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

���
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

���
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

���
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

� �
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!
!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!!

5>
� �� ��� @��
��>�� ��?���

1����� �� �%�� :�
��
?��� ����

��� 2�	�� ����

4>���� �>� >� �
�@����� �� ,��>�	�� 1����>���� ���
-�
������� �� 1�������� ;�� -	���?	� 8���	�����
)

	�@>��� �>�� ?��� 
����������� ��	��>�� �����
>�����

�#�� .�?��>��� ���&
8������>� �� +�

>����� 0����>?>�

<!����;/���&7;+�#�%&�

,>�� �� �����>���� �� ��
������� �� ��������

-	���?�	��� ��� ����	����� >

	�@>��� �����
��@���� �"������ �� ��� +��� �� >�>�	>?	� >�'

+��
��>�� �������� ��
?�� � 	�
���� 	�>?�	���
��������@>���� ��
?�� �� @��
��>�� ��?���
)������ �� ��� ���������� ����@� >�� 
���@�
>	
����@� ��� >��� �� ��� +��
��>�� ,�?���
1���	���@� @�

��@�
��� �>�� ��
���
�@� �� +��
��>�� ,�?���

1����� �� � �� :�
��
?��� ����,>�� �� ����� �� 
��������>	 	��� ��

���
�@���� ����	����� >

	�@>���

5��
� �� ���	���?�	��� >

	�@>?	� �����
��@���� �&) >�� >�>�	>?	� >�'

3>�� �>�� ��� ��?
������ �� �?��@����� ��

��������>	 	���

�%�� :�
��
?��� ����

,>�� �� 1�@��
��>���� �� +��
��>�� ,�?���

3>�� �>�� ��� ��?
������ �� ����	����� 
	>��

4>���� �� ��?
������ ����	����� 
	>�� ��
����	����� 
���������>	

5>
� >�� �������>���� ��
?�� �� ���
����	����� 
���������>	
5>
�� )������ >�� ���
>�	 �� ���
����	����� 
���������>	� >� ����������
���� ��� *�>��

)������ >�� �
>�	 �� ?� ���� ���
@�����
�����@� ���� ��� ����	�����

���������>	

,>�� �� 
�?	�@>���� �� .��
 /

.������ ,��>�	� >�� >�>�	>?	� >� �� ����

,>�� �� ����� �� ���>	 	��� �� 
���
�@����
����	����� >

	�@>���

1����� �� �%�� :�
��
?��� ���� �� -	���?	�
8���	����� )

	�@>����

)�������� ����� ���@� +��
��>�� ,�?���
�� ��@��
��>��� � ����������

*
�� ����� ���������
 0����20
�� ����� 
0	��0�
���
������ �
 ��
0� ���� �� ������2���� ���������

0����20
�� �����0
� �� $��	 % �0��� ����������
20
 ��1	�� ���������
 ��0
 �
 	0

�� �0�� ���
 �

���,�
���� ���,��������
+�0
 �,$,+��

%����& �%��)�! ��)� 8�>� 5�� ��� 2�?�	�� 0�		��
0����>?>� 9 "���  
��� 2>��>��� ����

5��
� �� ���	���?�	��� ���� >� �������� �� ��
,��>�	�� 1����>���� ��� -�
������� �� ���������

!�������
��
2�  ������� :>
� >� )?���
!�������
��
2� #�	0���
�
������
	(�?@
���������>	��	�������@�


)0	�� =� =���>�>@�>	>

,�� )��� 1**1�17)�����17�5���#$����$��%���$%�

$�� '-' /0��� &
��0����2����� +���0�� (�	����
-���

.� .�
�0�02�0�0	
8�� 5��' 1**1�17)�����17�5���#$����$��%���$%�

"0�� � ��� 2�	�� ����
+�02� � 0����>?>�

��!� �
��������#��� �� ��%�#�#��� ��! �' !�""��� �� ��#�!�"#


�� )� ��(� 	��� ���� � �(��� ���
���
���

'-' /0��� &
��0����2����� +���0�� (�	����

)0	�� =� =���>�>@�>	>

,���������  ������� 5�� ���� ���"� :����� 5�� ��
;>��>�>� :�@�����>?>�9 "����$ ,��������� #�	0���
�>>�>�>����@�>	>
(�
>�	�@�


-���
>��� �>�� ��� ��?
������ �� ����	�����

	>� �� ��� )�����@>���� )�������� ��� >

���>	

4>���� �� �?�>����� ������� ��� ����	�����

	>�� ��>	�>���� 
>����� �����
>����

�
��>���
 >�� ������� �����
>����

,��>�	�� �����>���� ��� ��
������� ��
�������� �>� 
>�� >�>�	>?	� >� ��		�����
��?	���' ���
'����������@��������
	�

�"�� :�
��
?��� ����
���?��@� �� 
��
����?	� �����������

�#�� )������ ���� �)� �������� ���
 �>�	��� �>�� ��
��� 2�	�� ����� ���?��@� �� 
��
����?	� �����������

� 	��� �����"��
	 ��� ��� 
� ��� �	

���	#� "	� �"	�����#� �
"�� 
� �	��"
��	

���	#� ��

����
	 ��
#�

 �
� �
��
�"�� ���

	
� �����"��
	
� ����

4�����@>���� �� ��� 2�	�� ���� �7�?	����� �����>		�
�� ����4>�� ����)
����� ��?�������	� �� �%��
4>�� ����� %�� 2���� ����� $��)������ ����� � ��
)������ ����� � �� 6@��?��� ����� #�� ,�@�
?���
����� ���� ,�@�
?��� ����� �%�� 2>��>��� �����
!�� .�?��>��� ����� ��� 4>�@�� ����� ��� )
��	�
����� ���4>�� ����� ��� 2���� �����

3>�� �>�� ��� ��@��
� �� ��
������� ��
��������

;�� 	>�� �>�� �>� �� $�� :�
��
?��� �����
5� ������� ���������� 
��������

��! #�� �##��#��� �� #�� �������� !�"��$#��� �  �����#"
��! �"� &�#�! ���!�"#!$�#$!�"  !�%�#� ����#��

-	���?	� 8���	����� )

	�@>��� ���� ���������� ��
>@@���>�@� ���� ,��>�	�� 1����>���� ���
-�
������� �� 1������� �>��� � ��)������ �����



7/2/22, 11:55 AM View Article

172.16.0.114/epaperapp/FlashClient/Show_Story_IPad.aspx?storySrc=aHR0cDovLzE3Mi4xNi4wLjExNC9FcGFwZXJEYXRhL1Nha2FsL011bWJhaS8yMDIyLzA3LzAyL01haW4vU2FrYWxfTXVtYmFpXzIwMjJfMDdfMDJfTWFpbl9EQV8wMDlfUFIuanBnJnBnPTk=&uname=&ipad=N 1/1

Back


