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2015
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With reference to the captioned subject, please find enclosed herewith copies of the newspaper
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and Vir Arjun (Hindi Regional Language).
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11:30:00 +05'30'
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& Compliance Officer

Encl. as above
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E-mail : smil@shardamotor.com, Website : www.shardamotor.com
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FINANCIAL EXPRESS

TUESDAY, AUGUST 27, 2024

DEMAMND NOTICE

Uinder Secian 1) al the Secorfisation dnd Resorabuchon of Finandal fssals And Enldrcamen al
Security InbaraslAct, 2002 {the ssd AcL) read with Rule 3{ 1) of tha Security interest (Enforcementy Rulas,
202 [fhe seid Rules). In exardise of powers canfared under Section 13012} of the seid Aot read wilh Rulz
3 pi the =3kl Ruies, the Autharged Officer of iIFL Home Finarcs Lid {I8FL HFL) | Formery kncwm a3 Irdia
Irdsling Housing Finance Lid ) has issued Demand Molices under saction 1308 of the said Act, callrg
gy e Barpawerds), 1o repey B amounl menbioned in tha respeclive Demand Nolice)s) issued &
tham:. Inconraction with above, nolice & hereby givan, onoa again, ta the Bormowes(s} to pay within &)
gays from the publication of fhis natice. the amaunts indicated hersin below, togathar with further intarast
from tha dale{s) of Damand Molice Hl the date of payment. Thea datal of fheBarrowes s} amauni due as on
ate of Demand Notice and secunty offered towards repayment ofioan amaunt e as under -

Mame of the Damand Motica Dascription of securd aseet
Evurrnwer[s?. Date & Amount [immuowables properiy)
(Guaramtor (8) |29 0g.2024 |Prospect No, 308552) Al thal piece and parcal of the
Mr Sy Me |Re 12747000 Fipees Two Lakh Taebeiproperty beng HNo-1295 PLOT NO
Nands ir.drs_ Thousand Seven Hundned aod Foty Seven | 283 A and PIot no-254 | ansing ouf of
Vaena, Dnly| {Prospect Mo, 30811 Khasrano80071,13,14 1517, Stoated
1EI"i'*:-cl!i ¢t No. |Rs. 380235.00/{Rupaes Three Lakh Fifty|al Waka Mauje Saran, Tehsil and Dist
BE558, 308315 Thausand Twa Hundrad and Thiry Fve Only) [Fandabad | Hamang o, 121001 Areg
HELTF: | (Prospect Mo. 935728) Ra 84982 04- Admaasizing i Sq. FL) Property
{Rup=es Minety Four Thousand Mine Hundred | Type:  Area_Admeasuring  Property
and Ekghty Efghl Oriy) Area; 177500

¥ e said Borrowers bl 1o ks pavment i (IFL HFL & sforsaid, IIFL HFL may procesd againg] e abon
secuied assels under Saciion 1314] of the saidd Adl, and the sppiicanie Fules, entrafy & the rishs, cosls andg

ncas af the Bormowars. For, furhar defsls please confadt o ficar ot 1 Ciffice: Py
COrEECE fthe B Far, furfhe ; Apthorised O Branch Cffice: F
Mo JNVHIE, Lpner Groure Flooe, Mar Shadi Marg, Najaloah Road, Besice Jaguar Shawecom, Mok Magar
Mew Dielhi for Corporate Office - |IFL Tower, Plaf ko, 58, Udyag Vinar, Prel Gurgacn, Hargana

Flace: Dalhl Dals: 27.08,2034 Sdi- Authorized Offlcer, For IBFL Hame Finance Lid

PEGASUS ASSETS RECONSTRUCTION PRIVATE LIMITED
55-56,5th Floor Free Press House Nariman Point,
Mumbai -400021 Tel: -022-61884700
PEGASUS Email: sys@pegasus-arc.com URL: www.pegasus-arc.com

PUBLIC NOTICE FOR E-AUCTION SALE

Sale of Inmovable secured assets under the Securitization and Reconstruction of
Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 read with proviso to Rule
8 & 9 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002.

Notice is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower and Guarantors
that the below described secured asset charged to the Secured Creditor, being Pegasus Assets
Reconstruction Private Limited ( Herein after referred as “Pegasus”) acting in its capacity as
Trustee of Pegasus Group Twenty 24 Trust I, having being assigned the dues of the below
mentioned borrower along with underlying securities, interest by Catholic Syrian Bank Ltd ( CSB)

vide Assignment Agreement dated 26/03/2014 under the provisions of SARFAESI Act,2002.

The Authorized Officer of Pegasus has taken the physical possession of the below mentioned prop-
erty on 04/04/2024, under the provisions of the SARFAESI Act and SARFAESI Rules. In view of the
aforesaid the below mentioned secured assets will be sold on “As is where is”, “As is what is”,
and “Whatever there is” basis with all known and unknown liabilities on 26/07/2024, for
recovery of Rs. 16,85,064.50 (Rupees Sixteen Lakhs Eighty Five Thousands and Sixty Four
and Paise Fifty Only) as on 01/05/2010 as per the SARFAESI Notice dated 01/05/2010 and Rs.
71,45,246.26/-(Rupees Seventy-One Lakhs Forty Five Thousand Two Hundred Forty Six and
Twenty Six Paise Only) as on 31/05/2024, plus further interest w.e.f. 01/06/2024 at the contractu-
al rate and costs, charges and expenses thereon, due to Pegasus from M/s R. S. Engineering
Works, Mr. Rajesh Kashyap, Mr. Radhey Shyam. The reserve price will be Rs. 19,34,000/-
(Rupees Nineteen Lakhs and Thirty-Four Thousand Only) and the earnest money deposit will
be Rs. 1,93,400/- (Rupees One Lakh Ninety-Three Thousand and Four Hundred Only).

Name of the 1.M/s R S Engineering Works

Borrower/Guarantor: |2.Mr. Rajesh Kashyap

3.Mr. Radhey Shyam . _
Rs. 16,85,064.50 (Rupees Sixteen Lakhs Eighty Five Thousands and
Sixty Four and Paise Fifty Only) as on 01/05/2010 as per the SARFAE-
S| Notice dated 01/05/2010 and Rs. 71,45,246.26/-(Rupees Seventy-
One Lakhs Forty-Five Thousand Two Hundred Forty-Six and Twenty-
Six Paise Only) as on 31/05/2024, plus further interest w.e.f. 01/06/2024
at the contractual rate and costs, charges and expenses thereon

House No- E-1988 (80 Sq. Yards) old Plot No- 124, Jawahar Colony
Faridabad, Registered with Sub registrar Faridabad vide sale deed
No. 9532 dated -22-12-1980 owned by Mr Radhe Shyam

Rs. 19,34,000/-

3o

Outstanding Dues

Description of
Immovable Property:

Reserve Price

Earnest Money Rs. 1,93,400/-
Deposit (10% of

Reserve Price)

Description of NIL

Movable Property:

Claims, if any, which
have been put forward
against the property
and any other dues
known to Secured
creditor and value.
CERSAI ID

Inspection of Property

Not Known

Security Id -400003091805, Asset Id -200003089208

On 13/09/2024 between 11.00 a.m. to 2.00 p.m. Contact Person:
Mr. Ramakant Pandey (Authorized Officer) -9087788888.

18/09/2024 till 4:00 p.m.

Last date for
submission of Bid/Bid:

Time and Venue of  [E-Auction/Bidding through website (https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net)
Bid Opening on 19/09/2024 from 11.00 a.m. to 1:00 p.m.

This publication is also a 15 days’ notice to the afore mentioned borrowers/guarantors under Rule 8 &
9 of The Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002.The Borrowers/guarantors may close the loan
accounts and redeem the secured assets by making payment of outstanding dues of Rs. 71,45,246.26/-
(Rupees Seventy-One Lakhs Forty-Five Thousand Two Hundred Forty-Six and Twenty-Six Paise
Only) as on 31/05/2024, plus further interest w.e.f. 01/06/2024 at the contractual rate and costs,
charges and expenses thereon any time before the effective sale of the secured assets.

For detailed terms & conditions of the sale, please refer to the link provided in Secured Creditor website
i.e http://lwww.pegasus-arc.com/assets-to-auction.html for detailed terms & conditions of
e-auction/sale of respective property and other details before submitting their bids for taking part in the
e-auction. Bidders may also visit the website https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net or contact service provider
M/s. E Procurement Technologies Ltd. Auction Tiger, Bidder Support: 079-68136805/68136837,
Mr. Ramprasad- Mo.: +91 9978591888 & 8000023297, Email: ramprasad@auctiontiger.net &
support@auctiontiger.net

AUTHORISED OFFICER
Pegasus Assets Reconstruction Private Limited
(Trustee of Pegasus Group 24 Trust 1)

Place: New Delhi
Date: 26/08/2024

P,

PEGASUS
PUBLIC NOTICE FOR E-AUCTION SALE

Sale of Inmovable secured assets under the Securitization and Reconstruction of
Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 read with proviso to Rule
8 & 9 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002.

Notice is hereby given to the public in general and in particular to the Borrower and Guarantors
that the below described secured asset charged to the Secured Creditor, being Pegasus Assets
Reconstruction Private Limited ( Herein after referred as “Pegasus”) acting in its capacity as
Trustee of Pegasus Group Twenty 24 Trust |, having being assigned the dues of the below men-
tioned borrower along with underlying securities, interest by Catholic Syrian Bank Ltd ( CSB) vide

Assignment Agreement dated 26/03/2014 under the provisions of SARFAESI Act,2002.

The Authorized Officer of Pegasus has taken the physical possession of the below mentioned property
on 05/04/2024, under the provisions of the SARFAESI Act and SARFAESI Rules. In view of the afore-
said the below mentioned secured assets will be sold on “As is where is”, “As is what is”, and
“Whatever there is” basis with all known and unknown liabilities on 26/07/2024, for recovery of Rs.
8,32,055.25 (Rupees Eight Lakhs Thirty Two Thousands and Fifty Five and Paise Twenty Five
Only) as on 26/03/2014 as per the SARFAESI notice dated 23/02/2015 and Rs.22,59,485.98/-
(Rupees Twenty-Two Lakhs Fifty-Nine Thousand Four Hundred Eighty-Five and Ninety-Eight
Sharma.ly) as on 31/05/2024, plus further interest w.e.f. 01/06/2024 at the contractual rate and costs,
charges and expenses thereon, due to Pegasus from Mrs Kusum Devi and Mr. Dharamvir Sharma . The
reserve price will be Rs.14,65,000/- (Rupees Fourteen Lakhs Sixty-Five Thousand Only) and the
earnest money deposit will be Rs.1,46,500/- (One Lakh Forty Six Thousand Five Hundred Only).

PEGASUS ASSETS RECONSTRUCTION PRIVATE LIMITED

55-56,5th Floor Free Press House Nariman Point,

Mumbai -400021 Tel: -022:61884700
Email: sys@pegasus-arc.com URL: www.pegasus-arc.com

Name of the 1.Mrs. Kusum Devi
Borrower/Guarantor: |2.Mr. Dharamvir Sharma

Outstanding Dues Rs. 8,32,055.25 (Rupees Eight Lakhs Thirty-Two Thousands and
Fifty Five and Paise Twenty Five Only) as on 26/03/2014 as per the
SARFAESI notice dated 23/02/2015 and Rs.22,59,485.98/-(Rupees
Twenty-Two Lakhs Fifty-Nine Thousand Four Hundred Eighty-Five
and Ninety-Eight Paise Only) as on 31/05/2024, plus interest w.e.f.
01/06/2024 at the contractual rate and costs, charges and expenses
thereon till realization

Form No. INC 26
[Pursuant to Rule 30 of the Companies {Incorporation) Rutes, 2014]
Advertisement to be published in the newspagper for changs of
registered office of the Company from one state fo enother
BEFORE THE CENTRAL GOVERNMENT
REGIONAL DIRECTOR NORTHERN REGION, NEW DELHI
In the malier of sub-section i) of Seckan 13 of Companies Add, 2012 and
clause {a) of Sub-Rule {5) of Rule 30 of The Companies | Incorporation) Kules, 2014
AMD
In the matter of Karan Motors Private Limited
having its registered office a1 Flat No. 118, First Floor,
Kirti Shikhar Building, Plot No. 11, Distnct Centre, Janakpun, New Dalhi 110058
....... PETITIOMER
| Motice is heraby given to the General Public that the Company proposes to make
appication to the Cenfral Governmant under saction 13 of the Companies Act, 2013
|- seeking confirmation of alteration of the Memorandum of Assodation of the Company i
terms of the Special Resolution passed at the Exira Ordinary General Mesting held on
| 20thAogust, 2024 to enabla the Company o change its Registanad Office from “National
Capital Territory of Delhi” to "State of Rajasthan™
| Any person whose intarest is likely to be- affacted by the proposed change ofthe registared
| mifice of the Company may deliver esther on the MUA-21 portal {www.mca.gov.in) by filing
| Investor compliant form or cause 1o be deliverad or send by registerad post of hisfher
| objections supported by an affidavit stating the nature of hisfher interest and grounds of
{ oppasition to fhe Regional Director at the address Regional Director {Morthem Region) B-
| 2 Wing, 2nd Floor Paryavaran Bhawan, CGO Complex, New Delhi - 110003 within
| fourteen days of the date of publication of this notice with a cogy to the applicant company
| atitz Registerad Office atthe address mentioned balow:
| REGISTERED OFFICE: Flat Mo, 118, First Floor, Kirfi Shikhar Building, Plot No. 11,
Digdrict Cenire, Janakpun, Mew Delhi 1100528
Forand on behalf of the Applicant
KARAN MOTORS PRIVATE LIMITED
Sdi-
HARISH CHADHA
Diractor

| Date: 26082024 DIN: B0430073 .

 Place: New Dol

SHARDA MOTOR INDUSTRIES LIMITED

(CIM: LT4899DL1986PLCO23202)

Registered Offica: 0-188, Okhla Industrial Area, Phase |, Mew Delhi-110020

Tal.o +81 11 8733 4900 Fax: #3111 2681 1676, Emall: investcerelations s hardamatar com

website: www ahardamotlor.com
NOTICE

This is to inform that the 395 Annual General Meeting ('/AGM "Maefing') of the Members of
Sharda Mosor Industries Limited {'the Company’) will be held on Thursday, September 2610
2024 al 12:00 Noon (IST) through Video Conference (VC'), Other Audic-\isual Means
FOAVM, in compliance with all the applicable provisions of the Companies Act, 2013 (Act)
and the Rules made thereunder and the SEBI (Listing Obligations and Disclosure
Regurements) Regulafions, 2015 (Listing Ragulations’) read with Genaral Circular No.
2000 cdated May 5, 20020 and subsequend crculars (ssued in tis regard, the lalest being
Circular Mo, 92023 dated September 25, 2023 respectvely (collectively refemad to as MCA
Circulars’) and SEBI Circulars dated May 12, 2020, January 15, 2021 and subseguent
circulars ssued in this regard, the latest being Circular Mo, SEBIHOCFDVCFD-PoD-
ZPICIR20Z3NET dated October, 07, 2023, 'SEBI Circutars”), fo fransact the business as
setoutin the 391 AGM Mofice.

In compliance with the said MGA Circulars-and. SEBE Girculars, electronic copies of ihe
Motice of the 381 AGM and Annual Repor for the financial Year 2023 - 24, will be sent within
prascribed imeaines, 1o those Members whose e-mall addresses are regstared with the
Company | Registrars & Transfer Agent (RegistrarRTA') [ Depository Participants {DPs’)
A per e SEBI Circular, no phwiical copées of the Notica of the AGM-and Annusal Riepor will
be sent o any Shareholder. The said AGM Modice and Annual Report shall also be available
on the website of the Company a1 www.shardamotor.com and ai50 on the websites of the
Stock Exchanges, BSE Limited -and Mational Stock Exchange of India Limited at
wanw beeinda com and www nsrindia com respectively, the said document shall alse be
avadable on the website of Central Depository Seérvices (India) Limited (CDSL) at

Members can pariicipate and sttend in the AGM ONLY through VGIOVAM facility, the details
af which will be provided by the Company in the Motice of the AGM. Members altending the
Meeting thraugh VCIOVAM shall be counded for the purpose of reckoning the quansm under
section 103 of the Companies Act.2013.

The Company is providing ramote a-voling faclity {ramode e-voting’) to all its Mambars to
cast their votes on all the resclufions sef out in fhe Motice of the AGM, The Company is also
providing the acility of vobing thwough e-voling system dunng e AGM (Te-voling). Detailed
Procedure for remote e-volingle-voling and partcipation in AGM through VCIOAWM has
bean provided in the Notice of AGM, which shall be sent to you sharly, The login credentals
for casting wotes through remole e-vading'e-voling shall be made available to the Mambers
throagh emal. Members who do not recaive email or whosa email addnassas ane not
reqisiered with the CompamyDepository Paricipants) may generaie login credentialz by
following instructions given in the Notes fo Nobice of the AGM. The same login credentials
may also be used for attending the AGM through VCIOAYRA

Manner of registering updating email addresses;

(&) Members holding shases in physical mode, who kave nol registerediupdated ther emall
addrazses with tha Company, are requested to send the scanned copy of the foiowing
documents by emad o the Company at invesiorelationsishardamotorcom |
riaffalankit com or lalitapdTaiankt.com

1] &sigeed request lefermentoning ther nams, folo no: and addness;

iy s=l-attested copy of the PAN Card and

{iily s=if-attested copy of Addrass proof fe.g, Aadhar Card, Driving License, Election ldentity
Card, Passport).

ib) Members holding shares in dematenalized mode, who have not registerediupdaied their
emal addresses with the Depository Parlicipantis), are requested fo regsterupdate their
emad addresses with their Depossory Padicipant(s).

Members arg requested 1o carefully read all the Notes seloul in the Notice of the AGM
inciuding mstructions for attanding the AGM thraugh VCOAVM and the manner of casting
wote through remote e-voling fe-vwoting dunng the AGM. For any assistance in this regand
please contact Company at nwestomelations@ shardamotor.com.

Date: August 26, 2024 Far Sharda Motor Industries Limited
Ptace : Dalkl Sdi-

Hitin Wishnoi

Situated

Place: Delhi
Date: 27-Aug-2024

Notice To Borrower

Borrower/s :- Mr. Sunil Kumar, Mrs. Indra (Prospect No. 908549 &
952527) Pursuant to taking possession of the secured asset "Entire
Upper Ground Floor Without Its Roof/Terrace Rights Out Of Built-Up
Property Bearing No.Rz-299 (Old No.Rz-1-2), In Gall N0.5 (Main), Area
Measuring 58 Sq. Yds. .E.48.5 Sq. Mtr., Part Of Khasra N0.12 & 14,
In Revenue Estate Of Village Sagarpur, Delhi State Delhi,
Colony Known As West Sagarpur, New Delhi-110046 India. by the
Authorised Officer of IIFL Home Finance Limited (IIFL-HFL) under the SAR-
FAESI Act. for the recovery of amount due from borrower/s, authorized officer.
Notice is hereby given to above said borrowers to collect the household arti-
cles, which were lying in the secured asset at the time of taking physical pos-
session within 7 days, otherwise I[IFL-HFL shall not be responsible for any
loss of property under the circumstances. Further the notice is hereby given
to the Borrower/s, that in case they fail to collect the above said articles same
shall be sold in accordance with Law. For further details, Contact [IFL HFL
toll free n0.1800 2672 499 from 09:30 hrs to 18:00 hrs between Monday to
Friday or write to email:- auction.hi@iif.com. Corporate Office : Plot No. 98,
Phase-IV, Udyog Vihar, Gurgaon, Haryana-122015.

Sd/- Authorised Officer
IIFL Home Finance Limited (lIFL-HFL)
(Formerly known as Indialnfoline Housing Finance Ltd.)

v

ADITYA BIRLA
ww CAPITAL

the said notice.

TRIBUNAL- Il, DELHI
4TH FLOOR, |JEEVAN TARA
BUILDING, PARLIAMENT STREET,
NEW DELHI-110001

Matice under section 134} of the
Recovery of Debts Due to Bank
and Financial Institutions Act,
1993 recd with rule 12 & 13 of the
Debts Recovery Tribunal
(Procedure) Rule, 1993 in the
matter of

08 ND. 63872022
DATE ; 01.08.2024

ICIC] BANE LTD. Apphcant

VERSUS

MRS, SEEMA SHAILY & ORS.
.Respondent

To,

DEFEMDARMT

{1} SEEMA SHAILY,
D S/0- SHL DEVASHISH SHAILY
HNO.C 19 B, VISHWAKARMA
COLOMY. MB ROAD
PRAHLADPUR, MEW DELHI - 44
ALSO AT- 3/187, VIKAS NAGAR,
LUCENOW- 226072

ALSO AT- FLAT MO, T2-003, PLOT
MO, 301, GROUND FLOOR, EMINET
HEIGHTS TOWER, PROPERTY
BILBIR AVEMUE, DHARABPLIR,
DEHRADUM- 248001

12] MR, DEVASHISH SHAILY
H.HO, C 19 B, VISHWAKARMA
COLONY, MB ROAD
PRAHLADPUR, NEW DELHI-
110044

ALSO AT- 37187, VIKAS NAGAR,
LUCKEMOW- 226072

ALSO AT- BSES RAJDHAMI
POWER LTD., KH AMNAR
DIVISION OFFICE SOUTHEND
APPTTS. PRAHLADPUR, HEW
DELHI- 110044

ALSO AT- FLAT MO, T3-003,
PLOT MG, 201, GROUND
FLOOR, EMINET HEIGHTS
TOWER, PROPERTY BILBIR
ANVEMNUE DHARAMPLUR
DEHRADUMN- 248001

{3} MS. PUSHPAMN ALl REALMS
AND INFRATECH PWT. LT,
THROUGH ITS AUHTORIZED
CIGNATORY HAVING ITS REGD
OFFICE AT MATH HMOUSE,
DEVPURA, HARIDWAR- 249401
ALSO AT, 2/3, TEGHBAHADUR
ROAD DALAMWALS,
DEHRADUN - 248001

ALSO AT- 11 BALBIR ROAD,
CEHRADLIM

Whereas the above nomed
applicant {s) has / hawve instituted o
case for recovery of Hs.
41,15,214.60/- (RUPES FORTY
OMNE LAKH FIFTEEN THOUSAND
WD HUMDRED FOURTEEMN AMD
SEETY PAISE ONLY) against you and
where as it has been shown o the
satisfoction of the Tribumal that it is
not possible o serve you in the
ordinary wuoy therefore, this notice is
given by advertisement directing you
to make oppeorance in the Trkunal
on DB 102024 at 10,30 4.8,

Toke notice thot in defoult of your
oppearance an the day before the
mentioned, the case will be heord
ond determined in yourobsence.

Al the motters will be token up
through widea Conferencing or
physical and for that purpose:-

(i} &dl the Advocotes/Litigants shall
downioad the "Cisco Webex"
opplication/software;

(il "Meeting 10" and Password for
the date of hearing qua cases to be
taken by Hon'ble Presiding Officer!
He?ifatmr shall be displayed in the
daily cause list itsalf ot DRT Official
Paortal i.e. drigov.in

(i) In any exigency gud thot the
Advocate! Litigonts can contoct
the concerned official ot Ph. No.
23748478,

Givan under my hond and seal of
the Tribunal this the Olst day of
August, 2024

BY ORDER OF THE TRIBUMAL,
SECTION QOFFICER

Executive Ddrecior & Company Secrefary

inancg Limitae

LK SIGTITE, EATO514, Website : wamgnbhousing.com
BRANCH ADDRESS: SHOP NO. 301 & 302 LAXMI CHAMBERS 69, RAJPUR ROAD, DEHRADUN - 248001

POSSESSION NOTICE (FOR IMMOVABLE PROPERTY)

Financial Assets & in comphbance of Rule B(1) of Enforcement of Security

account cal
af recaipt ofthe said nolices

tha said Rulas on the dates mentiched againsleach sccounl.

Whareas the undarsigned baing the Authorised Officer of the PME Hm.i'sl'ruf Finance Ltd. undsr tha Securitisation and Reconstruction of
nierest Act, 2002, and in exercise of powers conferrad undar

section 1!-|I12}r-a:d with Rule 3.of the Security Interest (Enforcament) Rules 2002, issued demand notioed's on the date mantioned against each
ngupan the respeciive borrowars 1o repay the amaunt as mentioned against each account within 60 days from the date of nofice[s) date

The borrower's having faled fo repay the amount, notice is heredry given fo the borrower's and the public In general that the undersigned hias taken
nossession of the propertyies described herain below in exarcise powars confarnad an himber under Saction 1304} of the said Act resd wilh Rule § of

The barmower's in particuiar and e public In general is hersby eautionas not o deal with she properiyies and ary dealing with the popertyfas wik be
subjact to the charge of FME Houwsing Finence Lid,, for the emaunt and interast thereon as per loan agreemeand, The borrowers' attention is invited to
provisions of Sub-section |8) of Section13 of the Act, in respact of time availabla, to redeam the securad assats.

Description of
Immovable Property:

House No. E-796 Dabua Colony Faridabad, comprising in portion of plot
nos.149, 150 & 151 forming part of Khasra No- 30/16/1, situated in
Mouza Saran, Tehsil & District Faridabad, admeasuring 75 Sq. Yards
registered with Sub Registrar Faridabad Vide Sale Deed no-14022
dated 01-03-2005 owned by Mrs. Kusum Devi.

Reserve Price Rs,14,65,000/-
Earnest Money Rs.1,46,500/-
Deposit (10% of

Reserve Price)

Description of NIL

Movable Property:

Claims, if any, which
have been put forward
against the property
and any other dues
known to Secured
creditor and value.

Not Known

CERSAIID Security Id - 400002516473, Asset Id -200002514786

Inspection of Property (On 13/09/2024 between 11.00 a.m. to 2.00 p.m. Contact Person:

Mr. Ramakant Pandey (Authorized Officer) @9087788888.

Last date for
submission of Bid/Bid:

18/09/2024 till 4:00 p.m.

Time and Venue of E-Auction/Bidding through website (https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net)|
Bid Opening on 19/09/2024 From 11.00 am to 1:00 pm.

This publication is also a 15 days’ notice to the afore mentioned borrowers/guarantors under Rule 8 &
9 of The Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002.The Borrowers/guarantors may close the loan
accounts and redeem the secured assets by making payment of outstanding dues of Rs.22,59,485.98/-
(Rupees Twenty-Two Lakhs Fifty-Nine Thousand Four Hundred Eighty-Five and Ninety-Eight
Paise Only) as on 31/05/2024, plus further interest w.e.f. 01/06/2024, at the contractual rate and costs,
charges and expenses thereon any time before the effective sale of the secured assets.

For detailed terms & conditions of the sale, please refer to the link provided in Secured Creditor
website i.e http:/lwww.pegasus-arc.com/assets-to-auction.html for detailed terms & conditions of
e-auction/sale of respective property and other details before submitting their bids for taking part in the
e-auction. Bidders may also visit the website https://sarfaesi.auctiontiger.net or contact service
provider M/s. E Procurement Technologies Ltd. Auction Tiger, Bidder Support:
079-68136805/68136837, Mr. Ramprasad- Mo.: +91 9978591888 & 8000023297, Email: ram-
prasad@auctiontiger.net & support@auctiontiger.net

AUTHORISED OFFICER
Pegasus Assets Reconstruction Private Limited
(Trustee of Pegasus Group 24 Trust 1)

Place: New Delhi
Date: 26/08/2024

"IMPORTANT"

Whilst care is taken prior to acceptance of advertising
copy, it is not possible to verify its contents. The Indian
Express (P) Limited cannot be held responsible for such
contents, nor for any loss or damage incurred as a
result of transactions with companies, associations or
individuals advertising in its newspapers or Publications.
We therefore recommend that readers make
necessary inquiries before sending any monies or
entering into any agreements with advertisers or
otherwise acting on an advertisement in any manner
whatsoever.

g Laan Kame of the Demand Ameouank Date of Descrption Of Tha
Mi| Actound BamsusniCo Matice Caitstandéng Passession Properly Mortgaged
M. BorrowartGuzrankar Dl Taken

1. | HMKDEH | Mr. O Pal 28-11-2023 | Rs, 18,64, 218 85 Rupees | 21,08, 2024 | Paet of Khasra No_ - 516 Min, Siluatad al Gram - Bhangari,
a3 E.ﬁrrnwarjl i Eightean Lakhs Sty | (Physical) | Measuring Area 1000 Sg FI Mahawatpur Mustkham,
3B6ET2 | Mrs. Ramesha Faur Thousand Thres Pargana & Tehsil Roorkee, Uttarakhand - 247667, Boundead
B.O.; |Devi Hundred Eighiesn and as . North: 15 Ft Wide Road, Skje Measuring 20 Ft, South:
Dehradun | (Co-Borrower) Eighty Five Paiza Oniy) Land lkyas, Side Measuring 20 F, East: Plot of Unkrown, Sida
Due as on 14112023 Maasuring 0 FL, West: Plot of Unlncan, Side Measuring 50 Fi

PLACE:- DEHRADUN, DATE:- 26.08.2024

AUTHORIZED OFFICER, PNB HOUSING FINANCE LTD.

SMFG
Grihashakti

Map dabe Aapm Minbee

SMFG India Home Finance Company Ltd.
(Formerly Fullerton India Home Finance Co. Ltd.)
Corporate Off.: 503 & 504, 5" Floor, G-Block, Insipre BKC, BKC Main Road, Bandra Kurla Complex, Bandra (E), Mumbai - 400051.
Regd. Off. : Megh Towers, 3“Floor, Old No. 307, New No. 165, Poonamallee High Road Maduravoyal, Chennai - 600 095.

POSSESSION NOTICE FOR IMMOVABLE PROPERTY [(Appendix IV) Rule 8(1)]

WHEREAS the undersigned being the Authorized Officer of SMFG India Home Finance Company Ltd.
(Formerly Fullerton India Home Finance Co. Ltd.) aHousing Finance Company [duly registered with National
Housing Bank (Fully Owned by RBI)] (hereinafter referred to as “SMHFC”) under Secuitisation and Reconstruction of
Financial Assests and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (54 of 2002), and in exercise of the powers conferred
under Section 13(12) read with Rule 3 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002 issued Demand Notice
dated mentioned below under Section 13(2) of the said Act calling upon you being the borrowers (names mentioned
below) to repay the amount mentioned in the said notice and interest thereon within 60 days from the date of receipt
of the said notice. The borrowers mentioned herein below having failed to repay the amount, notice is hereby given
to the borrowers mentioned herein below and to the public in general that the undersigned has Taken Possession
of the property described herein below in exercise of powers conferred on me under sub-section (4) of Section 13 of
the Act read with Rule 8 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002. The borrowers mentioned here in above
in particular and the public in general are hereby cautioned not to deal with said property and any dealings with the
property will be subject to the charge of “SMHFC” for an amount as mentioned herein under and interest thereon.

Place : Pundri/ Yamuna Nagar/ Karnal, Haryana
Date : 23.08.2024 / 24.08.2024

SI. Name of the Borrower(s) Description of Secured Assets Demand Notice Date of
No. [ Guarantor(s) LAN (Immovable Property) Date & Amount Possession
. Proeprty i.e. Plot Bearing No. 135-P, 11.05.2024
h??(dlc?;:4?<25u1s1h?|24972 Measuring 9361 Sqyds., ie. Situated|  Rs.34,64,342/- (Rupees |, 1a 0oy
1 S/o Mg hrai At Huda Mandi Township Urban Estate| Thirty Four Lakh(s) Sixty Four R
@) Ra'.Patig J Pundri Vide Regd Transfer Deed Bearing| Thousand Three Hundred Forty
J No 4384/1 Date 08.03.2019. Two Only) as on 09.05.2024
LAN :- 611539211040838 House No. 1366 (Old H. No. 1523) 11.05.2024
(1) Balwinder Singh Bearing Municipal Parmanent Property Rs. 16.22 97:';/_ (.Ru ces Sixteen
S/o. Davinder Singh Id No. 97C118U17 Measuring 84| - 2 P 24.08.2024
2 . . . . .| Lakh(s) Twenty Two Thousand
(2) Pardeep Singh, S/o. Davinder Singh|Sq.yds., Situated At Bhagatpura Pattri .
- . . . .| Nine Hundred Seventy Three
(3) Kulvinder Kaur, W/o. Davinder Singh|Mohala (Old Mohala of City) Jagadhri
; e Only) as on 09.05.2024.
Tehsil Jagadhri Distt. Yamuna Nagar |
Land Situated in Village Koir District 11.05.2024
LAN :- 611239211169440 Karnal Khewat No. 24 Khatauni No. | Rs. 12.42 0721/-.(Ru ces Twelve
(1) Subhash Chand, S/o. Jai Singh  |Am The Owner and Occupier of 14/2103} "7/ " P 23.08.2024
3 . ; . Lakh(s) Forty Two Thousand
(2) Saroj Rani Portion of Bakdar 0 Kanal 14 Marla (420 Seventy Four Only) as on
W/o. Subhash Chand Sq. Yards) Land Measuring 105 Acres, gg 05.202 Z
19 Acres, 105 Kanals, 3 Marlas. e )
Sd-

Authorized Officer, SMFG INDIA HOME FINANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Formerly Fullerton India Home Finance Co. Ltd.)

financialexp.epaprin

f BEFORE DEBTS RECOVERY \

Aditya Birla Housing Finance Limited

Registered Office- Indian Rayon Compound, Veraval, Gujarat —
362266 Branch Office- Aditya Birla Housing Finance Limited | D-

APPENDIX IV[See Rule 8 (1) of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002]

Possession Notice(for Inmovable Property)

Whereas, the undersigned being the authorized officer of Aditya Birla Housing Finance Limited
under the Securitization and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security
Interest Act, 2002 (54 of 2002) and in exercise of powers conferred under Section 13(12) read with
Rule 3 of the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002 issued a demand notice calling upon the
borrowers to repay the amount mentioned in the notice within 60 days from the date of receipt of

The borrowers having failed to repay the amount, notice is hereby given to the borrowers and the
public in general that the undersigned has taken Possession of the property described herein
below in exercise of the powers conferred on him/her under Section 13(4) of the said act read with
rul8 the Security Interest (Enforcement) Rules, 2002.
The borrowers in particular and public in general is hereby cautioned not to deal with the
property and any dealings with the property will be subject to the charge of the Aditya Birla
Housing Finance Limited for an amount of mentioned below and interest thereon. Borrowers
attention is invited to the provisions of sub-section 8 of Section 13 of the act, in respect of time
available, to redeem the secured assets.

17, Basement, Sector 3, Noida, UP 201301

1. Name of Borrower: Divya Bharti , Manan Engineering Works , Divya Bharti (In the Capacity Of
available Legal Heir Of Late Bablu Kumar )
Outstanding: Rs.10,05,701/- (Rupees Ten lacs Five Thousand Seven Hundred and One Only)

Demand notice Dated: 14-05-2024 Date of Possession: 24-08-2024

Description of the Immovable Property

ITEM 1: All That Piece And Parcel Of Freehold Residential Built-Up Entire First Floor Without Roof
Rights, Built On Property Bearing No. 4, Area Measuring 25.90 Sq. Mtrs., Situated In The Layour
Plan Of Rohini Residential Scheme, In Pocket-11, Sector-22, Rohini, New Delhi-110085

ITEM 2: All That Piece And Parcel Of Freehold Residential Built-Up Entire Floor Without Roof
Rights, Built On Property Bearing No. 5, Area Measuring 25.90 Sq. Mtrs., Situated In The Layour
Plan Of Rohini Residential Scheme, In Pocket-11, Sector-22, Rohini, New Delhi-110085 Both
Bounded As: East: Service Lane, North: Plot No. 3, West: Entry, South: Plot No. 6.

2. Name of Borrower: Abhishek Goel, Deepti Goel, M/S Harshita Steels, Harshita Steels
Outstanding: Rs. 72,74,164.24/- (Rupees Seventy Two Lakh Seventy Four Thousand One Hundred
Sixty Four and Twenty Four Paise Only)

Demand notice Dated: 14-06-2024 Date of Possession: 24-08-2024

Description of the Immovable Property

All That Piece And Parcel Of Entire Second Floor Without Roof/ Terrace Rights, Property Bearing No.
147, Area Measuring 90 Sq. Mtr., In Pocket-9, Sector-22, Situated In Layout Plan Of Rohini Residential
Scheme, Rohini, North West Delhi, Alongwith Common Lift, Entrance, Passage And Staircase & Other
Amenities And Facilities Of The Building With Undivided 1/4th Area Of Stilt Parking, And Bounded As:
East: Plot No. 148, West: Plot No. 146, North: Entry, South: Service Lane .

Date : 24.08.2024
Place : Delhi

Aditya Birla Housing Finance Limited

Authorised Officer

€ rotac

KOTAK MAHINDRA BANK LTD.

Corporate identity Mo. LES

110MHT985PLE03ET13T).

PUBLIC NOTICE FOR

AU

CTION CUM SALE

Repgistered Oifice: - 27 BEG, G 27, G Black, Bandra Kurla Compley, Bandra (E), Mumbal -300 051. Carperale idenlity Ho. LEG110MH1 205PLED38137).
Ragioral OHice, Kotak Mahindra Bank Lid,. EPICAH, 2nd Floor68,68/1, Najaigarh Road, Moti Nagar, New Dedhi- 110015

Matica is hereby given to the pubiic in ganersl end in parfcufar fa the BorrowenCo-Borowen GuarantonMorgager kat the below dascrbed immovabls
propeies mangaged to Kotk Mahinds Bank L, and lhe Physcal Pessession of which has been Bien over by (e Authorsed Offioar of Kotak Mahindra Bank
Ltd, will e godd an “AS 5 WHERE 15" “WHATEVER THERE 15" AND “AS IS WHAT 13" bass. Oflers ane inviled %o taea part in e-zuction Shraugh the Web
Perel of our e-Awcion: Service Partner, Mis.C1 India Pl Lid  fwwreeclindia.com) i hitps Seeaw benkaguchions.com by the undersigned for sele of the
mimsdyvabis propaas of wiich pancuiass an gyen bakow -

Ligte Rakesh Sganwal Thraugh bar molhes
Madhu Agarwal, d. Anyan Agarwal s'o Liste
Rakash Agerwal Through her mother
Madhu Agarwal |{Co-Borrowar &
Martgagary, 3.Mrlalit Agarwa (Co
Borrawar & Morigager), 4. Asha Agarael
[Co- Bidtrowe & Marlgagoer [Loan Accounl
Mo, LAPTAET3521)

Hurdrad Sixty
ane Paisa
Thirtesn Ok

of Predngann - Plysicl

sQmirs shuated al Prakash Indusinal | Theee

Estale, Hadbust vilage, Karkar Modam, | Thausand
Fargana Loni, Tehsil and Disirict}
Ghazmabad, Bourded by: Morth: Deagar |
Proparty, East: Road, South:; Ofhers |
Propary, Wesk Prapardy No.164." Type |

Hame af the Bormower|s] Demand Notice Diescription of the Reserva | Earnesi | Date of Diatei time
! Guarantar{s) Data ard Amound Immovabls property Price Money | Inspection | of Auction
I, M5 Jayshree Industies Theough its | 1227023 ALL THE PARTS AND PARCEL OF THE [ Rs Deposi | of 0411072024
Parinar br. Lak fganval (Borrawar| As. PROPERTIES BEARINGADDRESS . | 541,73,000/- | (EMD)  limmovabile fr-uml

2. Late. Mr. Rakesh Agarwal Through hes | 76,90,760.13- | °All That Parl and FParcal of tha f{Rupaes Five | qge; of |propery | e e
el hairs: &, Madb Agarwal wio Late | {Rupess Sevanly | properies consisting of. Free Hald | Crore Forly | g 19082024 | 10 1200 hes
FakeshAgarwal, b, Patak Agansaidio Late | S Lacg Minely  [Indusirial Plat Mo, 165, Parl{OneLekh Amount | 1100 hes -

Rakash Agerwal, o Askrifi Agerwal d'o | Thousand Seven | Admeasuring 47110 sqpds e, 39388 | Savenly 1404 hrs

et { Qnly)

Last Date for Submission of Offers ( EMD;- 8302024 1ill 5.00 pm, (Incremental Amaunt: Rs 100,000)

Important Terms & Conditions of Sale:

j e

i€

|:-1 |

damsmghtzidues;
5]

atichon 15 l=bte 4o b slopoed

Flaoe - Ghazabad  Dabg: 2708 2024

(1] Tha Auction = conductsd as per the furlker Tarms and Conditians of tha Bad dacument and as per the procedure st owt thersin, Biddars may gathrowgh
the webrsde of ole E-Auction Service Provider, Mis G India Pyt L G2 bips:iwww bankeauctions,com_ dociments; the detais of the secured assat
et up for e-Auction and the Bid Form which wil besubmitied 1o the authonzed oficer al the branch ofice/regional office as provided hernein above

A fhe miending punchasersiblddecs are raguired Lo rapsler ther faima in the Wed Parlal menbaned abiows 2 hiipsivwews. bankeaucions.com and
qenarate thair User 10 and Paseword in fres of cost af their own bo participasa inihe e-Auction an the deta and fime afarasaid;
i3 Foreny enquiry, insormatian, suppon, procedire and anling training on e-ALCTan, the prospecive bidders may contzs the Mis C1 india P Il
Department of our e-Auction Senice Parner M. P Dharars Krishna, through Tel, No.: +91 T29197 1124 25,26, Mobdle No.; 5946182222 & E-mal ID:
andhragiclindia.com & supporlEibankeauclions com;
To lha besi of knowladge and information of $he Authonsed officer, hara is no encumbrance m tha propartyies. Howear, e infanding bidders may
rispect the property and B2 documants as mentaned ahowve or any ather dats & fime with price appaintmend ard Siey should make their own independent
riguiries regarding the encumbrande, titke of propartyfies put on g-Aucion and chamzinght/'dues/affecting the groperty pricrio submitting Seir bid, The
s-Auction advedisement does nol constitule any commilment o any represartation of KMBL. The property i beng sold with all e sting and fulure
ancumbeances whalher kioswn or unkrawn B KMBL. The Authorised officeriSacured Credfior shall ral ba respanzible o any way hor any thind party

For paricipating in the e-duction, inferding purchasersbidders will have o submitipload in the Web Portal (hisps: fwwe bankeaichons.com) the
detais of payrent of Inberest-free refundabie Eamest Money Deposit [EMD) of the secured assal as mentionsd above by way of Demand Draft in Bvcur
al ‘Kolak Mahindra Bank Limiled’ payatile al Dell atang with sell-attesied copias of the PAN Card, Aadhaar Card, Besidence Addrass Prool, Board
Resaluticns in casa of company and Address Proaf as spacified abows sfongwith thea requisaa bidlender form: in thés regard
il Tha Saccessha Bidder isrequired fodeposit the TDES 1% of tha total ducion amound inthe name of he mangagar ifhe Reserve auction amauntis af Bs
30.,00.000.00 | Rupesas Fifty Lakha Only} ar mana

Thes Barroer {517 Mortgagens) { Guaraniog share heraby glven STATUTORY 30 DAY S NOTICE UNDER RULE 6{2), B{E] & 9(1) OF THE SARFAESIACT to
descharge th liability i ulland pay the duss as manionid above along with up S dale intanas] ard expanses wilhin Bty daps Irom e dabe of his nots
fafing which lhe Sacured Assel will be sold &5 per the %arms and cordilkins manSianed abova. In case har & any discrepancy betaean tha publicalians of
sae nofce m Emglsh and Vemacular newspeper, then m such case the English newspaper wil superseda the vemacutar newspaper erd it shal b=
considered s the final popl, thus removing she 2mblouiy, Nihe baroweniguaraniora’manigagers pays S amount die boBank, in full before the date of sale,

For detaded bammns and condfoms of the sa%, Kindly visil our ofthca website hilps vk kilak com'en'bank-auctions himl or contact ks Bank alficar M.
Bizihok Motwani i@ SATITET351 & Mr'ikes J. i@ 8700054755 al abowve mantoned Regional offics of Bank
Special Insbructson: e-Suction shall be comduched by our Serice Provides, Mis: C1 Inda P Lid oo bakat of Kolak Makindra Bank Limiad (RMBL), on pre-
spacified dale, while the bidders shall ba quating from their cén home! offices! place of thair Bid a5 per ther choice sbove tha Resarve Price. Inlermed
connecivity and ather paraphemelia reguiremenis shal have to be ensured by bideers themsabees, Please nafe that faiiune of irmiernet connectivity {due o
any reason whatseever | may ba) shall be sofe responsbiity of bidders and nesther KMBL nor C1 Endia Pyl Ind shall be responsifle for these unforeseen
cifcurestances. inandar bo ward-of such conlingant siuabian, bdders ane redquisiad 1o maka all the nacessan arranpamanty alleratives whalevar raguinsd
g0 et they are abla lo circumvent such situatian and 500 ba able o paricpabe in e e-Auction successfuly, Howevar, iLis requestad (o tha Biddar(z) ned ta
it {il She Sast mameant fequotedmprove his! her Bid o avoid any such complas sieatians

Sdi- Bulhorised Cifficar

Kok Mahindra Sank Ld

\ DRT-I, DELHI i

Public Notice For E-Auction Cum Sale (Appendix - IV A) (Rule 8(6))

Sale of Immovable property mortgaged to IIFL Home Finance Limited (Formerly known as India Infoline Housing Finance Ltd.) (IIFL-HFL) Corporate Office
at Plot No.98,Udyog Vihar, Phase-IV,Gurgaon-122015.(Haryana) and Branch Office at:- 30/30E, Upper Ground Floor, Shivaji Marg, New Delhi -
110015. under the Securitisation and Reconstruction of Financial Assets and Enforcement of Security Interest Act, 2002 (hereinafter "Act"). Whereas the
Auhorized Officer ("AQ") of IIFL-HFL had taken the possession of the following progerty/ies pursuant to the notice issued U/S 13(2) of the Act in the follow-
ing loan accounts/prospect nos. with a right to sell the same on "AS IS WHERE |

for realization of IIFL-HFL's dues, The Sale will be done by the undersigned through e-auction platform provided at the website: www.iiflonehome.com

BASIS, AS IS WHAT IS BASIS AND WITHOUT RECOURSE BASIS"

Borrower(s) / | Demand Notice
Co- Borrower Date and Amount

(s)/ Guarantor(s) 19-Oct-2022 & Rs.25,86,810/-

Description of the Inmovable
property/ Secured Asset

Al that part and parcel of the property bearing

Date of Physical

Reserve Price

Possession
03-Jun-2023

Rs.18,27,000/- (Rupees
Eighteen Lakh Twenty

3. Mrs.Santosh | Hundred Eighty Two Only)

(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount
937203 and Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty
939868) Thousand Only)

1. Mr. Dinesh | 24-May-2022 & Rs.16,32,988/-
Singh (Rupees Sixteen Lakh Thirty
2. Mrs. Chandra | Two Thousand Nine Hundred
Wati Eighty Eight Only)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount
935758, 904848, | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty
935094) Thousand Only)

Ad Measuring 241 Sq.Ft., on Property Bearing
No. 2075 (Pvt No.15), Ward No. XII Situated At
Mukimpura, Subzi Mandi, New Delhi, 110007,
Delhi, India. (Area ad Measuring 224 Sq. Ft.)
All that part and parcel of the property Plot No.-
30, area measuring 50 sq. Yds., Kh. No., 6/12,
Parvatiya Colony, Mauja Gounchi, Teh. Gounchi,
Faridabad, 121005, Haryana, India

(Area admeasuring 160 sq. ft.)

T.Mr. Anand | (Rupees Twenty Five Lakh |Prop No- C-4/172, Admeasurimg Land Area 341/ Total Outstanding as |__Seven Thousand Only)
Kumar , 2. Mrs. | Eighty Six Thousand Eight |Sq. Ft., Carpet Area 270 Sq Ft., Built Up Area| On Date 07-Aug-2024 | Earnest Money Deposit
RubiAnand | Hundred Ten Only) 298 Sq. Ft, 3Rd Floor, Pkt C-4, Sector-6, | Rs. 35,10,303/- (Rupees | (EMD) Rs.1,82,700/-
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount  [Rohini, New Delhi, India, 110039 Thirty Five Lakh Ten | (Rupees One Lakh Eighty

IL10032677 & | Rs. 25,000/- (Rupees Twenty | (Saleable Area ad Measuring 307 Sq. Ft.)  [Thousand Three Hundred| Two Thousand Seven
1L10078896) Five Thousand Only) And Three Only) Hundred Only)
1. Mr.Subhash |07-Sep-2022 & Rs.10,56,955/-|All that part and parcel of the property bearing 13-Feb-2023 Rs.5,90,000/-
Chandra (Rupees Ten Lakh Fifty Six | Flat No-310, 3rd Floor, admeasuring 301 Sq. Ft.,| Total Outstanding As | (Rupees Five Lakh Ninety
Kesarwani | Thousand Nine Hundred Fifty |Block-H, Sector-4, Rohini, North West Delhi, On Date 07-Aug-2024 Thousand Only)
2. Mrs.Meera Five Only) Delhi, India, 110085 Rs. 15,51,647/- (Rupees | Earnest Money Deposit
Kesarwani Bid Increase Amount Fifteen Lakh Fifty One EMD
(Prospect No | Rs.20,000/- (Rupees Twenty Thousand Six Hundred [Rs. 59,000/- (Rupees Fifty
IL10023459) Thousand Only) | And Forty Seven Only) | Nine Thousand Only)
1. Mr. Rinku 21-Sep-2022 All that part and parcel of the property bearing 09-Jun-2023 Rs.6,00,000/-
Gupta Rs. 9,51,482/- (Rupees Nine |Entire Ground Floor, Without Roof Rights,Land [ Total Outstanding As (Rupees Six
2. Ishant Sticker | Lakh Fifty One Thousand Four|Area Ad Measuring 248 Sq.Ft., and CarpetArea| On Date 07-Aug-2024 Lakh Only)

Rs. 13,84,737/- (Rupees
Thirteen Lakh Eighty Four
Thousand Seven Hundred

And Thirty Seven Only)

19-Dec-2023

Total Outstanding as on
Date 07-Aug-2024

Earnest Money Deposit

Rs.60,000/- (Rupees Sixty
Thousand Only)
"Rs. 7,77,000/- (Rupees
Seven Lakh Seventy
Seven Thousand Only)

Rs. 22,82,763/- (Rupees
Twenty Two Lakh Eighty
Two Thousand Seven Hun
-dred & Sixty Three Only)

Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
Rs.77,700/- (Rupees
Seventy Seven Thousand
Seven Hundred Only)

11-Sep-2024 1100 hrs -1400 hrs

13-Sep-2024 till 5 pm.

1. Mr. Ishwar | 08-Sep-2022 & Rs.12,14,964/-|All that part and parcel of the property bearing 23-Jun-2023 Rs.11,91,000/- (Rupees
Chand Jana (Rupees Twelve Lakh Flat Bearing Pvt, No.1, 1st Floor, Without Roof Total Outstanding as Eleven Lakh Ninety One
2. Mrs. Anita Fourteen Thousand Nine | Rights, admeasuring 450 Sq. Ft, In BuiltUp| On Date 07-Aug-2024 Thousand Only)
Jana Hundred Sixty Four Only) | Property Bearing MCD No. 769, W.No.6, Out of| Rs, 19,36,743/- (Rupees |Earnest Money Deposit (EMD)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount  |Khasra No. 1151 3 Min, Situated In The Abadi, of| Nineteen Lakh Thirty Six |Rs.1,19,100/- (Rupees One
906591) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Lal Dora, Village Mehrauli Tehsil Hauz Khas,| Thousand Seven Hundred| Lakh Nineteen Thousand
Five Thousand Only) Delhi, India-110030. And Forty Three Only) One Hundred Only)
1. Mr. Dimpi | 07-Mar-2023 & Rs.23,42,594/- | All that part and parcel of the property Flat No 11-Jul-2023 Rs.16,71,000/- (Rupees
2. Mrs. Krishna | (Rupees Twenty Three Lakh |Ff2, Carpet Area 450 Sq. Ft., Super Built-Up[™Total Qutstanding as | Sixteen Lakh Seventy
3. Mr. Manish Forty Two Thousand Five ~|Area 522 Sq. Ft., Plot No 2,3 ,10, Khasara No| Qn Date 07-Aug-2024 | _One Thousand Only)
Kumar Hundred Ninety Four Only) |510 511, Shakti Enclave, Burari, North, North| Rs. 31,51,0651- (Rupees |Earest Money Deposit (END)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount | West Delhi, Delhi,India-110084 (Area admeasur-|  Thirty One Lakh Fifty |Rs.1,67,100/- (Rupees One
784267) Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |ing 432 sq. ft., Built up area admeasuring 540 sq.| One Thousand And Sixty |Lakh Sixty Seven Thousand
l Five Thousand Only) ft. and Saleable area admeasuring 405 sq. ft.) Five Only) One Hundred Only)
1. Miss. Heena | 19-Jun-2023 & Rs.34,71,132/-| Al that part and parcel of the property House No. 12-Feb-2024 s.23,23,000/- (Rupees
Kalra (Rupees Thirty Four Lakh {165 Second Floor, Khasra No. 18, Area| Total Outstanding as on |Twenty Three Lakh Twenty
2. Mr. Ankit Kalra| Seventy One Thousand One |Ad.Measuring: 900 Sq.ft, Carpet area|  Date 07-Aug-2024 Three Thousand Only)
Hundred Thirty Two Only) |Ad.Measuring: 751 Sq.ft, Built up area| Rs.42,22,359/- (Rupees [Eamnest Money Deposit (EMD)
(Prospect No Bid Increase Amount Ad.Measuring: 810 Sq.ft, Gali No.5 Block-T| Forty Two Lakh Twenty |Rs.2,32,300/- (Rupees Two
IL10287640) | Rs.25,000/- (Rupees Twenty |Bindapur Colony, Uttam Nagar, West Delhi, Two Thousand Three Hund| Lakh Thirty Two Thousand
Five Thousand Only) India, 110059 -red & Fifty Nine Two only) | Three Hundred Only)
Date of Inspection of property EMD Last Date Date/ Time of E-Auction

16-Sep-2024 1100 hrs.-1300 hrs.

Mode of Payment :- EMD payments are to be made vide online mode only. To make payments you have to visit https://www.iiflonehome.com and pay through
link available for the property/ Secured Asset only. Note: Payment link for each property/ Secured Asset is different. Ensure you are using link of the property/
Secured Asset you intend to buy vide public auction.”For Balance Payment - Login https://www.iiflonehome.com >My Bid >Pay Balance Amount.

Place:- Delhi, Date: 27-August-2024

TERMS AND CONDITIONS:-

1. For participating in e-auction, Intending bidders required to register their details with the Service Provider https://www. iiflonehome.com well in
advance and has to create the login account, login ID and password. Intending bidders have to submit / send their "Tender FORM" along with the pay-
ment details towards EMD, copy of the KYC and PAN card at the above mentioned Branch Office.

2. The bidders shall improve their offer in multiple of amount mentioned under the column "Bid Increase Amount". In case bid is placed in the last 5 min-
utes of the closing time of the auction, the closing time will automatically get extended for 5 minutes.

3. The successful bidder should deposit 25% of the bid amount (after adjusting EMD) within 24 hours of the acceptance of bid price by the AO and the balance 75%
of the bid amount within 15 days from the date of confirmation of sale by the secured creditor. All deposit and payment shall be in the prescribed mode of payment.

4. The purchaser has to bear the cess, applicable stamp duty, fees, and any other statutory dues or other dues like municipal tax, electricity charges, land
and all other incidental costs, charges including all taxes and rates outgoings relating to the property.

5. The purchaser has to pay TDS application to the transaction/payment of sale amount and submit the TDS certificate with [IFL HFL.

6. Bidders are advised to go through the website https: //www.iiflonehome.com and https://www.iifl.com/home-loans/properties-for-auction for detailed
terms and conditions of auction sale & auction application form before submitting their Bids for taking part in the e-auction sale proceedings.

7. For details, help procedure and online training on e-auction prospective bidders may contact the service provider E mail ID:- care@iiflone-
home.com, Support Helpline Numbers:@1800 2672 499.

8. For any query related to Property details, Inspection of Property and Online bid etc. call IIFL HFL toll free no. 1800 2672 499 from 09:30 hrs

to 18:00 hrs between Monday to Friday or write to email:- care@iiflonehome.com

9. Notice is hereby given to above said borrowers to collect the household articles, which were lying in the secured asset at the time of taking physical

possession within 7 days, otherwise [IFL-HFL shall not be responsible for any loss of property under the circumstances.

. Further the notice is hereby given to the Borrower/s, that in case they fail to collect the above said articles same shall be sold in accordance with Law.

11. In case of default in payment at any stage by the successful bidder / auction purchaser within the above stipulated time, the sale will be cancelled and

the amount already paid will be forfeited (including EMD) and the property will be again put to sale.

. AO reserves the rights to postpone/cancel or vary the terms and condition of tender/auction without assigning any reason thereof. In case of any dis-

pute in tender/Auction, the decision of AO of IIFL-HFL will be final.
15 DAYS SALE NOTICE UNDER THE RULE 9 SUB RULE (1) OF SARFAESI ACT, 2002
The Borrower are hereby notified to pay the sum as mentioned above along with upto dated interest and ancillary expenses before the date of
Tender/Auction, failing which the property will be auctioned/sold and balance dues if any will be recovered with interest and cost.
Sd/- Authorised Officer, IIFL Home Finance Limited.

New Delhi
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Public Notice

I, Kunal Jain S/o Sh. Rakesh Kumar
Jain R/o H. No. 2241-42 Gali Bari
Pahar Wali, Dharam Pura, Delhi-
110006 do hereby declare that I am
applying for renewal of my Passport
bearing no. L1818154 which is my
wife name mentioned as Sarita Jain
but according to her Passport and
Aadhar Card her name is Sarita Mittal
but according to her Pan Card her
name is Sarita Jain. That Sarita Jain
and Sarita Mittal both name belong to
same and one person.

Public Notice

Be it known to all that my clients
Laxman S/o Kaloo and Sumant W/o
Laxman, both R/o H.No. G-5,
Harswaroop Mohalla, Fatehpur Beri,
New Delhi-110074, have severed all their
relations with their son Rahul and his
wife due to their disrespectful,
misbehaving, quarrelsome and
irresponsible behavior and have debarred
and disowned both of them from their
entire  movable and immovable
properties, anybody deals with them in
future of any kind, will do so entirely at
their own costs and risks and my clients
shall not be responsible for their any acts
and deeds. Pooja Chandela, Advocates,
1098, Block-22, Lodhi Colony, New
Delhi-110003.
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PUBLIC NOTICE

Notice is hereby given on behalf of Axis
Bank Ltd, that Mr. Mohd. Asif intends
to purchase & mortgage the Property
No. 4, area measuring 312.50 sg.
yards, situated at Bank Enclave,
Delhi with our client against the
financial assistance. Whereas Mr. Nand
Lal Mitra acquired the said property by
way of Conveyance Deed dt.
04.11.1999 and after his death, his legal
heirs i.e. Mr. Vinod Kumar Mitra, Mr.
Pramod Kumar Mitra & Mrs. Kusum
Khurana got the rights of the said
property by way of Regd. Will dated
17.07.2009. Now, they intend to sell the
same to our borrower.

If any person(s) having objection with
regard to ownership/morigage of the
said property, isfare requested to
intimate in writing to undersigned within
07 days from the date of issue of this
notice at the address below. In the
event, no information is received within
(07 days from date hereof, our client i.e.
Axis Bank Ltd will proceed with the
mortgage process.

RISHI KAPOOR, ADVOCATE
A-13, LGF, South Extn-Il,

New Delhi-49 # 011-40587824

Y
AN

forfes

(CIN: L74899DL1986PLC023202)
Yol Brafer: $—188, gl 3eNfid &, Bui—1, 98 fAecii—110020
B . +91 11 4733 4100, B F. +91 11 2681 1676,

E-Mail: investorrelations@shardamotor.com, Website: www.shardamotor.com
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; BEFORE DEBTS RECOVERY ;

TRIBUNAL- II, DELHI
4TH FLOOR, JEEVAN TARA
BUILDING, PARLIAMENT STREET,
NEW DELHI-110001

Notice under section 19(4) of the
Recovery of Debts Due to Bank
and Financial Institutions Act,
1993 read with rule 12 & 13 of the
Debts Recovery Tribunal
(Procedure) Rule, 1993 in the
matter of

OA NO. 638/2022
DATE : 01.08.2024

ICICI BANK LTD. _.Applicant

VERSUS

MRS. SEEMA SHAILY & ORS.
..Respondent

To,

DEFENDANT

(1) SEEMA SHAILY.
D/W/S/0- SH, DEVASHISH SHAILY
H NO. C 19 B, VISHWAKARMA
COLONY, MB ROAD
PRAHLADPUR, NEW DELHI - 44
ALSO AT- 3/187, VIKAS NAGAR,
LUCKNOW- 226072

ALSO AT- FLAT NO. T3-003, PLOT
NO. 301, GROUND FLOOR, EMINET
HEIGHTS TOWER, PROPERTY
BILBIR AVENUE, DHARAMPUR,
DEHRADUN- 248001

(2) MR. DEVASHISH SHAILY
H.NO. C 19 B, VISHWAKARMA
COLONY, MB ROAD
PRAHLADPUR, NEW DELHI-
110044

ALSO AT- 3/187, VIKAS NAGAR,
LUCKNOW- 226072

ALSO AT- BSES RAJDHANI
POWER LTD., KH ANAR
DIVISION OFFICE SOUTHEND
APPTTS., PRAHLADPUR, NEW
DELHI- 110044

ALSO AT- FLAT NO, T3-003,
PLOT NO. 301, GROUND
FLOOR, EMINET HEIGHTS
TOWER, PROPERTY BILBIR
AVENUE DHARAMPUR
DEHRADUN- 248001

{3) MS, PUSHPANJALI REALMS
AND INFRATECH PVT. LTD,
THROUGH ITS AUHTORIZED
SIGNATORY HAVING ITS REGD
OFFICE AT NATH HOUSE,
DEVPURA, HARIDWAR- 249401
ALSO AT, 2/3, TEGHBAHADUR
ROAD DALANWALA,
DEHRADUN - 248001

ALSO AT- 11 BALBIR ROAD,
DEHRADUN

Whereas the above named
applicant (s) has / have instituted a
case for recovery of Rs.
41,15,214.60/- (RUPES FORTY
ONE LAKH FIFTEEN THOUSAND
TWO HUNDRED FOURTEEN AND
SIXTY PAISE ONLY) against you and
where as it has been shown to the
satisfaction of the Tribunal that it is
not possible to serve you in the
ordinary way therefore, this notice is
given by advertisement directing you
to moke appearance in the Tribunal
on08.10.2024at 1030 AM.
Take notice that in default of your
appearance on the day before the
mentioned, the case will be heard
and determined in your absence.
All the matters will be taken up
through video Conferencing or
physical and for that purpose:-
(i) All the Advocates/Litigants shall
download the "Cisco Webex"
application/software;
(i} "Meeting ID" and Password for
the date of hearing qua cases to be
tuken by Hon'ble Presiding Officer/
i;|||strur shall be displayed in the
aily cause list itself ot DRT Official
Portall e.drt. gov. in
(iii) In any exigency qua that the
Advocate/ Litigants can contact
the concerned official at Ph. No.
23748478,
Given under my hand and seal of
the Tribunal this the Olst day of
August, 2024

BY ORDER OF THE TRIBUNAL,
SECTION OFFICER

! DRT-II, DELHI f
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