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SPML Infra Received Dun & Bradstreet (D&B) Infra awards 2014 
 

New Delhi, November 05, 2014 
 
SPML Infra has won the coveted Dun & Bradstreet (D&B) Infra Awards 2014, for its project Pokhran 
Water Supply which was selected as the best project under the category namely Project Awards for 
Water Supply & Sanitation. The award ceremony was held in Mumbai on 30th October, 2014. Dun & 
Bradstreet, established in 1981 and listed on the New York Stock Exchange, is the world’s leading 
provider of business information, knowledge and insight. These awards felicitate leading infrastructure 
companies that have delivered exemplary performance. D&B uses a proprietary model to select the 
award winners based on various qualitative and quantitative factors. Industry experts and eminent 
professionals from infrastructure and allied sectors formed the independent jury. 7th edition of Dun & 
Bradstreet’s premier publication, “India’s Leading Infrastructure Companies 2014” was also released 
on the occasion by Mr. Shankar Aggarwal, IAS, Secretary, Ministry of Urban Development, 
Government of India. 
 
The award was presented to SPML for “Water Supply & Sanitation” category for executing an 
important water supply project in Rajasthan to provide drinking water to more than 1.2 million people 
of 580 villages (177 in Jaisalmer and 403 in Barmer districts) and 3 towns- Pokhran, Balotra and Siwana 
and also to cater the bulk water demands of Defence forces and Industries in Pokhran, India’s nuclear 
test site. SPML has designed and constructed the infrastructure to meet drinking water demands 
projected up to the year 2023 except for the raw water carrier between project outlet and water 
treatment plant, pump house, civil structure and raw water reservoirs as per the projected demands 
till the year 2038. Raw water is proposed to be drawn from Indira Gandhi Munak Canal (IGMC) 
through project outlet. Besides necessary arrangement for its treatment, storage capacity of raw 
water is also constructed to meet the drinking water demand in the course of 30 days of canal closure 
in continuous stretch every year. 
 
The project consist of 3 Water Treatment Plants of 125.3 MLD combined capacity, 3 Clear Water 
Reservoirs of 10,850 KL capacity, 2 Raw Water Reservoirs of 300 Million Litres, 16 Pumping Stations, 
397 Kilometers Water Pipeline, 2 Master Control Centre, Grid sub-stations, SCADA system and allied 
civil works with Operation & Maintenance for 10 years after the commissioning.  
 
SPML Infra is a leading infrastructure development company with over three decades of experience in 
implementing over 600 projects in water supply and management, wastewater treatment and reuse, 
sewer-line rehabilitation and power (RE) development, transmission and distribution in India. An ISO–
9001: 2008 certified company, SPML is currently executing a number of water, wastewater, and power 
transmission & distribution projects.  
 

Mr. Rishabh Sethi, Executive Director, SPML Infra, commented, “We are very happy to receive this 

award as these recognitions gives a great fillip to our efforts towards nation building through 

sustainable infrastructure development in providing drinking water facilities to a large number of 

population. The award is a testimony of our 33 years in business with a conviction to reform India’s 



urban infrastructure and the commitment to provide sustainable solutions for better human life. The 

broad understanding of the urban infra requirement enables SPML to anticipate new trends and 

develop new infrastructure and technologies faster than others.”  

 
Other companies awarded at the function included L&T, Tata Projects, GVK Power, Godrej Projects, 
Jindal Power, GMR, and NTPC in other categories. 
 

 


